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PREFACE 

The preface will introduce the four components included in the Doctoral Thesis 

Portfolio. The portfolio focuses on four different areas related to the practice of 

counselling psychology. First an exploratory piece of research will be presented 

focusing on orthodox Jewish women and their experience of observing the laws of 

family purity and how this impacts their marital relationships. The Jewish laws of 
family purity govern the sexual relationship between husband and wife, instructing 

that throughout female menstruation, husband and wife have no physical contact. 

Following on from this, a reflective essay is presented that considers the development 

of my clinical and professional identity as a counselling psychologist. A theoretical 

essay will then be introduced, exploring group therapy as a suitable and effective 

treatment approach through the evaluation of two distinct treatment models offered in 

group therapy. Finally a process report will be presented that sheds light on my 

clinical practice with a client presenting with anger management difficulties. 

The reader will notice that there is an emphasis throughout each component on the 

importance of lived experience and the subjective nature of human experience. The 

experiential and the subjective are central to me, both philosophically and in my 

practice of counselling psychology. I place paramount importance on the subjective 

experience of the individual, always placing the client before the model instead of 

adopting a one size fits all approach. Throughout this preface I will illustrate how this 

theme ties into my practice and research. 

A synopsis of each component of the portfolio will now be presented, introducing the 
piece of work and how it ties into the theme of valuing the subjective experience of 

the individual. 
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Section A- Emim''Cal research 

An original piece of research was conducted exploring the experiences of orthodox 
Jewish women adhering to the laws of family purity and how this impacts their 

marital relationships. This qualitative study adopted a semi structured interview 

technique to glean the in-depth lived experience of a sample of six women who 
observe these laws. Interpretative phenomenological analysis (IPA) was the chosen 

methodology. In this a double hermeneutic between the researcher and the participant 

exists: the researcher aims to make sense of how the participant makes sense of his or 
her world, taking an active role in trying to access the personal world of the 

participant. Hence the construction of an interpretative account is a product of the 
interaction between the researcher and participant, as the researchers own 
conceptions, beliefs, expectations and experiences are present and necessary (Smith et 
al., 1999) in order that they can make sense of the participant making sense of their 

world (Smith, 2007). This method of enquiry therefore appreciates the crucial role 
subjectivity and lived experience play in the analysis. 

This study seeks to contribute to the limited multicultural counselling psychology 
literature relating to minority groups in the UK and to the goal of "understanding the 
worldview of the culturally different client" (Sue et al., 1992, p. 481). It highlights 

the importance of understanding the subjective experience in context, consistent with 
counselling psychology's humanistic underpinnings. It also emphasises the potential 
disservice counselling psychologists can do to clients when they do not take into 

account a client's beliefs and values and simply apply treatment approaches across 
distinct cultures. As Kareem notes "A psychotherapeutic process that does not take 
into account the person's whole life experience, or that denies consideration of their 
race, culture, gender or social values, can only fragment the person" (1992 p. 16). 
'Merefore, in IPA the role of the meaning and sense-making process that individuals 

embark upon are considered along with the contextual factors (Smith, 1996). The 
findings are explored in light of previous research and theoretical insights are offered. 
Whilst the findings are not generalisable beyond the sample of women included in 

this study, important transcultural implications are offered for marital therapy for 

couples observing similar cultural marital practices. This study highlights the 
importance of understanding cultural marital practices and incorporating them into 
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marital treatment interventions, as clearly for this group of women, adhering to the 

laws of family purity has a large impact on the individual and their marital 

relationship. 

Section B- Reflective essav 

In this section I reflect on the development of my personal identity as a counselling 

psychologist. Identity for me is a dynamic and ever evolving process and is 

underpinned by the values and philosophy of counselling psychology: 

To know empathically and to respect first person accounts as valid in their own 

terms; to elucidate, interpret and negotiate between perceptions and world views 
but not to assume the automatic superiority of any one way of experiencing, 
feeling, valuing and knowing (BPS, 2005, p. 1 -2). 

Therefore my approach respects the uniqueness of each individual, valuing subjective 

experience as paramount. This allows me as a counselling psychologist to maintain 
Rogers' (1957) core conditions of empathy, acceptance and authenticity, placing 
central focus on the therapeutic relationship. 

In this essay I present my preferred theoretical approach: cognitive behavioural 

therapy (CBT) and how this fits with my client work. I also explicate the limitations I 

have come across using CBT and how I go about integrating other approaches, such 

as the psychodynamic approach into my treatment plans. I elaborate on the 
importance of placing the subjective experience of the client before the model and 
how I adopt alternative treatment approaches when the CBT model does not 
compliment the client's needs, explicating the rationale and theoretical framework for 

the choices I have made in treatment. I then reflect on the subjective process I have 

gone through in developing my identity as a counselling psychologist. 

Section C- Theoretical essav 

The aim of this section is to present a theoretical essay exploring the role of groups in 
therapy. Groups are made up of individuals, who in some way are connected, either 
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physically, being in the same place at the same time, or in their minds, sharing a 

common aim, purpose or function (Barnes, Ernst & Keith, 1999). Individuals in a 

group context, sharing their experiences with similar others, often helps them quickly 

move beyond isolation and a sense of self-separateness, to connect intimately with 

others (Yalom, 1995). Therefore in some cases this might meet the subjective needs 

of a client more effectively or quicker than in one to one therapy. Hence the 

subjective experience of the individual is paramount in the treatment of the group. By 

examining group processes, an alternative approach for meeting individual needs is 

highlighted. 

This essay compares and contrasts the Psychodynamic and the Cognitive Behavioural 

models of group therapy. I present the theory underpinning each model, analyse their 
therapeutic approaches, followed by an exploration of how each model applies to the 

group process and to specific problems, focusing on the process and content of these 
interventions. 

Section D- Process revort 

This final section focuses primarily on the subjective experience of the individual. It 
includes a process report of my clinical work with my client Jason (pseudonym). He 

presented with depression and anger management difficulties linked to his previous 
history of childhood abuse. This therapeutic encounter reflects the presence of 
counselling psychology's philosophical and theoretical underpinning in my practice. I 

elaborate on the idiosyncratic treatment approach devised to treat Jason and highlight 
the importance of the therapeutic relationship (Gonzalez-Prendes, 2007). Throughout 

the therapy I aimed to continually provide Jason with unconditional positive regard 
(Rogers, 1957), valuing his subjective experiences, without assuming objective 
'truths'. I believe this was paramount in the improvements Jason made during the 
course of the therapy. I also critically reflect on my experience of treating Jason and 
the therapeutic areas in which I might improve in order to enhance my skills and 
practice as a counselling psychologist. 
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SECTION A- Empirical research 

ABSTRACT 

Counselling psychology promotes the importance of developing multicultural 

counselling competencies in order that treatment interventions meet the needs of 

culturally diverse clients, acknowledging their unique experiences. However, minority 

groups have been somewhat neglected by the counselling psychology literature. The 

Jewish population appears to be a case in point. This qualitative study explores 

orthodox Jewish women's experiences of observing the laws of family purity (which 

govern sexual behavior between husband and wife) and how such observance impacts 

their marital relationships. Interpretative phenomenological Analysis (EPA) was 

employed to access the lived experiences of these women. Analysis of the results 
highlighted the women's experience of physical separation from their spouse as 
paramount. This was reflected in their experiences of distancing in their marital 
relationships, sexual relationship renewal upon reuniting with their spouse and 
valuing the personal space and protection gained as a result of separation. The 

participants' mikvah (ritual bath) experiences encompassed feelings of rebirth and 
renewal as well as contrasting feelings of shame and exposedness, which seemed to 
impact their adjustment back to intimacy with their spouses. The psychological 

messages conveyed suggested that fear seemed to motivate the participants' 
adherence, which in turn offered them a sense of safety and containment. Participants 

also displayed ambiguous and ambivalent perceptions concerning whether the laws 

were oppressive to them. Responses throughout offered a sophisticated weave of 
complex and contrasting experiences. The participants' unrelenting commitment to 
the laws was emphasised, suggesting the importance of incorporating clients' values 
and beliefs within treatment in order to ensure that it is both effective and enduring. 
Clinical applications for marital therapy are highlighted, carrying with them 
transcultural implications for other cultures that adhere to similar practices during 

menstruation. 
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Over the past two decades there has been increasing interest in the links between 

religion and family fife (Edgell, 2005; Mahoney, Pargament, Tarakeshwar & Swank, 

2001). The influential role refigion plays in shaping marital attitudes, values, practices 

and quality has been a particular focus of research (e. g., Booth, Johnson, Branaman & 

Sica, 1995; Myers, 2006; Shehan, Bock, & Lee, 1990). 

Outline 

The purpose of this investigation is to explore orthodox Jewish women's experiences 
of adhering to the Jewish laws of family purity and how such experiences influence 

their marital relationships. 

I view research as essentially co-constructed, with the researcher actively involved in 

constructing, collecting, selecting and interpreting the data in order to account for the 

subjective and inter-subjective elements that impact the research (Finlay, 2002). 
Reflexivity has become a defining feature of qualitative research (Banister, Burman, 
Parker, Taylor, & Tindall, 1994). 1 therefore begin by commenting on my own 
personal interest in this topic and exploring my positioning within the research, so 
that my assumptions, beliefs and experiences can be considered in terms of their 
interaction with the data (Elliot, Fischer & Rennie, 1999). 

I move on to explore the importance of researching minority groups and their cultural 
practices for counselling psychologists aiming to develop multicultural competencies. 
I discuss the significance of exploring marital practices in distinct cultures in order to 
develop treatment interventions aimed at enhancing marital satisfaction and resultant 
wellbeing. I next look at the importance of attachment theory, communication and sex 
in the marital relationship in order to highlight pathways influencing marital 
satisfaction. I then explore religious approaches to menstruation and resultant 
practices, highlighting the possible transcultural relevance of this study. This is 
followed by a detailed review of the Jewish approach to menstruation and the laws of 
family purity. Finally, I critically review the literature on women's experiences of 
family purity, and identify the major research gap that this study seeks to address. 
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Personal reflexiviiy 

My choice of research topic evolved through my interest in marital relationships. I 

was at a stage in my life where I was engaged and planning my own wedding, 

following several years in which I had been thinking a lot about what marriage meant 

to me. I had also started working in a Jewish marriage counselling service and was 

becoming more aware of the potential difficulties couples may face during their 

marriage. I was intrigued to understand more about such relationships for both 

personal development and to better equip myself when working with this client group. 

It was clear from my preliminary investigations of the literature that the Jewish 

community was a minority group that was under-researched and could be said to be in 

need of modernised therapeutic interventions. As I started to sift through the research 

regarding difficulties experienced by Jewish couples, it became apparent that the laws 

of family purity were an area of possible strife. There had been few scientific studies 
investigating the impact of observing these laws. And the topic appeared to have been 

untouched by counselling psychology. 

The research on marital satisfaction in the general population indicates that following 

the honeymoon period sexual frequency rapidly decreases due to habituation and 

predictability (Blumstein & Schwartz, 1983; Doddridge, Schumm, & Berger, 1987). 1 

wondered whether adhering to the Jewish laws of family purity, which are designed to 

enforce a routine of intimacy and separation, might produce a different picture. I felt 

that understanding this area was relevant not only for a counselling psychologist 

working with the orthodox Jewish community but also for counselling psychologists 

working with minority groups and cultures where couples adhere to similar practices 

of separation during menstruation. I had become aware that similar practices existed 
in other major religions including Christianity, Islam and Hinduism. An 

understanding of such practices appeared relevant to counselling psychologists both 

in their quest to develop multicultural competencies and in their interactions with 
minority groups, given the importance of ensuring that interventions do not interfere 

with clients' cultural values. 
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In order to remain critical of my own "subjectivity, vested interests, predilections and 

assumptions and to be conscious of how these might impact on the research process 

and findings" (Finlay, 2008a, p. 17), I will briefly elaborate on my religious stance and 

the personal transitions I went through as I began the research. 

As a modem orthodox Jew, I maintain my Jewish traditions whilst flexibly integrating 
into Western society. My plan to adhere to the laws of family purity was an 
opportunity to integrate spirituality into my daily life. It offered me a pathway that I 

would follow in the pursuit of a successful marriage, as I was perhaps grappling with 
my own fears concerning marital discord and breakdown. I believed that having a 
framework ordained by God, which had been observed for thousands of years, would 
provide my relationship with a positive sexual structure. However, I was also aware 
that my knowledge and expectations of this marital practice were somewhat naYve and 
undeveloped and suspected that observance might present challenges and difficulties. 

Since I was planning to begin my adherence to the laws while I was still conducting 
the project, I recognised that there would be a strong element of personal involvement 
in the research process, the data obtained and the presentation of findings. I had to be 

mindful of my potential inclination to see only the positive aspects of the practice, but 
I was also hesitant not to overcompensate for this and focus unduly on the negative. I 

was also aware that I might come to experience my own issues with the observance. 
To account for these factors, I kept a reflective journal throughout the research 
process. I also had regular peer and supervision sessions where I was able to 
document and discuss the influence my personal expectations, beliefs, values, and 
experiences might be having on the research process. 

Counselling 12sy&hologl and multicultural corn2=cies 

Over the past three decades the challenge of developing multicultural counselling 
competencies has obtained a prominent place in psychological literature, with the 
development of such competencies recognised as a key foundation for effective and 
ethical therapeutic practice (Affedondo & Toporek, 2004; Marsella & Pedersen, 
2004). This is reflected in the increase in graduate programmes that provide training 
in this arena (Sue, Arredondo, McDavis, 1992). Counselling psychologists have the 
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duty to identify and develop personal levels of multicultural competence regarding 

their attitudes, beliefs, knowledge and skills. The importance lies not in gaining 

specific competencies but rather in their application across diverse contexts and 

clients (Collins & Arthur, 2010). 

The specific competencies for multicultural counselling practice (Sue et al., 1992; Sue 

et al., 1982; Sue et al., 1998) have been published widely: for example, in the 

Counselling Psychologist, the Journal for Multicultural Counseling and Development, 

the Journal for Counseling and Development, and by the American Association for 

Multicultural Counseling and Development and the American Counseling Association 

(Sue et al., 1992; see Collins & Arthur, 2010, for a detailed elaboration of 

multicultural competencies). There are three main dimensions: (a) "Counsellor 

awareness of own assumptions, values, and biases; " (b) "Understanding the 

worldview of the culturally different client; " and (c) "Developing appropriate 
intervention strategies and techniques" (Sue et al., 1992, p. 481). It can be argued that 

there is no distinction between professional competence and multicultural 

competence, since every client-therapist interaction involves a multicultural 

encounter: the therapist has to take into account the factors that influence the client's 

experience and worldview (Collins & Arthur, 2005,2010). 

Much of the multicultural counselling literature originates in America (USA), and can 
be argued to have minimal relevance to cultures outside the Euro-Arnerican context 
(Sue, Ivey, & Pedersen, 1996; Sue & Sue, 1999). Largely, it focuses on mainstream 

culture, with little attention paid to minority groups. As Nelson-Jones (2002, p-133) 

notes: "Advocates of multicultural counselling and therapy assert that the Euro- 
American bias of mainstream therapy approaches causes Western-oriented therapists 

to fail many of their actual and potential minority group clients". One aim of this 

study is to contribute to a broadening of multicultural counselling psychology 
literature in the United Kingdom (UK). This is an urgent need given that counselling 
psychologists working in the UK, especially in London, are surrounded by diversity. 
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Marital relationshigs and treatment interventions 

The study of marital relationships has been prevalent across a variety of disciplines, 

including sociology, psychology, public policy, anthropology, history, and even 

neuroscience. The quality of marriage has been shown to have a powerful impact on 

adult functioning as well as child development (Cox et al., 2008). Findings have 

documented the health-buffering effects of marital satisfaction and its link with 
longevity (Lillard & Panis, 1996; Murray, 2000), contrasting the negative health 

outcomes associated with conflictual marital relationships (Kiecolt-Glaser & Newton, 
2001). Marital conflict has also been implicated in predicting lower psychological 

wellbeing (Cox et al., 2008). Despite this impressive cross-discipfinary attention, less 

appears to be known about the marital relationships and marital cultural practices of 
minority populations. 

Research identifies attachment, communication and sexual satisfaction (Hollist & 
Miller, 2005; Litzinger & Gordon, 2005) as crucial components of marital 

satisfaction. The child's internal working models of the self and others, dependent on 
their first caregiver relationships, act as a template for future relationships 
(Ainsworth, 1989; Bowlby, 1982). Research also points to a significant relationship 
between attachment styles and marital quality (Bartholomew & Horowitz, 1991; 
Gallo & Smith, 2001; Kirkpatrick & Davis, 1994). Hazan and Shaver (1987) suggest 
that securely attached couples have greater marital satisfaction; they feel comfortable 
with emotional intimacy and experience satisfaction from close relationships. These 

researchers found that avoidant couples were fearful of intimacy and uncomfortable at 
being close to others and that ambivalent couples, fearful of the relationship ending, 
were reluctant to get close, often resorting to aggressive behaviour to push the other 
away. 

Communication is also considered a central component of marital satisfaction 
(Christensen & Shenk, 1991; Gottman & Levenson, 1988; Noller, 1988; Rogge & 
Bradbury, 1999; Spanier & Lewis, 1980). Longitudinal and cross-sectional studies 
have consistently highlighted the relationship between communication and 
satisfaction (Carrere & Gottman, 1999; Gottman & Levenson, 1992; Gottman & 
Krokoff, 1989; Markman, 1979,1981; Rogge & Bradbury, 1999). Unhappy couples 
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appear to have a deficit in their communication skills, displaying demand-withdrawal, 

partner avoidance, psychological distance and more conflict than non-distressed 

couples (Christensen & Heavey, 1990; Christensen & Shenk, 1991). 

Sexual satisfaction is also recognised as an important component of marital 

satisfaction (Apt, Hurlburt & Clark, 1994; Laumann, Paik, & Rosen, 1999; Young, 

Denny, Luquis & Young, 1998; 2000). Some research has indicated that as many as 

50% of couples experience high rates of sexual dysfunction (Masters & Johnson, 

1970), with serious consequences for marital wellbeing (McCarthy, 1997; 2001; 

2003). 

Much of the above research on the links between attachment, communication, sexual 

satisfaction and marital satisfaction is quantitative and whilst it tells us that these 

effects occur, it does not indicate how. Qualitative research adds a key dimension by 

showing how these various factors influence the quality of marital relationships. It 

arguably has greater potential to inform marital treatment approaches (Willig, 2001). 

Meta-analyses have verified the positive impact that marital therapy has on reducing a 

number of mental health issues. These include: relationship distress (Shadish & 

Baldwin, 2005); depression (Beach & Gupta, 2003); and drug and alcohol abuse 
(Stanton & Shadish, 1997). Such interventions have also been shown to enhance 

physical health (Osterman et al., 2003). Premarital education has also been shown to 

enhance couple communication and relationship satisfaction (Carroll & Doherty, 
2003). 

These findings emphasise the potential of marital therapy to make a real difference. 
However, they need to be taken with caution, as meta-analyses may be subject to such 
problems as publication bias: the preference of publishers to present studies with 
positive outcomes (Sutton, Song, Gilbody & Abrams, 2000). 

Current research on correlates of marital satisfaction and stability focuses primarily 
on middle-class European-Americans (Cox et al., 2008). It is unfortunate that the 
research has not extended sufficiently to minority groups, as their marital 
relationships and subsequent satisfaction are likely to be affected by their cultural 
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practices. This apparent lack of focus means that marital treatment interventions 

offered may not adequately target minority groups and therefore could be argued not 

to meet their therapeutic needs. For example, Western culture encourages marriage 

based on love, preceded by a period of being in a relationship and often cohabitation. 
However within Islam, for example, some families arrange marriages for their 

children (Quadr, De Silva, Martin, & Murad, 2005), and the gender regime tends to be 

male-centred, with sexual behavior oriented towards reproduction (Laumann et al., 
2006). Such factors need to be taken into account when treating observant Islamic 

couples in therapy. 

Sue (1988) critiques mental health services for failing adequately to serve ethnic 
minority groups, arguing that they lack resources such as bilingual counsellors, 
counsellors who are members of the minority group, and therapists able to understand 
clients' values, lifestyles and backgrounds. Indeed, some counsellors may reveal 
discrimination or prejudice in their practice. Sue and Zane (1987) argue that the major 
cause of these inadequacies is the therapist's lack of ability to deliver culturally 
responsive forms of treatment. Whilst the claims Sue makes are relevant and have 

paved the way for the growing multicultural counselling literature, his research was 
conducted more than 20 years ago, primarily among Asian Americans, and requires 
re-evaluation, updating and broadening. 

For multicultural counselling psychology, it is clearly vital to explore the ways in 

which different cultural groups and social contexts impact on marital relationships as 
seen in the above example. Understanding what contributes to marital satisfaction and 
stability on the one hand and to marital dissolution on the other, is of critical 
importance because the maintenance of happy and stable unions has been linked to 
increased wellbeing (Bryant & Conger, 2002; Simon & Marcussen, 1999). Given this 

correlation, there is a need to systematically examine specific cultures, taking into 

consideration their unique circumstances and cultural norms. 

Intimate relationships anchored by sacred religious beliefs have in general received 
little research attention (Ribner, 2003). Mead (1954) highlights the significant 
influence that cultural norms hold over the beliefs of each ethnic group's view of 
appropriate sexual behaviour. This cultural dimension seems to have been lost 
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amongst the wealth of research exploring the changing nature of practices and 

attitudes to sexual behavior. Bhugra argues that: 

Relationships and sexual therapies have to be seen and delivered in the context of 

an individual's culture and society as well as of prevalent norms when the therapies 

are being offered. Furthermore, the clinician must be aware of specific cultural and 

ethnic patterns of relationship behaviours and social mores (Bhugra, 2002, p. 99). 

Working with clients who adhere to different practices and belief systems often 

requires the therapeutic plan to be adapted to the individual's needs, so as to ensure 

the therapy does not conflict with their value system (Simpson & Ramberg, 1992). 

Religious avvroaches to menstruation 

Menstruation has become a topic of international interest, studied across 

psychological, sociological, anthropological and comparative religious perspectives. 
It has also been a focal point of feminist analysis, which in general has presented 

religious practices around menstruation in an oppressive light; religious patriarchies 

are seen as having demonized and regulated women's bodies, depicting them in a 

negative way (Douglas, 1966). Religious regulations have been seen as amplifying 
these attitudes by imposing restrictive norms on menstruating women, thereby 

silencing them (Hartman & Marmon, 2004). The menstrual customs of various 

cultures will now be explored in order to develop our understanding of the menstrual 

practices many religions promote and their transcultural implications. 

In many contemporary monotheistic faiths spiritual and physical purity is of central 
importance. Menstrual blood is associated with impurity and water is seen as a 
symbolic tool for purification, with the ability to cleanse perceived pollutions. 
Judaism, Christianity, Islam, Hinduism, and Buddhism all consider menstruation as 
having an influence over the women's status of purity, resulting in various 
prohibitions for the menstruating women (Guterman, Mehta & Gibbs, 2008). 

Today, most Christian denominations do not follow any specific rituals or rules 
related to menstruation (Barnes, 2006). However a small number still follow the 
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ancient Eastern Orthodox Church rulings which prohibit relations with menstruates 

and bar them from church access and communion (Barnes, 2006). 

In Islam, the Qur'an states: "For Allah loves those who turn to Him constantly and He 

loves those who keep themselves pure and clean" (Qur'an 2: 222). Menstruating 

women are therefore viewed as "impure" in relation to religious functions: they are 

prohibited from entering a place of worship (Bennett, 2005; Engineer, 1987), praying 

or fasting during Ramadan, and touching or reciting the Qur'an (Fischer, 1978; 

Maghen, 1999; Whelan, 1975). A menstruating woman is also prohibited from sexual 
intercourse for the period of her menstrual cycle: seven full days, at the end of which 

she engages in a process of ritual washing before she becomes pure again (Bennett, 

2005; Fischer, 1978; Whelan, 1975). 

Traditional Hindu culture requires that menstruating women leave the main house and 
live in a small hut outside the village (Apffel-Marglin, 1994; Phipps, 1980). This is 
because they are seen as impure (Chawla, 1992). During this time women must rest 
and are prohibited from accessing water, meaning that they cannot bathe (Apffel- 
Marglin, 1994) or cook (Joshi & Fawcett, 2001). In addition women cannot enter 
places of worship (Chawla, 1992; Ferro-Luzzi, 1980; Phipps, 1980; Sharma, Vaid, & 
Manhas, 2006), mount horses or drive vehicles (Whelan, 1975). There is also a strong 
taboo against menstruation being publicly acknowledged and it is encouraged to be an 
entirely private event (Apffel-Marglin, 1994). 

While Buddhist culture tends to view menstruation as a natural occurrence (Buddha 
Dharma Education Association, 2004), Taiwanese and Japanese Buddhists view 
menstruation as polluting (Furth & Shu-Yueh, 1992; Jnanavira, 2006). Women are 
thought to lose their spiritual energy during menstruation and are banned from 

participating in folk rituals, temple worship, and ceremonies such as weddings (Furth 
& Shu-Yueh, 1992). Some followers even view menstruates as threatening, attracting 
the attention of blood-eating ghosts (Lhamo, 2003). 

The Jewish religion also views menstrual blood as ritually unclean as it signals the 
death of potential life. The Torah (Jewish bible) states "You shall not approach a 
woman in her time of unclean separation, to uncover her nakedness" (Leviticus 
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18: 19). Since the wording expresses 'approach' only and does not explicitly say 
'intercourse', the sages devised numerous laws preventing physical contact generally 
(Eider, 1999). These are the laws of family purity governing sexual behaviour 

between husband and wife (known in Hebrew as the laws of Taharat Hamishpacha). 

The laws instruct that a husband and wife abstain from sexual and physical contact for 

the duration of a woman's 'niddah' (literal meaning 'separation') time. This time is 

the length of her menstrual cycle, which the Torah dictates to be the days of her 

menstrual bleeding plus an additional seven 'clean' days. According to this ritual an 

orthodox Jewish married woman is required to check herself internally twice daily 

(morning and afternoon) after her menstrual bleeding has stopped, using a white linen 

cloth to ensure she is no longer menstruating. This practice occurs until she has been 

'clean' for seven continual days (Burt & Rudolf, 2000; Eider, 1999). 

During menstruation and the subsequent seven 'clean' days, a series of restrictions is 

placed upon physical contact to prevent physical intimacy (Eider, 1999). A husband 

and wife are not allowed to engage in any physical contact; they are required to sleep 
in separate beds and take great caution when passing each other objects, putting the 
item down for the other to take rather than passing it directly. No distinction is made 
between sexual and non-sexual touching. 

Following these seven 'clean' days the woman is required to immerse herself on the 

seventh night in a mikvah (ritual bath), which takes her from being in niddah (ritually 

unclean state) to a state of taharah (a state of purity). A mikvah is a large body of 
natural rainwater that is collected in a bath-like pool. The preparation for the mikvah 
involves a women bathing and removing all separations between her body and the 
mikvah water. This includes removing all unwanted bodily hair, cutting her nails, and 
removing nail varnish and any makeup. 

After the woman has immersed herself in the mikvah, the couple is permitted to 
resume physical and sexual contact. The two-week on and off pattern of contact lasts 
throughout marital life except when a woman becomes pregnant and no longer has her 

period, or when she regulates her periods by being on the pill, or when she reaches 
menopause (Eider, 1999; Ribner, 2003). Adhering to these laws represents an integral 
part of the orthodox Jewish identity (Donin, 1972; Wasserfall, 1992). 
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Research 

Research regarding the Jewish population is noticeably absent from multicultural 

counselling literature (Fischer & Moradi, 2001). There is a significant knowledge gap 

in counselling psychology research regarding Jewish individuals, their practices and 

how interventions can be adapted to suit their needs. It is necessary to develop this 

research base, so that counselling psychologists develop multicultural competencies 

enabling them to offer Jewish individuals treatment interventions that respect their 

practices and beliefs and do not oppose them. 

With regard to psychotherapy and counselling, it has been proposed that religion is 

almost as integral to the religious client as are their family structures and relationships 
(Payne, Bergin, & Loftus, 1992). Research suggests that if the therapist does not 
integrate therapeutic solutions that take into account religious values, then effective 

outcomes may be temporary and benefits restricted (Bergin, 1980; Cunningham, 

1983; Gass, 1984; Kuyken, Brewin, Power, & Furnham, 1992). 

There are few scientific accounts of the psychological experiences of religious women 
living within these structures, despite the plethora of anthropological, sociological and 
feminist studies surrounding the topic of menstruation. This gap in the psychological 

research not only reflects the lack of attention given to women adhering to these 

practices, but also indicates that treatment interventions may be failing to take account 

of clients' cultural values, beliefs and practices. 

Previous research exploring Jewish women and their observance of family purity laws 

will now be critically examined. 

Family Rurity in Judaism: a literature review 

The laws of family purity ordained upon orthodox Jews have remained a constant 
tradition amongst Jewish women over many centuries. However, the rationale and 
justifications for such practices have varied greatly over time (Yanay & Rapoport, 

1997). Despite the volumes of religious literature devoted to the laws of family purity, 
the scientific research exploring the impact of adherence on observant couples and the 
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possible relationship between adherence to the laws, marital happiness or unhappiness 

and sexual satisfaction is limited (Labinsky, Schmeidler, Yehuda, Friedman, & 

Rosenbaum, 2009). 

Hartman and Marmon (2004) explored how women living under a system of family 

purity experience the observance of such rules. They conducted interviews with 30 

orthodox Jewish women living in Jerusalem during 2001. The women ranged in age 

from 25 to 57, with lengths of marriage of between four months and 35 years. During 

interviews the researchers focused on: niddah, mikvah immersion, and the 

significance of women's observance for themselves, their spouse, the community and 
God. They analysed the data using both grounded theory development (Charmatz 

1983,1995) and parts of Gilligan et al. 's (1988) voice centred analysis. On the basis 

of their interviews they identified a number of themes, which will be summarized 
briefly. 

The women in their study grappled with the concept of oppression and its relevance to 

their lives, struggling with feminist claims regarding the oppressive patriarchal 

religious roles imposed on women. They shared experiences of finding their 

adherence to niddah difficult, due to its inconvenience and the imposed cycles of 

closeness and separation which conflicted with their physical and emotional health. 

They expressed their aversion to asking a Rabbi about their niddah status' as it left 

them feeling demoralized and powerless; indeed, their responses indicated a degree of 
disobedience and individual rebellion. However, they also shared positive 

experiences. All showed commitment to the laws despite the difficulties, finding that 

their adherence added value, empowerment and beauty to their lives. They 

appreciated the religious life and its communal aspects, and viewed their observance 

of niddah as a part of their religious being, leaving them feeling valued, respected and 

sexually powerful. 

Hartman and Marmon's (2004) research set out to determine how women themselves 
live and experience their niddah observance. The analysis, however, seems in the 

1 If a woman sees a bloodstain on the cloth she uses for her internal checks during the clean days 
following menstruation, or on her underwear when she is not menstruating, she is required to ask a 
rabbi whether this stain makes her ritually unclean. 
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main to be examining gendered processes, challenging the structural analysis of the 

regimen of ritual purity, and further developing the feminist position regarding 

women living under religious systems. The authors adopt a staunch feminist 

perspective, reflected by the publication of their research in the Journal of Gender and 

Society. It could be argued that this powerful standpoint has diverted the authors from 

focusing, on the women's actual experiences and instead, there is perhaps a tendency 

to emphasize the women's experience of oppression or empowerment when living 

within such systems. Moreover, their study does not highlight the potential impact 

such findings might have on the couple and their level of marital satisfaction. Neither 

does it explore any clinical implications of significant interest to counselling 

psychologists. 

An argument can therefore be made for the need to develop and enhance our 

understanding of women living within these systems, their lived experience of niddah, 

and specifically how their religious observance of cycles of separation followed by 

periods of intimacy affects their marital relationship. In this way the present 
investigation endeavors to explore orthodox Jewish women's experiences of 

observing the laws of family purity and the marital impacts of such practices, so that 

they can be offered supportive treatment interventions that are bespoke and culturally 

sensitive. 

A further criticism of Hartman and Marmon's (2004) study is that while some 

participants were interviewed in both Hebrew and English, most were interviewed in 
Hebrew and their responses then translated into English during transcription. Barnes 
(1996) contends that when conducting grounded theory with distinct cultures, data 

analysis must be conducted in the language of the respondents, as this facilitates a 
rich, inductively derived grounded theory. As qualitative research aims to capture the 

subjective meaning of phenomena for participants in specific social and cultural 

contexts, translating and interpreting qualitative cross-language cultural data is 

subject to difficulties. It tends to result in researchers improvising procedures and 
changing meanings conveyed by participants, as there are limited guidelines available 
to support qualitative researchers' translation efforts (Esposito, 2001). Hartman and 
Marmon (2004) do not reference the methods used in their translation or how they 
dealt with cultural idioms and meanings that are not understood easily in the English 

20 



language (Temple & Young, 2004). This raises questions about the accuracy of their 

translations and the cross-cultural relevance of the accounts they produced. This 

suggests that further research conducted in the native language of the participants is 

necessary. 

Hartman and Marmon's (2004) study has a sample of 30 women, which is relatively 

large in comparison with samples used by other qualitative methodologies. Despite 

this, the observations made by Hartman and Marmon cannot be generalized beyond 

this specific group of women living in Jerusalem and it is argued here that as this 

group is from such a specific and distinct Jewish culture, the study's findings may 

also lack transferability to modem UK orthodox Jews. This suggests the need for 

further research within the UK Jewish population. 

This critique of sample size and lack of transferability to a UK population could also 
be argued as applying to Marmon's (1999,2008) unpublished works. Marmon's 

(2008) PhD thesis is not available online, is not readily accessible to UK counselling 

psychologists and is as yet unable to inform practice. However, a brief review will be 

presented here. 

The thesis examines the interface of the observance of family purity and identity of 

modem orthodox couples. Conducting narrative interviews with a sample of 22 

women and 24 men (21 couples and 4 individuals) Marmon (2008) used semi- 

structured interviews to gather extensive data in which both open-ended and closed 

questions were asked (72 questions in total). The interview data were then analysed 

using a hermeneutic mode of qualitative analysis. 

Marmon's (2008) findings encompass how participants carry out their observance of 
family purity in practice. She establishes how participants incorporate religious 
messages, devotion and inherent religious orientations into their lives, highlighting 

examples of divergence of religiosity between partners and how such partners merge 
their practice. The PhD also reveals the way niddah influences the development of 
identity in both males and females, pointing to some of the challenges within a 
modem religious value system. Marmon focuses on how participants use religion to 
create meaning, on how the participants interact with gender notions and conceptions 
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of modemity, and on how this influences their identity formation. 

There is therefore a marked sociological and anthropological thrust to Marmon's 

thesis, which could be argued to have less relevance to the psychological 

understanding of women's experiences of observance. This is the lacuna that the 

present investigation seeks to address. 

Marmon (1999) has also contributed a chapter to a book concerning menstruation in 

Jewish life and law. Her interviews focus on 46 women (mostly from Boston, USA) 

and their perceptions of the advantages and disadvantages of their observance of the 

laws of family purity. Overall the women expressed mixed feelings: they were 

comfortable with the laws but had negative perspectives, too. Their experiences are 
described as fluctuating according to the woman's personal needs, the nature of her 

marital relationship and her life cycle stage. 

Marmon's (1999) sample spans the extremes of orthodoxy, from Haredi and Hassidic 

to modem orthodox and everything in between. This diversity could be argued to call 
into question the representative nature of these findings. Another problem with this 

work is that it is not readily available to UK counselling psychologists: it is buried in 

a Jewish publication alongside hundreds of religious texts providing instructional, 

theological, inspirational and explanatory information on the practice. 

It is therefore argued here that there exists a significant gap in the multicultural 

counselling psychology literature regarding the experience of this form of observance 
in a British context, the impact of these experiences on the marital relationship, and 
the development of culturally sensitive treatment interventions. 

In another study, Guterman (2008) measured the observance of the laws of family 

purity of 267 self-identified modem orthodox Jews. Participants completed online 

questionnaires that were available worldwide. Results indicated that laws were broken 

more frequently during the second week of niddah than during the first week (i. e., 
during actual menstruation). Lenient laws tended to be broken more often than did 

strict ones. These results were consistent with Guterman"s earlier (2006) findings 

from a sample of 53 synagogue congregants in the USA who completed 
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questionnaires. In both studies, participants reported transgressing on average three to 

four behaviours over the two-week niddah period. Interestingly, there was a 

correlation between age and the reporting of transgressions, perhaps reflecting an 

increase in transgressions among older age groups or, alternatively, a maturational 

process whereby older adults felt more comfortable reporting their transgressions. 

Guterman's (2008) use of intemet-recruitment and surveys could be argued to call the 

validity of these findings into question. There was no way to determine how honest 

participants were regarding the reporting of transgressions and whether the sample 

was representative of modem orthodox Jews. Further research comparing adherence 
between different Jewish groups therefore appears necessary. 

By way of explanation for the lapses in observance uncovered by his 2006 study, 
Guterman turns to Schachter's (2002) research, which used a narrative approach to 
explore the identity development and constraints of 30 young Israeli adults (mean age 
26.5 years) of modem orthodox persuasion. Schachter (2002) suggests that 
commitment to Jewish religious law combined with the acceptance of Western values 
can result in identity conflicts. When discussing matters of modem orthodoxy and 
sexuality, participants frequently expressed their inner dialogue between their 

religious adherence and their modem identity. Drawing on Schachter's findings, 
Guterman (2006) suggests that the more lenient laws may have been transgressed as a 
result of the inner conflict between the two voices: the modem versus the traditional. 
He goes on to speculate that such conflict might cause individuals to decide for 

themselves which laws to keep and which to transgress. 

The quantitative research by Guterman (2006,2008) is both interesting and useful: it 
informs us that people do transgress the laws of family purity and when they are most 
likely to transgress. However, it does not provide insights into why they make these 
transgressions. In fact the author has to turn to qualitative research by Schachter 
(2002) for possible explanations. This highlights the value of the qualitative approach 
in providing details, nuances and fine-grained understanding of experiences (Willig, 
2001). Further qualitative research would not only develop understanding of the 
possible reasons for individuals' adherence to the laws, or the lack thereof, but also 
explore observance in the context of the marital relationship, arguably a neglected 
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area. Since the laws of family purity apply specifically to the marital relationship, it is 

surprising that no study has explicitly addressed the potential psychological impact 

observance of these laws has on the marital relationship. 

Labinsky et al. (2009) made steps towards assessing this relationship. They conducted 

a relatively large quantitative study in the USA exploring the sexual lives of 380 

orthodox Jewish women. They state that their motivation for this study was their 

experience of counselling this group and observing the problems arising within their 

marital sexual lives. They based their study on a previous investigation carried out by 

Laumann, et al. (1999), which investigated the prevalence and predictors of sexual 

dysfunction in the USA amongst men and women from the general population. 

Amongst Labinksy et al. 's (2009) findings which covered various aspects of the 

women's sexual lives, they detected that physical satisfaction ratings were higher for 

women who displayed fewer conflicts about niddah and the mikvah, perhaps 
highlighting the role observance of the laws of family purity plays in the marital 

sexual lives of these individuals. Moreover they found that adherence to niddah was 

associated with better emotional satisfaction, but not physical satisfaction. The 

women reported experiencing sexual and emotional difficulties; half the participants 
had used some type of psychotherapy to deal with marital problems, depression and 

anxiety. Overall, the women surveyed reported less emotional and sexual satisfaction, 

and greater sexual dysfunction than those in Laumann et al. 's (1999) study. This 

difference perhaps reflects the apparent difficulties these women experienced in their 

marital sexual lives, and might account for their subsequent need for therapy. 

Significantly, Labinsky et al. 's study was not published in a peer-reviewed journal but 

rather on an orthodox Jewish internet site. It may therefore lack credibility compared 
with other published research that has been through the rigorous peer-review process. 
Making it clear early in the article that their findings are intended for the observant 
lay community, and for Rabbinic, educational and health professionals who serve the 

religious community, the authors provide no real details about the measures they 

used, other than their claim to have used scales similar to those used by Laumann et 
al. (1999). A peer-reviewed journal would require measures to be clearly described in 

order that their reliability could be established and the study replicated. Moreover, the 
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authors' discussion does not relate their findings to the existing literature, something 
that would occur in a peer-reviewed journal. The reader is therefore unable to assess 
the relevance of the findings in the context of the wider literature. Perhaps the 
intention behind not publishing the study was to maintain the privacy of the topic. The 

assumption may have been that the findings would be more readily accepted if they 

came not from a scientific source but rather from a spiritual educational resource, 

which might be less likely to highlight the possible harms involved in adherence. In 

addition, the fact that all the respondents in the survey lived in the USA suggests that 
the findings may have limited relevance in the UK context. This highlights the need 
for further research into how modem orthodox Jewish women in the UK experience 
their sexual lives. 

Despite these criticisms, however, it bears emphasis that the researchers have solid 

reputations, being very well known in the field, and that the study was conducted at a 
reputable institution (Mount Sinai in the USA). Despite its limitations, the study 
remains one of the few pieces of research to look comprehensively at the sexual lives 

of Jewish women. 

Relevance to counselling psycholpgy 

"Multicultural counseling competence has become a cornerstone of the multicultural 
psychology literature" (Reynolds & Constantine, 2004, p. 347). Developing such 
competencies is of paramount importance in the counselling psychology profession. 
Not only is this the essence of counselling psychology (Atkinson, Wampold & 
Worthington, 2007) but it is also crucial for ethical practice (Arredondo & Toporek, 
2004). Expanding the multicultural counselling psychology research base is essential 
for the provision of culturally appropriate services to culturally diverse clients 
(Atkinson et al., 2007), thereby ensuring that counselling psychologists in the UK 

uphold the standards and values of the profession: 

to know empathically and to respect first person accounts as valid in their own 
terms; to elucidate, interpret and negotiate between perceptions and world views 
but not to assume the automatic superiority of any one way of experiencing, 
feeling, valuing and knowing" (BPS, 2005, p. 1 -2). 
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Consistent with counselling psychology's humanistic underpinnings, counselling 

psychologists need to develop their cultural awareness and understanding in order to 

enhance therapeutic efficacy (Hayes & Toarmino, 1995). Applying traditional 
therapeutic models and techniques to minority groups has been shown to be 

unsuccessful (Sue & Sue, 1990). As Kareem notes, "A psychotherapeutic process that 
does not take into account the person's whole life experience, or that denies 

consideration of their race, culture, gender or social values, can only fragment the 
person" (1992 p. 16). An intervention is "more likely to be effective when it matches 
or fits the cognitive map, lifestyle, or cultural background of the clients" (Sue, Akutsu 
& Higashi 1985, p. 275-276). While the process of cross-cultural therapy does not 
expect the therapist to know everything about the client's culture, it emphasizes the 
importance of remaining open and flexible, of challenging one's own views, and of 
being respectful towards other value systems (Eleftheriadou, 2003). As one team of 
researchers puts it: "The therapist who is educated about the orthodox [Jewish] 

community's values and mores will be better able to offer effective treatmene' 
(Paradis, Freidman, Hatch & Ackerman, 1996, p. 285). 

Research aims and guestions 

This study seeks to contribute to the limited multicultural counselling psychology 
literature relating to the UK and to the goal of "understanding the worldview of the 
culturally different client" (Sue et al., 1992, p. 481). Specifically, it aims to expand 
the research base on modem orthodox Jewish women, seeking to develop a deeper 
understanding of these women's experiences of adhering to the laws of family purity 
within their specific cultural context (Woolfe, Dryden & Strawbridge, 2003). In doing 
so, it endeavors to move the discussion beyond feminist, sociological and 
anthropological debates (Hartman & Marmon, 2004; Marmon, 1999,2008) and to go 
deeper than quantitative studies such as that of Labinksy et al. (2009). 

Bearing in mind the significance of the marital relationship for the psychological and 
physical health of the married couple and their children, this study focuses not simply 
on women's experience of observing religious laws but also on how such observance 
impacts marital relationships. It is hoped that this will facilitate the development of 
more culturally sensitive treatment interventions for couples adhering to such 

26 



practices. A further aim is to develop general multicultural awareness among 

counselling psychologists so that they can better serve minority groups. Finally, the 

study hopes to offer transcultural insights, reaching beyond the experience of 

orthodox Jewish women to that of women from other cultures who observe similar 

marital practices. 

The participants in the current study all live in London and speak English as their first 

language. This obviates the need for translation, enabling the women to speak 

directly. The general research questions investigated by the study are as follows: 

1. What are the participants' experiences of adhering to the laws of family 

purity? 
2. Has observing the laws of family purity impacted their marital relationship in 

any way? 
3. What are the participants' experiences of intimacy within their marital 

relationship and has observing the laws of family purity influenced their 

physical relationship? 
4. Have any other areas of their lives been affected by keeping the laws of family 

purity? 
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METHOD 

Research design 

A qualitative methodology was employed for this study, using data gathered via semi- 

structured interviews. Ile data were analysed using Interpretative Phenomenological 

Analysis (EPA). 

Outline 

Below, I begin by presenting the rationale for selecting the qualitative paradigm and 
the choice of methodology adopted. This is followed by an overview of the 

methodology and its philosophical underpinnings. I then present my epistemological 

standpoint and discuss how I will address reflexivity and validity throughout the 

thesis. I go on to outline the study's procedures, elaborating on: sampling; 

participants; materials; the interview process; ethical considerations; and the analytic 

strategy. 

Rationale for the gualitative oarad 

A qualitative approach was deemed most suitable for this study since it seeks to 

understand how individuals make sense of the world and how they experience the 

events in it. It aims to explore "what it is like to experience specific conditions", 
focussing on "the quality and texture of experience" (Willig, 2001, p. 9). This allows 
for deep exploration, understanding and interpretation of individual experience 
(Lyons & Coyle, 2007). As there is no theory to confirm or disprove, quantitative 
research methodologies would be unsuitable as they manipulate and measure 
variables in order to test hypotheses (Willig, 2001). 

IPA was selected ahead of three other frequently used qualitative methods for 

psychological research. 

Whilst grounded theory (Glaser & Strauss, 1967) shares many similarities with EPA, it 

was considered unsuitable as it focuses on theory construction and social processes 
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that explain phenomena (Payne, 2007). Using the data to create theories was not the 

intention of this study; rather it intended to gain detailed insights of the participant's 

lived experiences, complementing the aims of IPA. 

Discourse analysis (Potter & Wetherell, 1987) provides a means to analyse the orderly 

way of speech, accounting for how individuals make sense of themselves and their 

social worlds via language (Shotter, 1993). This was also ruled out due to its focus on 

language construction (Burr, 1995). Whilst EPA recognises the importance of 

language, it does not view it as the sole constructor of reality (Breakwell, Hammond, 

Fife-Schaw & Smith, 2006); rather than exploring the role of language in specific 

contexts, IPA engages with the individual's lived experiences, thoughts and 

perceptions. 

Narrative analysis (Gee, 1991; Kirkman, 1997; Riessman, 1993) focuses on the way 
individuals impart their view of themselves through narratives, which are viewed as 

creations and claims over personal identity (Linde, 1993). IPA, on the other hand, 

does not particularly follow a narrative; rather it focuses on key themes of a particular 

phenomenon or experience and as such tends to privilege the person over the account 
itself. This is a far better fit for this study's aims of examining how individuals 

experience their personal and social worlds (Smith, 1995). 

Overview of IPA and its ]Rhilosophical underpinnings 

The theoretical pillars upon which IPA is grounded are phenomenology (Moran, 

2000), hermeneutics (Palmer, 1969), and idiography (Smith, Harred & Van 

Langenhove, 1995). 

Phenomenology is the philosophical approach to the study of what experience is like 
(Smith, Flowers & Larkin, 2009). Philosophers such as Husserl, Heidegger, Merleau- 
Ponty and Sartre highlighted the importance of understanding the individual's lived 

experience and what specifically comprises this experience (Smith et al., 2009). IPA 
has a clear phenomenological dedication; it aims to gain a detailed understanding of 
the meaning and sense-making processes that individuals engage in their lives (Smith, 
1996) whilst also considering the surrounding contextual factors (social and 
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economic) that underlie experience (Lyons & Coyle, 2007). Therefore establishing 

the diversity in human experience (Willig, 2001). 

Understanding the experience of another involves interpretation, which leads us on to 

hermeneutics. Smith and Eatough (2006) suggest that the process of IPA involves a 

double hermeneutic between the researcher and the participant in which the researcher 

aims to make sense of how the participant makes sense of his or her world by taking 

an active role in trying to access the personal world of the participant. Hence the 

construction of an interpretative account is a product of the interaction between the 

researcher and participant: the researcher's own conceptions, beliefs, expectations and 

experiences are present and necessary (Smith et al., 1999) in order that they can make 

sense of the participant making sense of their world (Smith, 2007). IPA enables the 

researcher to in part adopt an "insider's perspective" (Conrad, 1987, as cited in Smith 

& Eatough, 2007, p. 36) by attempting to stand as far as possible in the participant's 

shoes (the hermeneutics of empathy) while at the same time standing alongside the 

participant to critically examine the account and look deeper into the meanings 

conveyed within it (critical hermeneutics) (Ricoeur, 1970). This allows for both the 

hermeneutics of empathy and a more critical hermeneutics to be employed, producing 

a richer analytic account. 

The idiographic mode of IPA is concerned with the detailed analysis of one unique 

case study or in-depth individual analyses of various cases (Allport, 1940). This 

contrasts with nomothetic methods, which are probabilistic and offer general claims 
for larger populations. The idiographic emphasis is the basis of the rationale for how 

the interview transcripts should be analysed (Smith et al., 2009). 'Ibis offers a more 
complete in-depth analysis of an individual case as it focuses on the particular details, 

ensuring the analysis is comprehensive and methodical. It moves from single cases to 
more general statements which remain easily retraceable to the specific claim of the 
individual involved. 

Epistemological stance 

IPA has an epistemological openness, allowing researchers to make cautious 
interpretations about the conversational, emotional and cognitive phenomena found in 
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participants' narratives (Smith, 1996). In this it could be argued to be distinct from 

other qualitative methods. Whilst its primary focus is on gaining an insider's 

perspective of individual lived experience, it is conscious of the constraints of context 

and language on accessing the reality of the participant. Moreover, it complements the 

philosophy of counselling psychology, which has been defined as: 

"to know empathically and to respect first person accounts as valid in their own 

terms; to elucidate, interpret and negotiate between perceptions and world views 
but not to assume the automatic superiority of any one way of experiencing, 
feeling, valuing and knowing" (British Psychological Society, BPS, 2005, p. 1-2). 

Hence the analysis cannot produce an unquestionable first person account, as both the 

researcher and participant construct this account in the inter-subjective space. In order 
to address the subjective and inter-subjective elements of such processes, I have 

engaged explicitly in reflexivity (Finlay, 2002) (see the Introduction and Discussion 
for my exploration of personal and methodological reflexivity. ) 

My standpoint in relation to this study draws on a critical realist position (Parker, 
1998 & 1999; Nightingale & Cromby, 1999; Madill, Jordan & Shirley, 2000). This 

recognises that there is an external world that exists independently from our 

experience while not assuming knowledge to be objective (Lyons & Coyle, 2007). 
However, my viewpoint also recognises that we can only access a circular 
relationship between reality and discourse: discourse both affects reality, and is 

affected by reality and people; we are inextricably caught up in our own reality, 
context and language. The implications for psychological research are that the 
interpretations we make are unavoidably a function of the relationship between the 

researcher and paTticipant. "What is real is not dependent on us, but the exact 
meaning and nature of reality is" (Larkin, Watts & Clifton, 2006, p. 107). This 

represents a position somewhere between critical realism and contextual 
constructivism (Jaeger & Rosnow, 1998; Madill, Jordan & Shirley, 2000). 

31 



Qualily in gualitative research 

Yardley (2000) has devised principles that facilitate the assessment of the quality and 

rigour of qualitative research. An application of these as they apply to this study is 

presented below. 

Sensitivity to context 

In the spirit of maintaining sensitivity to the theoretical context (Yardley, 2000). this 

investigation has reviewed previous relevant research (see the Introduction, 

specifically the literature review), and this has helped to identify research gaps. While 

I have approached the topic of my research with certain prior theoretical 

understandings, I attempt at every stage to remain open to the newly emerging data. 

The socio-cultural setting of the study is another important component of experience 

that will be considered. Language, social interactions and culture all play a critical 

role in the manifestation of phenomena. The ways in which these influence the 
beliefs, objectives and expectations of both participant and researcher (Yardley, 2000) 

will be addressed in the Discussion in a section devoted to Methodological 

Reflexivity. This recognises the dynamics that existed between the participants and 

myself, the researcher. 

Commitment and rig= 

My engagement with this topic is both as a researcher and as an orthodox Jew 

observing the laws of family purity. The fact that I have previously conducted an IPA 

means that I have developed a level of competence in the methodology, reflecting my 

commitment to the research method. The rigour of the study can be seen in the 

completeness in of the data collection and analysis (Yardley, 2000). Tle interviews 

obtained detailed accounts from each individual (see Appendix 10 for one transcript) 

and the analysis of each case involved "prolonged contemplative and empathetic 

exploration" (Yardley, 2000, p. 222) that sought to address the complexity of, and 

variation in, each account. 
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Transparency and coherence 

All factors involved in the procedures employed in the study will be detailed in order 

to uphold standards of transparency and coherence. I engage as much as possible in a 

process of critical self-reflexivity in which I consider my personal "interests, 

predilections and assumptions and how these might impact on the research process 

and findings" (Finlay, 2008a, p. 17). This has been facilitated by my keeping a 

reflexive diary. To enhance the integrity and trustworthiness of this investigation I 

also consider how inter- subjective elements have influenced the data collection and 

analysis. Engaging in a process of hermeneutic reflection (Finlay, 2003) will enable 

me to reflect constantly on my experience as a researcher alongside the phenomena 
being studied (Gadamer, 1975). Additionally, I have engaged in supervisor and peer 
discussions involving non-Jewish individuals who by that very token may be more 
objective than I am and therefore able to identify and highlight possible biases I may 
have overlooked. 

My epistemological position, outlined above, will necessarily influence how I have 
interpreted the data. The research and analytic process will be clearly explicated. Data 

extracts will be presented in the analytic account in order to clearly illustrate the 

patterns and concepts found (Miles & Huberman, 1994; Perakyla, 1997). Line 

numbers, page references and transcript pseudonyms will be provided for each extract 
so that it can be easily traced back to the transcript. This will allow the reader to 
assess the fit between the data and the interpretations made (Yardley, 2000). 
Supervisor and peer review will also be employed in order to ensure as far as possible 
that the themes are truly reflective of the participants' accounts. Additionally, I will 
provide a paper trail in the appendix: this will include a copy of one fully annotated 
transcript, along with the table of themes for that particular participant and the table of 
master themes for all participants from the cross-case analysis to ensure the 
transparency and coherence of the analysis is explicit. The 'fit' between the research 
questions, the philosophical perspective adopted, the method and the analytical 
procedures used are all congruent with the foundations of IPA. This 'fit' has been 
outlined in my discussion of the philosophical underpinnings of IPA and my 
epistemological stance. 
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Procedures 

SaMaling and 12artiCigants 

Purposive sampling was used to select participants who shared the specific 

characteristics outlined in the inclusion criteria below (Patton, 1990). In order to 

recruit volunteers for this research, I posted an advert explaining the purpose of the 

study and its ethical guidelines on a national Jewish website (Appendix 1). Based on 

recommendations from Smith and Osborne (2008) concerning sample size for an IPA, 

six Orthodox Jewish women between the ages of 25 and 45 were selected on a first 

come, first selected basis (see Table I for participant details. ) A further inclusion 

criterion was that the participants had been married for between 1.5 and 20 years. The 

age range and length of time married were selected in order to ensure that women 

were experienced at observing the laws of family purity and also were 

premenopausal. Reflexive considerations concerning the sample can be found in the 

Methodological Reflexivity section in the Discussion. 

The exclusion criteria were women in therapy at the time or within the past two years; 
divorced or separated women; and women who did not adhere to the Jewish laws of 
family purity. 

Name (pseudonym) Marriage Duration (years) Age 

Rina, 6 42 

Karen 14 36 

Laura 18 39 

Katie 2 28 

Stacy 1.5 25 

Becky 10 36 

Table I- ParticiRants (names have been changed to maintain confidentialiM 
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Materials 

Along with my advert, I provided my email address for potential volunteers who 

wished to ask questions or express interest in participating. I was able to respond to 

such emails with an information sheet (Appendix 2), explaining the purpose of the 

study and the ethical procedures in place, so as to ensure that potential participants 

could give fully informed consent. Once they had read the information sheet and 

volunteered, they were contacted via phone to organise interview times. 

A semi-structured interview schedule (Appendix 3) was adopted (Smith & Osborn, 

2008). This comprised a set of open-ended questions devised prior to the interview. 

The schedule was used to guide the interview in a flexible manner, allowing the 

participant to shape it according to their experience of the phenomenon. The 

researcher provided minimal input, using gentle prompts to help keep the topic in 

sight and to encourage the giving of detailed accounts. Close attention was given to 

the wording of the questions, in order that the participants would feel comfortable to 

provide detailed accounts of their experiences. The interviews were digitally recorded 

and then transcribed. 

A pilot interview was conducted on one volunteer in order to ensure that the questions 

were clear and appropriate and encouraged participants to talk openly and in detail 

about their experiences. The material from this pilot was not included in the main data 

set. 

Interview procedure 

I met each participant in a private room of a local synagogue or in their own home, 

ensuring that participants felt at ease to talk freely with minimal distractions. A friend 

accompanied me to each interview and waited outside to ensure my safety. 

At the outset, I went through the information sheet (Appendix 2) with each 
participant, giving them ample opportunity to ask questions. This was in order to 
ensure the purpose of the study was understood and that informed consent could be 

given. Interviewees were then asked to complete a consent form (Appendix 4), a 
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consent to record form (Appendix 5), and a demographics questionnaire (Appendix 6) 

enquiring about the participant's age and marital duration. 

At the end of the interview participants were debriefed. At this point they were asked 

how it was to participate and given an opportunity to ask any further questions. They 

were also given a debrief sheet (Appendix 7) which contained the contact details of 

various counselling services in case the interview had raised any issues or feelings of 

distress. 

Ethical considerations 

This research project gained approval from the University Research Ethics Review 

Panel (Appendix 8). It also got approval from the website commissioners to recruit 
participants through their website. 

Right to withdraw 

Participants were informed of their right to withdraw. My supervisor's contact details, 

provided on the information sheet (Appendix 2), were pointed out to them in case 
they wanted to withdraw or had any complaints they could not share with me. 
Participants were also informed of their right to refuse to answer any questions. 

Confldentiality 

Matters of confidentiality were clearly outlined in the information sheet (Appendix 2), 

and also explained verbally to participants. This included informing them that all 
personally identifying information in both the written transcripts and the final draft 

would be anonymised by my using pseudonyms and changing or deleting any other 
identifying details. They were also assured that the consent forms, recordings and 
transcripts would be held separately from each other in locked filing cabinets so that 

no name could be traced to its recording. Additionally, they were informed that the 

material might be published. 
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Potential distress 

As the topic under investigation is particularly personal and potentially sensitive for 

some participants, caution was used not to push any participants to discuss things that 

they seemed resistant to. This was done by my paying particular attention to non- 

verbal cues indicating emotional distress. In addition, at the end of the interview 

participants were debriefed in an attempt to ensure that they left the interview in a 

similar psychological state to that in which they arrived. 

Analytic procedure 

The analysis followed the IPA procedures devised by Smith (1996) and elaborated by 

Smith, Flowers and Larkin (2009). Initially the recorded interviews were listened to 

and transcribed by the researcher. An iterative process of reading and re-reading the 

transcript to get a sense of the account followed. These readings of the transcript gave 

rise to wide-ranging notes. All observations, themes, questions, summaries, 

interesting language and metaphors pertaining to the data were noted in the left-hand 

margin of the transcript. Subsequent to this, psychological concepts were used to 

make sense of the data. These notes were abstracted to produce emerging theme 

labels, noted in the right-hand margin of the transcript. 

Following the formation of these preliminary emergent themes (see Appendix 11), 

connections between them were identified, allowing for a process of amalgamation 
where similar themes were placed together and a name was found to define the 

cluster, giving rise to superordinate themes. All themes were constantly checked 

against the raw data to ensure they were truly reflective of the participant's 

experience. The superordinate themes were then organised into a table together with 
their constituent themes and quotation references so that illustrations of each theme 

could be traced back to the text (see Appendix 12). At this stage, themes that did not 
illustrate the participants' experience for example, those which were only mentioned 
once were jettisoned. 

This step-by-step procedure was repeated for each individual transcript. Next, a cross- 
case analysis was carried out across the transcripts by creating a lengthy table of all 
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the superordinate themes and the themes that they comprised. The themes that were 
most relevant and prevalent across the participants' accounts were then selected, 
based on their frequency in the data, and "the richness of the particular passages that 
highlight the themes" (Smith & Osborn, 2008, p. 75). This gave rise to a summary 
table of the superordinate themes and their constituent themes, representing a 
mapping of the analysis across all participants. 

Following this, a narrative account was written of the interplay between the 
researcher's interpretative insights and the participants' accounts of their experiences, 
as evidenced through data extracts (Smith & Eatough, 2006). 
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ANALY 

This section presents the results of an IPA of six participants' accounts of adhering to 

the laws of family purity and how they experience this relative to their marital 

relationships. 

Three superordinate themes emerged from the analysis: 

The Period of Separation 

The Mikvah Experiences 

Psychological Messages 

Through what is known as the 'double hermeneutic', IPA recognizes the importance 

of two interpretations involved in the process of analysis: firstly, the participants' 

meaning making, i. e. participants' interpretation of their own experience, and 

secondly, the researchers' sense making, i. e. researchers' interpretation of the 

participant's account (Smith, Flowers & Larkin, 2009). The final double-layered 

hermeneutic analysis is therefore partial and ideally reflexive. 

Given the limitations of space, the themes selected for analysis in this study are those 

that seemed particularly figural and powerful. The narrative interplay presented 

therefore reflects one possible conceptualization of the participants' experiences: 

other researchers are likely to identify different themes. The superordinate themes and 
their related themes are presented in Table I below. 

Superordinate Themes Themes 

Distancing: The Dead Sea 

The Period of Separation Renewal: Simmering Passions 

Protection: A Healing Time Out 

Personal Space: Purification and Rebirth 
The Mikvah Experience Invasion of Privacy: Shame of Exposure 

Return from Mikvah: Adjustment 
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Fearful Emotions: Guilt and Superstition 

Psychological Messages The Silent Promise: Containment 

Gender Bias: Oppression 

Table I: Sul&rordinate themes and their related themes 

Each superordinate theme, together with its theme and subtheme, is explored below, 
illustrated by verbatim excerpts from the transcripts. 

The Rgriod of seRaration 

Overview 

Tbis theme encapsulates the spectrum of the women's experiences of separation 
during the niddah period, in which no physical contact between husband and wife is 

permitted. The women voiced ambivalent and divergent attitudes in reference to this 

theme. The separation was experienced as somewhat challenging for most 

participants, impacting both the individual and the marital relationship. Psychological 

needs remained unmet, particularly as the physical distancing of wife from husband 

led to distancing within other areas of their relationship. However, the negative 

accounts were juxtaposed with positive ones: for example, women experienced the 
benefits of renewed sexual desire and excitement within their marital relationships. 
Furthermore a strong feeling of being protected by the separation period was reflected 

across all accounts. 

Distancing: the Dead Sea 

With the exception of one, the participants describe finding the experience of 
separation challenging. They express the feeling that their needs for physical comfort 
or intimacy are left unmet. Ibis is well illustrated in Rina's account: 

We had a stillborn baby, and that was very hard, not to be able to get a hug 
from your spouse when you're lowest point in your life really. You've just 
been through the worst experience or one ... I'm not going to say worse, I, nI 
sure there are worse but one of the worst experiences in your life and you 
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can't actually get a cuddle. Or get a hug, you know, my husband went to bury 

the baby, and I like, he came back and we couldn't even hug. Yeah. And that's 

very hard (1,2.25-35, Rina2). 

Rina expresses how challenging it was, after giving birth to a stillborn baby, not to 

receive the physical comfort she needed from her spouse as a result of being in 

niddah. A deeper interpretation of Rina's suffering suggested in her reference to the 

"lowest point" conjures up an image of being at the lowest point on earth: the Dead 

Sea, on the Jordan-Israel border, a place where no life can exist, mirroring Rina's 

experience: expecting to give birth to life but rather giving birth to death. 

Rina goes on to place her experience on a spectrum of worst experiences: "the worst 

experience or one ... I'm not going to say worse, I'm sure there are worse but one of 

the worst". She seems to sense the possibility of something even worse happening and 

prepares herself. Moving from "the worst" to "one of the worsf' seems to soften the 

intensity of her pain by generalising it and enabling her to remain mindful of others' 

worse predicaments. 

Rina repeatedly mentions the words 'hug' and 'cuddle'. A likely interpretation for this 

repeated use is that it communicates her desperation for physical comfort. Earlier in 

the transcript she mentions that she comes from a tactile background, which is clearly 

conveyed in her plea for comfort. At a deeper level she might be alluding to her 

intolerable pain and her wish for physical comfort to take away the loss. Her 

repetition of the phrase "that was very hard, " conveys just how difficult it was not to 
have the physical comfort available from her spouse. 

Interestingly, Rina switches between "we" and "you" repeatedly in this extract. There 

are multiple possible readings of this. Firstly, using the second person ensures that the 

reader gains a sense of her experience and pain by being placed in her position. 

2, Key to excerDts from transcriDts 
... Pause over 3 seconds 
[] Material omitted 
[Her husband] Explanatory material added by researcher 
(4.67, Stacy) Page Number/s. Line Identifier/s, Pseudonym 
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Secondly, it might assist her in distancing herself from her account, enabling her to 

talk about such raw emotions. At one point she attempts to use "I" but switches 

quickly to focus on her husband: "and I like, he came back and we couldn't even 

hug". It could be argued here that the vulnerability she felt at that time seems to be 

reflected in her discomfort in using the first person. 

This theme of distancing is also reflected in the other participants' accounts of their 

unmet need for physical comfort, which resulted in distancing in other areas of their 

relationships. For example, Stacy's experience of separation seems influenced by her 

experience of suffering from anorexia in her youth. Although she is now in remission, 
the resultant difficulties she has experienced in her marital relationship seem to be 

exacerbated by her prolonged, erratic menstrual cycles, which lead to longer and more 
frequent periods of separation: 

Also because I was in niddah for such long periods, sometimes you get, you 
turn yourself off and we used to live like we weren't emotionally connected at 

all, because like, because you can't be physically connected, you start to like 

put barriers so that you don't want each other so much and then you just sort 

of like not ... and then when I used to go to the mikvah it was like, oh what do 

we do now? Like, um, not really sure (10,11.328-336, Stacy). 

Stacy describes her experience of separation as a time of distancing within her marital 

relationship and as one that could be interpreted as being challenging from this 

excerpt. She appears to emotionally distance herself from her spouse during the 

separation, finding it difficult to retain any sense of closeness. Her depiction "you tum 

yourself off" creates the image of a tap that she turns off and on. She seems to close 
the physical tap because "you can't be physically connected". Subsequently she also 
closes the emotional tap: "you start to put barriers up". However this method of 
ensuring "you don't want each other so much" leaves her feeling drained of desire for 
her husband. When they do return to intimacy the atmosphere seems to be awkward: 
"like, oh what do we do now? "' Her comments convey a sense of her vulnerability and 
inexperience: "like, um, not really sure". 
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Stacy speaks in the past tense: "we used to live", giving the impression that this 
distancing within the relationship is no longer as extreme, or that she has adjusted to 

the process. Despite this, her account well conveys her experience of being alone 
during these times and of how challenging it was for her to live with someone with 

whom there was no physical or emotional connection. 

Like Rina, Stacy utilises both the first person and the second person in the above 

extract. However, in this instance it seems that when discussing herself she uses the 
first person: "I was in niddah", "I used to go to the mikvah", but when discussing 

matters related to her relationship difficulties she uses the second person: "you get, 

you turn yourseff off', "you start to like put barriers", "you don't want each other". 
This is striking and could be interpreted perhaps as Stacy using the second person to 
distance her from her account, reducing her feelings of guilt and shame that she no 
longer desires her husband. 

Rina discusses a similar experience of distancing in her marital relationship during 

separation: 

I think my way of dealing with it is putting a barrier up. You know, I find I am 
much more ratty with him and I'm more ... kind of business-like with him. I'm 

much more buck buck buck (7.166-169, Rina) 

Rina's difficult experience of separation, elaborated above, appears to impact her 
behaviour towards her spouse. She uses the image of putting up a barrier to depict her 
feeling of being completely separated and distant from her husband. This description 

conjures up the image of something heavy and solid that she can't shift. Her manner 
becomes "bu sines s-li ke" suggesting that her communication becomes abrupt and 
cold: "I'm much more buck buck buck". All this could be interpreted as indicating 
that she adopts a different persona in this situation. 

However, the following quotes indicate the ambivalence and ambiguity in the 
participants' experiences. It seems that it is not all 'Dead Sea' in terms of distance and 
barriers; a new way of relating can emerge out of the separation. 
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Laura speaks of the struggle she underwent in the early years of her marriage: 

The... sort of background of not having any physical contact kind of distanced 

us in other ways too. That's my experience, I don't know if that's ... that's 
definitely not true now (10.265-268, Laura). 

She then goes on to describe how things have changed: 

Now it's the opposite I would say. Now I think that... urn... because those 
times were brief, um, it really is an opportunity for us to get some chatting 
done, actually, which is nice (10.271-273, Laura). 

Laura describes being aware that in the early years of her marriage the physical 
distance resulted in distancing in other areas of her relationship. But after 18 years of 

marriage her perspective appears to have shifted, and she now appreciates the 

opportunity to communicate with her husband. 

In direct contrast to Rina and Stacy's accounts, Karen finds the distance created by 

separation beneficial: 

The times that we're not able to be physical are wonderful times of our 
marriage. As I said at the beginning, our marriage started off that way. Which 

we always feel was a great basis for our relationship. Where we had to talk to 
each other. Find out a lot about each other. We played a lot of games. We 

understood what we... you know, our strengths and our weaknesses (146.43 1- 
438, Karen). 

Karen sees the roots of their relationship being planted and nurtured during the, 
beginning separation phase of her marriage (due to her prolonged menstrual cycle on 
the pill). She used the word "wonderful" in relation to not being physical; this gives a 
powerful sense of how precious this time is/was to her. Other relationship channels 
had to be utilised, as the physical channel was unavailable: "we had to talk" and "find 

out a lot about each othee,. Karen clearly describes this as an invaluable space that 

allowed them to grow as a couple: "we understood what we ... you know, our strengths 
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and weaknesses. " She speaks for both of them, "we", suggesting that this is 

something they have discussed together openly, enhancing the sense of marital 

closeness emanating from her account. 

Seemingly, therefore, this period of separation is not all about distancing. But it also 

appears that developing other methods of relating is imperative. Those women who 

spent more time talking with their spouse during this time of separation seemed to 

maintain their experience of closeness and intimacy. 

Renewal: simmering passions 

Despite the difficulties of separation depicted above, all the women express a 

romantic view that the separation period creates a renewed desire for intimacy within 
their relationships. The separation appears to create a longing for the other which 
helps to fire a simmering excitement for the relationship. Enforced separation means 
that contact, when it occurs, seems to be valued all the more. As a result, the 

relationship is enhanced. 

Katie describes a time in her relationship when she would prolong the time she could 
be intimate with her husband by taking packs of the pill back to back with no breaks, 

enabling her to postpone her menstrual cycle. However: 

I stopped running packs [the pill] into each other because it wasn't exciting 
any more, and I think we kind of lost the excitement altogether, because there 

was no separation (2.55-58, Katie). 

The quote illustrates clearly how these prolonged periods of intimacy left Katie 
feeling at a loss, in fact leading her to return to a monthly cycle of separation and 
intimacy. 

Becky shares this sentiment: 

I do think that if we didn't keep it then ... the periods when [we] didn't actually 
sleep together would probably get longer and longer and I think ... in that sense 
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in that it keeps bringing it back and you keep thinking about it and you know 

it keeps it alive in Your relationship (10.294-299, Becky). 

Like Katie, Becky expresses the view that the separation period restores sexual 

excitement to her relationship. 

Stacy too seems to find some value in separation: 

... I think it's useful, actually. Like I think it ... 
it... it does make you more like 

sensitive to when you can be together. I mean I wouldn't say it makes 

everything perfect or anything like that. But I mean it does mean that for at 

least the first day or so after you can touch again is quite special (2.32-37, 

Stacy). 

In the light of Stacy's earlier accounts, her ambivalence is clear as she refers to the 

separation as "useful". This contrasts with her comment (in a previous excerpt) on the 

negative impact separation has on her relationship. She seems to acknowledge this 
benefit rather begrudgingly, perhaps reflecting her discomfort and hesitancy with 
intimacy. 

Karen illustrates her experience of renewal in her drawn-out description of the days of 
separation: 

And then as you count the days [after menstruation], people are saying ach 
you should be able to go to [the mikvahl ... why do I have to count these days? 
I know full well why. And everybody else I know, knows full well why. 
Because you count the days, day one, day two, day three, day four. Gosh it's 

only day four still and then suddenly at day four you're like hello, this is 
taking a long time. Day five gosh two more days is a long time. Day six and 
seven are so exciting at that point. And then you're there. You're ready 
(163,164.887-893, Karen). 

Karen reveals the process she goes through during the end of the separation Period in 

this evocative quote that conjures up a palpable sense of anticipation and tension. She 
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describes counting the clean days (following menstruation cessation) as conducive to 

fostering her desire. She seems to convey the frustrated part of herself through the 

voice of the other: "people are saying ach you should be able to go" but then reminds 

herself of the benefits: "I know full well why". 

She counts the days out, communicating the process by which her desire and longing 

slowly build. It seems that by day four she unexpectedly feels ready as she shifts from 

enjoying her personal space to wanting to be intimate with her husband. Finally, the 

reader is given the clear sense of her feeling both prepared and excited as she rounds 

the quote off: "and then you're there. You're ready". It could be interpreted from this 

that she is not only physically ready for intimacy but also that she has had enough 

time and space to reconnect with her sexual identity. 

Protection: a healing time-out 

The theme of protection surfaces across all the women's accounts. Protection for most 

seems connected to the period of healing in which the physical wounds of childbirth 

are given space to repair. Alongside such physical healing there also appears to be a 

process of psychological healing. Here the women's accounts convey the experience 

of relief in having the psychological space to adjust to their new identities and be 

excused from sexual obligation: 

I didn't miss sex after I'd just given birth, but I missed all the other aspects of 
a sexual relationship, the, you know, the touching, the holding and so on. 
Sharing a bed. Urn, I do think that, uni however, having said all that there is 

something to be said for a women being left alone with her baby for a couple 
of months, and not feeling that she has to be on call not only for a nursing 
baby but also for a husband and that sounds terrible because it ins ... it kind of 
indicates that you don't enjoy the sexual relationship, which is not what I 

mean, but I definitely mean in the first couple, probably three months after 
you've had a baby, there's definitely something to be said for time out for a 
woman (17.486-499, Laura). 
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Laura expresses conflicting voices in her experience of separation post-childbirth. She 

conveys a longing for the physical relationship: "the touching", "the holding" and 
"sharing a bed". These sentiments communicate a deep need for care and affection 
that is left unmet by her spouse, perhaps explaining her experience of distancing that 

she expressed earlier. However this physical lacking seems to be offset by her 

appreciation for the time she is "left alone with her baby". This time alone relieves 
her from the pressure of being "on call not only for a nursing baby but also for a 
husband", creating the impression that she can manage only one appetite at a time: 
that of "a nursing baby" rather than her husband's sexual appetite. 

Laura goes on to express her guilt: "and that sounds terrible because it ins... it kind of 
indicates that you don't enjoy the sexual relationship". However, she seems to feel 

sufficiently protected to allow herself this experience, and it could be interpreted that 

she speaks with confidence and assuredness when she says I definitely mean in the 
first couple probably three months after you've had a baby, there's definitely 

something to be said for time out for women. " 

Laura speaks in the third person plural in this excerpt, talking of "women" in general 

rather than using the first person. Ibis collective voice might relieve her from any 
unwanted sense of inadequacy at feeling unable to play both the sexual wife and the 

nurturing mother. This period of "time out" is also a time for physical recovery, a 
time when she is healing the wounds of childbirth while also regaining her identity 

and sexual self. Her positive experience of this separation provides her with the space 
and time to adjust to her new role, to her shift in identity from wife to mother. 

LAke LAura, Karen also communicates feeling protected after childbirth: 

I know that the first two months after I had the baby, so we obviously weren't 
together then. And I was so grateful because, you know, you felt horrible and 
disgusting and I had pushed for three hours with this little bubala, so I was 
extremely sore down there (137.207-210, Karen). 

Karen uses evocative language: "you felt horrible and disgusting", to convey the 
result of the birthing experience which she seems to have found difficult due to its 
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length and after effects. She adopts the second person "you", possibly to help separate 

herself from being reminded of these unpleasant feelings. 

Stacy has not had children so her experience of protection is somewhat different: 

it is great from the fact that we can't have, he, don't need any, I don't get any 

attempts from him that I have to reject (22.713-715, Stacy). 

During the separation period, Stacy feels protected and relieved from having to reject 

her husband's sexual advances. Her struggle with her sexual relationship with her 

husband seems to seep out in her account in the way she stumbles with her speech, as 

she moves from "we" to "he", to "I". Another interpretation of Stacy's tripping over 

her words in this way could be that, as she speaks, she recognises that in fact she is 

the one who feels relieved during separation. This contrasts with her account earlier 

where she speaks of the negative distancing effects of separation. 

Katie uses a collective female voice to speak about the benefits of protection: 

I suppose if you've got separation period then the woman's in a way protected 
from that [husband who wants sex all the time] (17.479-480, Katie). 

Perhaps she uses the third person to distance herself from her account, conveying her 

relief that she is protected from this felt sexual pressure. 

Summaa 

The theme of separation illustrates the ambivalent and ambiguous messages expressed 
by the participants in this study regarding the separation period of niddah. The 

common experience of distancing and loss of connection within their marital 

relationships contrasts strongly with the renewed passion and sexual excitement that 

many also describe. The participants also seem to find the separation space protective, 
offering an opportunity for both physical and psychological healing. 
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Following separation, the women immerse themselves in a mikvah before they 

resume physical contact with their spouse. The participants' accounts of their 

experience of this were deeply convoluted: feelings of purification and rebirth 

contrasted with traumatic experiences of shame due to exposure of the self at the 

mikvah. The return home from the mikvah was also described as beset with 
difficulties as the women adjusted from separation to intimacy. 

Mie women speak appreciatively of personal space at the mikvah, making clear that 
they benefit from the opportunity for purification and renewal: 

n__ Ewcause rve got a baby and now it's ... rm just much more busy. When do I 

ever have time to have a bath? Never. So... um ... that's really nice. And yeah. 
So I suppose it's just spiritually uplifting thing as well. You feel ... I feel very 
kind of ... this whole idea of kind of being newbor-like it's like a birth. And 

you're coming out of the water. When Fm plunging into the water, I really do 
feel that, it really feels very nice, because I kind of jump up ... I go in under the 
water, but I also kind of ... let my feet rise up so it's just me and Fm surrounded 
by water. It really does feel a bit like a womb, so it's nice (11.316-325, Katie). 

Katie paints a beautiful and evocative picture of her mikvah experience. Her 

appreciation of the personal time gained indicates how busy her life has become since 
having a baby: evidently having a bath has become a rarity. Katie pauses eight times 
in this extract, perhaps reflecting her experience of slowing down and taking some 
time out at the niikvah. 

Katie's experience of the immersion being "'spiritually uplifting" suggests that she 
feels elevated and closer to God. When she describes being "newbor ... it's like a 
birth", she invokes a vision of her rebirth: she becomes purified and renews both her 
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religious commitments and her relationship. Katie vividly describes her experience of 
66plunging into the water", conjuring up an image of her immersion. A deeper 

interpretation could be suggested: she enters the water in an impure state and perhaps 
feels that she casts away her impurities, as if this water immersion offers a cleansing 

rebirth. She goes on to describe: let my feet rise up so it's just me and I'm 

surrounded by water". This image depicts Katie curling up into a foetal position so 
that she becomes encircled by water that provides her with a protective shell. Her 

experience in this excerpt is clearly intertwined with that of birth: "It really does feel a 
bit like a womb". Perhaps her feeling of returning to the safety of the womb helps her 

feel protected, compensating for those moments when, as a mother, she feels the 

responsibility of being a protector. 

Katie's experience of immersion stands out as profound. In contrast, Becky and Stacy 

seemed regretful that they have not had a more spiritual experience: 

I think it's a shame. I wish there was a way of making the actual mikvah part 
of it more ... lovely and spiritual ... I'm too embarrassed to kind of stand around 
meditating (17.519-523, Becky). 

Becky's short description perhaps reflects her experience of lacking time to meditate 
in the mikvah; this contrasts sharply with Katie's longer explanation of her spiritual 
experience of purification and renewal. 

Stacy appears baffled as to why women who in other respects are not devout adhere to 
the laws of family purity: 

I don't know, like I said, I'm not really very into it, I don't really enjoy it, um, 
I don't feel, I wish, like I think some people must feel some great sense of 
like, awe-inspiring cleanliness or something when they come out of the 
mikvah, some people like wow, it's an amazing experience, and I wish maybe 
I could feel that and I wish I could maybe perhaps know why these people 
who keep nothing else except this, why, why this? (18.572-579, Stacy). 
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Stacy's confusion and lack of feeling and understanding can be interpreted both from 

what she says here and from the way she stumbles through this part of her account. 
She seems deeply frustrated, even stunted perhaps, by her lack of feeling for the 

mikvah, as if longing for a piece of someone else's experience of renewal to hold on 
to. 

For other participants, their personal time in the bathroom was paramount in their 

mikvah experience. They focused little on the mikvah immersion itself. Karen, for 

example, explains how preparing for the mikvah helps her to shift her mind-set: 

Your actions help pretty much to shift your state of mind, without a doubt. 

You know and we all know that. You get dressed up and you feel like 

disgusting during the day and then you go to a wedding at night and you can 

get dressed up, you suddenly feel like a queen now. And you're ready to be 

regal and engaging and enchanting (164.904-910, Karen). 

The contrast between Karen's description of feeling "disgusting during the day" and 
what she feels when she dresses up at night for "a wedding" and a complete new 
identity ("you suddenly feel like a queen") is immense. Her evocative phrase "ready 

to be regal and engaging and enchanting" conveys how transformative she finds the 

experience of using the mikvah space for purification. She shifts her identity from that 

of the daytime busy, "disgusting" mum who has no time to take pride in her 

appearance, to that of a sexual, confident, powerful woman, ready to engage and 
enchant her husband at night. 

Laura and Becky also describe valuing the reflective, personal space provided by the 
mikvah. Laura conveys her relief at being forced to take time for herself- 

It's good to have those times of reflection actually. Life is extraordinarily 
busy; it is in the middle of the day. But you know, the phones are ringing, I 
have a sick mother-in-law, everybody needs cooking, the babies, this that and 

the other. It's a very frenetic lifestyle. So I mean a religious orthodox life can 
IL-P Ve. S0um... so-I ... I like that ... I that I'm demanded. It's demanded of me to 
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make time for myself to do those things, to think about my personal 

relationship with God. I like that (7.197-206, Laura). 

Laura creates a vivid picture of her "frenetic lifestyle" in her manner of speech listing 

the various responsibilities she has and her choice of vocabulary ("this, that and the 

other"). Her use of the word "demanded" is also interesting in this context, perhaps 

conveying that the only way she can take time out for herself is if she is "demanded": 
in other words, she has no choice. 

These sentiments are echoed by Becky: 

The evening when you go, it's kind of your evening out and you know ... and 
often I think in the bathroom that's quite a reflective space and if it's a nice 
space and you're kind of lying in a lovely warm deep bath and no one is going 
to knock on the door and the phone is not going to ring, and that's ... that's a 
really lovely reflective place to be (6,7.185-192, Becky). 

Despite Becky longing for a more spiritual experience, she appears to value the 

personal reflective space. She seems to expect spirituality and purification to be 

something more than just reflection, which is interesting when compared with other 
accounts. For example, Katie seems to find the experience as a whole spiritual, due to 
the physical act of immersion in the water, and Karen also finds the actions of the 

mikvah experience significant. Contrastingly, Becky seems to struggle to use the 

physical aspect of immersion to achieve a sense of spirituality. In this later quote there 
is almost a sense of her making the best of it. She describes it as at least being "a 

really lovely reflective place to be", almost as if trying to temper her disappointment 
in it not being as spiritual as she would like. 

Invasion of privacy: shame of gaosure 

In contrast to the experience of personal space, participants also shared their 
experiences of feeling that in the mikvah their privacy had been invaded, leaving 
them feeling exposed. 
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Becky 9s experience of the mikvah preparation process, depicted above, contrasts 

sharply with her experience of entering into the mikvah water: 

So you're walking down [into the mikvah water] completely exposed and she 
[the mikvah attendant] might be looking at you or she might not. I mean it's 

kind of not relevant but she's looking at my nakedness, but on the other hand I 

feel exposed. I just feel exposed. Whereas some ladies kind of hold up the 

towel as you walk in until you're under the water. They kind of hold it up like 

that, so that you're not, you know ... they couldn't see you even if they looked 

at you. And that's a lot nicer, because you can kind of ... get into the mikvah 

without being watched and kind of get yourself settled without being watched 
(14,15.447-459, Becky). 

Becky paints a picture of herself as vulnerable: "walking down completely exposed". 
This leaves the reader with a sense of how naked she feels under scrutiny. Her 

repetition of the word "exposed" suggests that she feels her privacy has been invaded. 

She refers to herself in the second person at points in the extract, perhaps in an 

attempt to protect her privacy and cover her nakedness by distancing herself from her 

account. Becky's experience of feeling "looked af' and "watched" could be read as 
further indicating a sense of being scrutinized and even judged. Perhaps her emphasis 

on her physical nakedness here could be interpreted as connected with a sense of 

spifitual exposure whereby she feels she is being judged for her religious observance, 

or lack thereof 

Yet another reading of Becky's account suggests that her sense of being physically 
exposed could be intertwined with feeling psychologically exposed. Contradictory 

messages surface: "she might be looking at you or she might not. I mean it's kind of 
not relevant but she's looking at my nakedness, but on the other hand I feel exposed". 
Whilst she endeavours to soothe away her fears she clearly feels both exposed and 
unsafe. 

Stacy, too, conveys the discomfort she experiences at the mikvah: 

54 



Like, I don't really like being naked in front of people. Like, I find it really 

hard to be naked in front of people. And I hate like looking in the mirror and 

stuff like this. So, like, at the mikvah with all this, like mirrors all over the 

place, and people looking at you naked, like, I find it really, like, difficult 

(6.178-183, Stacy). 

Stacy's experience of being naked "in front of people" and "looking in the mirror" 
forces her to confront her feelings of shame at her displeasing body image. Moreover 

she seems to have magnified the experience, speaking of "mirrors all over the place" 

and of not one attendant but "people looking at you naked". This could be interpreted 

as conveying how exposed she feels, along with her halting manner of speech here, 

peppered with the repetitive use of the word "like". 

Perhaps it is Becky and Stacy's experience of exposure that distracts them from 

engaging in a more spiritual mikvah experience, as their thoughts are focussed on 
their physical discomfort. 

Karen is also very sensitive to being exposed and to the need to maintain her privacy. 
Interestingly, in her account she speaks of her fear of invading others' space: 

At one point I was going to a mikvah where you would meet people in the 

waiting area and um ... I very much decided that I did not want to go there, 

even though it was a very nice mikvah, I didn't want to go there. I'd rather go 
to a slightly less nice mikvah and make sure that that was not happening. You 
know, because I didn't wanna ... I didn't wanna engage that way in other 
people's lives. I felt ... a ... you know, I don't want you to know about me but 

even more than that, I don't want to know it about you. I don't want people ... I 

want to feel like this is something that everybody can keep intimate to 
themselves, intimately. Um and I want to be able to preserve other people's 
ability to be intimate and not be somebody who's breaching that for anybody 
else (178,179.1294-1308, Karen). 

Karen's account here seems to be filled with guilt-ridden messages concerning the 
privacy of intimacy and shame about knowing where others are at in their marital 
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sexual cycles. Seeing other women at the mikvah, whose presence signifies that they 

are about to return home and are once again permitted to have sex, evokes in her 

feelings of "breaching" their privacy. This sentiment comes across strongly, 

illustrating the importance she attaches to preserving the privacy of the marital 

relationship. Throughout this part of her narrative Karen utilises the first person "I" 

which could infer her clear ownership of this feeling. 

In direct contrast, Laura appreciates being part of the mikvah club: 

I think there is definitely an understanding between women at the mikvah, 

quite nice. It's like a ... quite like that ... bonding. It's not a ... it's very passive 
bonding. It's not like an active thing (21.624-627, Laura). 

Laura's experience of meeting people in the mikvah appears to be more positive and 

comforting. The private, unspoken membership "passive bonding" seems to give her a 

sense of belonging in the community rather than one of invaded privacy. This 

demonstrates a clear divergence in the experience of these two women in relation to 

this particular theme. 

Retum from the mikvah: adjustMent 

The participants all describe the return home from the mikvah and the subsequent 

shift from separation to intimacy in their marital relationships as a period of 
adjustment. 

Stacy tells of a distinctly traumatic experience: 

I always thought ifs such, it was such a bad start to what was meant to be like 

the beginning of your relationship to, like, together, and like to go to the 

mikvah and me to be all flustered and feeling really rubbish and having looked 

at me in the miffor for the last like three hours and then come home and have 

to be naked in front of someone or whatever and then just found I was coming 
home from the mikvah and saying like just leave me alone, you what I mean, 
like just don't touch me and, um, Eke I always keep my clothes on, and like, it 
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was really hard to like get anywhere cos I'm just not in the mood, like, it's just 

and I was always like oh why do they make such a mood killer before you're 

meant to be in the mood? Like, so it's quite hard (9.264-278, Stacy). 

Throughout this excerpt there is an underlying tone of pain and suffering, clearly 

conveyed through Stacy's manner of speech and what she says. Stacy's experience of 

anorexia and her resultant difficulties with her body image and relational intimacy 

permeate her account. Her mikvah experience and subsequent homecoming seem to 

make her feel like a failure, confirming her low self-esteem. Her vulnerability finds 

reflection in her defensiveness: "why do they make such a mood killer before you're 

meant to be in the mood? Like, so it's quite hard". This conjures up the image of pest 

controllers: just as they lay poison to kill off pests, the mikvah kills off any 

opportunity for Stacy to feel sexual. 

Stacy describes her experience of returning home to her spouse "to what was meant to 

be like the beginning of your relationship". Her premarital expectation of the return 
from the mikvah being filled with excitement and offering an opportunity for a new 
beginning, is left unmet. Instead, she is consumed by "having looked at me in the 

miffor for the last like three hours". This reflects her overwhelming experience of an 

invasive process of bodily scrutiny rather than mikvah preparation as it is meant to be. 

Stacy refers to returning home only to "have to be naked in front of someone". 
There's a sense of her feeling forced into this, and that it feels wrong to her. This 
description of "someone" portrays her husband as a stranger and could be interpreted 

as reflecting her difficulty in adjusting from separation to intimacy. She previously 
spoke about the subsequent distancing she endures following separation in her 

relationship. Her fears become transparent as she comes home: "saying like just leave 

me alone", "like just don't touch me". She attempts to withdraw to protect herself 
from feeling more exposed: "like I always keep my clothes on... " In this way she 
protects herself from more body shame and the reader is left to wonder about the 
impact of this on her relationship. 

In direct contrast with Stacy, Katie and Laura both experience a more positive 
adjustment from separation to intimacy: 
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We're more thoughtful and mindful, kinder towards each other and I 

suppose look forward to, erm, having a physical relationship as well 
(12.356-358, Katie). 

The brevity of Katie's account of her experience contrasts with Stacy's detailed and 

lengthy account, underlining their very different experiences. 

Laura shares her experience of the past thus: 

It was generally very positive. It was fun, we made time, you know, we 
had sex again which was, especially when you're a young couple as, 
exciting when there are no kids around to knock on your door 
(8.221-224, Laura). 

Laura refers to the sexual excitement and desire she and her husband shared as "a 

young couple". The inference is that their sexual relationship was perhaps more 

exciting and alive when they were a young couple without children who "knock on 

your door. This suggests that at this stage of their life together their priorities, and 
their opportunities for sex, are different. 

Yet another element in this experience is articulated by Rina and Becky. Both seem to 
have found the adjustment more testing and express resistance to the obligation or 
expectation of being intimate with their spouse upon returning from the mikvah: 

I used to find it ... certainly at the beginning very strange to be separated from 

your husband and suddenly meant you come home and your husband's 

waiting for you with open arms and-and it all feels very put on. Like okay 
suddenly Fm going to kiss you. Maybe I don't want to kiss you now. I don't 
have to kiss you just because I've got back from mikvah (8,9.213-219, Rina). 

Rina appears to find the shift "sudden", perhaps too quick for her to feel comfortable 
with. She speaks in the past tense: "I used to find it", inferring that this experience 
possibly is now different. There is a sense that it feels too orchestrated and she rejects 
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the felt obligation. This is reflected in the ambiguity at the end of her quote: "maybe I 

don't want to kiss you now". 

Becky expresses a similar sense of resistance: 

Well he gets very excited. And um he 
... 

he always comes and welcomes me 

and makes a big effort to welcome me. Um I wouldn't say that we on the 

whole sleep together that evening, but 
... you know, usually that week we'll 

kind of make time for each other and ... 
but it can take a while to relax after 

that stress mind-set and that stress relationship. So you know that's another 

reason why you know, just because you've been to the mikvah it doesn't mean 

to say that I'm ready to jump... you know ... you have the kind of you know get 

comfortable with your relationship again (11.326-338, Becky). 

Becky conveys her experience of needing time to shift the "stress mind-set and that 

stress relationship", perhaps indicating the challenge of moving so quickly from 

separation to intimacy. Like Rina, she rejects the felt sexual obligation and allows 

herself the time to "get comfortable with" her relationship again, perhaps further 

indicating the distancing effects of the separation. Both Becky and Rina allude to their 

husbands expectation: "your husband's waiting for you (Rina)", "he gets very excited 

(Becky)". This is indicative of their felt obligation of intimacy, yet both explicate 

their hesitation and rejection of this felt pressure, perhaps conveying a sense of their 

vulnerability. 

Summary 

The mikvah theme illustrates clearly the complexity of the women's mikvah 

experiences. The women appear to exist simultaneously at both extremes of the 

spectrum. They express the benefits of the personal mikvah space, the purification 

process and a sense of renewal, even rebirth. But they also share their experience of 
having their privacy invaded at the mikvah, of feeling exposed and ashamed at this 
intrusion into their personal space. Their return home and adjustment to intimacy with 
their spouse seems to be strongly influenced by their mikvah experience; for some, 
this adjustment is smooth, while others find it more challenging. 
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Psycholop&al messages 

Overview 

This theme encapsulates some of the many psychological messages the women 
communicated throughout their narratives: fear, guilt and superstition emanated from 

the accounts. The women expressed their fear of punishment versus their sense of 
feeling protected, which appeared contingent on their observance of the laws. There 

also seemed to be an undercurrent of frustration, as the women grappled with the 

extent to which the laws were experienced as prejudice. However, as with the 

previous themes, there were contrasting voices of negativity and positivity. 

Fear. guilt and sy2erstition 

The women all expressed fears about not keeping the laws. Following the loss of her 
baby, Rina increased her observance of the laws of family purity. Here she explores 
her reasons for this: 

I guess to some extent I guess superstition. I guess I don't know. We'd just 
lost the baby, we'd just ... I thought, gosh, I thought what kind of punishment 
did I deserve for this? You know, like maybe, I don't know. I really don't 
know whether that became very scared of not keeping to it. Um ... I guess I 
don't know (14.372-378, Rina). 

Rina expresses her vague but clearly deep-seated fear that she was punished due to 
her lack of adherence. Her account conveys her difficult experience of loss and her 
attempt to understand her experience. Her use of the word "superstition" reflects her 
awareness of the fear underlying her adherence. However it seems that once she 
accredits her observance to superstition, she goes back to I guess I don't know". It 
could be interpreted here that confusion might feel safer than being motivated by 
superstition; such irrational fears might feel limitless and therefore evoke more 
anxiety than confusion alone. 
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She then communicates her guilt and remorse: "I thought gosh, I thought what kind of 

punishment did I deserve for this"? She seems to grapple with unnamed reasons and 

finally sounds defeated as she says: I don't know. I really don't know whether that 

became very scared of not keeping to it". This suggests her inability to understand or 

conceptualise the reasons for her loss outside the frame of reference of adherence. 

Rina uses that instead of I perhaps to distance herself from the experience, possibly 

reflecting her difficulty in directly linking her guilt at her loss with her fear. 

There is also a paradox here. Throughout the interview Rina talks of the difficulties 

she experiences in relation to adherence and yet she is now more observant than ever 

(hyper-adherence). Perhaps her increased commitment could be interpreted as helping 

her manage her feelings of guilt, her sense that her past actions may have resulted in 

the loss of her baby. She may now feel that she is protecting her family unit by 

adhering to the laws. This defensive function appears to appease her superstitious 
fears and therefore reinforces her need to strictly adhere to the laws in order to ensure 

she does not experience the anxiety of her fears and the pain of her guilt. It could also 
be suggested that these unconscious processes might leave her somewhat perplexed 

about the reasons for her adherence, as is clear from the quote above. 

In contrast Karen sees her observance of the laws as preventative of difficulties rather 
than as a response to problems that have already occurred: 

I just absolutely convinced myself that, that was going to be it. I was going to 
have major fertility problems and-and ... that's also why I was extremely 

careful, trying to ... I was very, very, grateful for this woman's fifteen sessions, 

and I was going to be really, really careful about keeping these laws very 
carefully, because I knew that was a segula [Hebrew word meaning remedy or 
healing power] to have children (134.128-136, Karen). 

Karen vividly portrays her fearful experience in this extract. Her dread of infertility is 

apparent, and it might be suggested that this underlines the value she attaches to 
childbirth. She seems to have clung to the laws to help ease her fears with her strict 
adherence. The emphatic: "really, really careful" seems to embody her need to gain 
control over her fear. Her use of the word segula in relation to bearing children 
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conveys her hope that her strict adherence will help protect her from infertility. 

Through the process of the 15 sessions of premarital teaming, she seems to have 

gained a sense of relief and protection from her fears. 

In reality Karen never suffered from infertility and went on to have six children. It can 
be interpreted from her account that she feels that her adherence to the laws saved her 

from infertility. This appreciation and positive experience of the laws can be seen 

clearly throughout her interview and perhaps clarifies why she went on to teach the 

laws to women who were not religious. 'lliat may have been her way of trying to help 

others through inspiring them to gain the benefits she experienced. 

Becky subtly alludes to her fear of not adhering: 

For me it was really important that we kept it, especially before we had 

children. So that ... and that the children were like conceived in ... in a spiritual 

environment in that sense (13.408-411, Becky). 

Becky highlights the importance of the "spiritual environment" for the moment of 
conception. However she does not elaborate on what this means to her. It could be 
indicative of an unspoken expectation that adhering to the laws acts as a protective 
tool. As she imagines God's blessing being bestowed on the conception in an 
atmosphere of purity and holiness, this perhaps eases her fears concerning the risks of 
pregnancy and childbirth. 

As Stacy does not have children her experience of fear comes from a different angle: 

I don't know if I'm being judgmental or if I'm just really interested, but I just, 
I just wanna know what their logic is like, don't they go to bed really scared 
but that God who they believe in is gonna like, you know punish them for not 
covering their hair, or He's gonna punish them for not doing x, y or z? 
(26.811-816, Stacy). 

Stacy provides us with insight into her religious commitment and devotion, which 
seem underpinned by fear of punishment. Tackling others' relaxed approach to 
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religious adherence she cannot comprehend their belief in God and yet lack of 

observance. Her description "don't they go to bed really scared" conjures up the 

image of a small child fearful of going to bed at night. In this vein, perhaps Stacy, like 

a child, goes to bed frightened of the punishments she may incur if she fails to be 

totally observant. 

The silent promise: containment 

Despite the many challenges involved in adhering to the laws of family purity and the 

undertone of fear expressed above, the women all express feeling contained and 

protected by the framework of family purity. Perhaps they feel contained from their 

fears through their adherence. 

Laura expresses her appreciation of the value and space given to the sexual 

relationship: 

I'm grateful for that, that it's given the space it is, that it ... it ... it's given room, 

that iVs exciting and that change which is what initiated this. Um ... it is 

exciting because sex is an important part of marriage. So there's time for that, 
but there's not ... ifs not all the time. So again, other parts of the relationship 

can develop (9.237-242, Laura). 

Laura's description here could be interpreted as illustrating the significance of timing 

within her sexual relationship. She seems to appreciate that "it's given room" but also 

that "it's not all the time". There is a strong sense that she feels contained by this 

structure, which seems simultaneously to retain the excitement of intimacy whilst 

providing her with space in which "other parts of the relationship can develop". This 

sense of containment through observance is further reflected in her view of Jewish 

law: 

When I look at Jewish law I see a framework for a hopefully healthy, sensitive 
disciplined but not fanatic in an ... you know ... lifestyle (24.693-694, Laura). 
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Whilst Laura sees the framework as positive, she hints that she finds striking a 
balance a challenge. It is interesting that she stops herself from finishing her sentence 

towards the end of the quote and then changes tack. It might be construed that by so 
doing she avoids delving further into the difficult topic of religious fanaticism. She 

quickly retreats to safer ground, leaving the reader to wonder what she might have 

articulated and whether this slip is related to her struggle to maintain a balance in her 

degree of observance. 

Katie also seems to view the laws' imposition of boundaries and limitations as 
beneficial: 

I suppose it does teach you to kind of have 
... be a bit more moderate in terms 

of what you want at all times. And to be able to stop yourself from having, it 

does learn you, teach you to kind of have limitations. To accept limitations or 
boundaries or whatever (17.492-495, Katie). 

Katie suggests that her desire is shaped by having to accept the limitations, to "be a 
bit more moderate in terms of what you want". There's a sense that this can be 

annoying: I suppose it does teach you", as if to say there is benefit, although it might 
be frustrating in the moment of desire. She seems to imply that this ability "to stop 
yourself from having" and "to accept limitations or boundaries or whatever" is useful. 
Perhaps it could be inferred here that she is suggesting adherence to these laws within 
the relationship may make it easier to resist temptations outside the marital 
relationship. 

Karen provides a very rich, detailed description of her appreciation of the laws of 
family purity: 

It gives you a framework for newness, you know, and nobody is wise enough 
to build themselves a framework for newness because that's not how we think 

about life. And I don't know if anybody is really educated in that way. You 

should be looking for healthy newness (141.327-332, Karen). 

64 



Here it could be interpreted that Karen places the laws of family purity on a pedestal. 
Her phrase "nobody is wise enough to build themselves a framework" suggests that 

the laws exist beyond the wisdom of man. Her description of building conjures up the 

image of God creating a blueprint for marital life. This building process requires deep 

insight, understanding and knowledge which, it could be suggested, she views as 

transcending human ability. Thus Karen's experience of feeling contained by the laws 

comes from the way she conceptualises them as a protective Godly framework. There 

is a strong undertone in her account that adhering to the laws will protect her marital 

relationship from adversity. As is made clear throughout her account, her adherence 
imbues her relationship with renewed excitement. 

Karen's emphasis on a "framework for newness", repeated twice in this passage and a 

recurrent theme in her account, could be argued as conveying her fear of boredom 

with the sexual aspect of her relationship. One interpretation might be that the laws 

may ease her anxiety or hush any fears about how to maintain this "newness" within 
her marriage and keep her partner sexually interested. This framework therefore 

appears to create a sense of safety and containment for Karen, an environment in 

which her needs can be met in a healthy way. This may provide insight into her 

unrelenting devotion to the laws. 

Gender bias: o1212ression 

The participants revealed varying experiences of finding the laws oppressive due to 

the focus of the laws on women and their changing status of purity. 

Laura begins by declaring herself to be 'comfortable' with the situation: 

I'm comfortable with it. I'm comfortable with it, but I would understand how 

someone thinks oh, women and bleeding and all that kind of stuff. I don't feel 

that way, because I do see it within a whole system of a male seminal 

emission. I do see it within a whole system of a male seminal emission. Where 

men ... well I think [inaudible 0: 49: 29) do go to mikvah, Um 
... but it's not the 

general traditional thing to do. Okay but it is definitely within a framework, 
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that tahara [ritually clean] stuff which um ... which is part of the system. Um 

again, I do understand that it can look ... it does look (25.724-732, Laura). 

While stating she is "comfortable" with the laws' focus on women, Laura's repetition 

could be argued as indicating that she may be experiencing some discomfort in fact. 

She appears to grapple with others' attitudes to women moving between states of 

ritual purity/impurity: I would understand how someone thinks... " She also seems to 

liken menstruation to men ejaculating in terms of impurity. Her repetition of the male 

seminal emission phrase almost gives a sense of her trying to convince herself here, as 

well as the listener. She then relates that men also do or can go to the mikvah, again 

giving the impression of trying to equalise the sense of a need to purify across both 

genders. 

In the latter part of the quote she states that the "tahara stuff' is "definitely within the 
frameworV and therefore "part of the system". This seems to convey how she 

reconciles in her own mind a woman's need to observe niddah and engage in ritual 

purification. This is despite her apparent general discomfort with the laws' exclusive 
focus on women, expressed in the earlier part of the quote and again in the final 

sentence of the excerpt. That this is a difficult subject for her to discuss and to 

reconcile in her mind is evident in the stumbling and halting nature of her speech. 

Becky, however, adopts a quite different perspective: 

The idea that women, because they menstruate, are in some way impure or 
unclean or... 1 don't know. If you think about that in some ways I find it quite 
offensive. But on the other hand if you look at it from a woman's point of 
view, as something special about women, and don't see it about kind of men 
don't want to touch a woman who's menstruating, but it's about the woman's 
spiritual-I don't know, er-what's the word? Cycle. Then I think that's 

really lovely (7,8.213-222, Becky). 

Becky seems much more certain and clear on this issue than Laura, demonstrated in 
her more definite manner of speech and her clearly and unequivocally expressed 

views. She seems to have reconciled this issue in her mind by developing a more 
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spiritual explanation for the need for women's separation during menstruation. This 

provides her with a convincing, "really lovely" counterpoint to the idea that such 

separation is oppressive. 

There seems to be a spectrum of experiences here, and the women seem in the main 

quite confused and ambivalent about this issue. 

Stacy seems to describe feeling a certain level of oppression: 

I mean, um, it's not, for him it's not a big deal at all and he doesn't have to do 

anything, so he's not the one who has to take a whole evening out from 

whatever to you know, I go to university in the evenings and like, I've had to 

skip lectures to go to the mikvah, it's a bit annoying like, or like you know, 

you have to start with the whole, and like you know, in our old flat we didn't 

have enough hot water to make a bath and then a shower, so I had to take my 
bath like an hour before the shower so that the hot tank, water tank, so it's just 

like even more time wasted, so it's just a bit like Hello? Do you get the fact 

that I'm wasting my whole evening here? Just, you know, it's a bit annoying 
(7,8.219-231, Stacy). 

Stacy's resentment seeps into her account. However its direction is blurred. Is she 

resentful of her husband in general, or of the fact that he does not have to attend the 

mikvah? Or is it the fact that she has to observe the laws in the first place? She 

appears to project her frustration on to her spouse and seemingly feels unheard by her 

husband or that her efforts are not recognised: "it's just a bit like Hello? Do you get 
the fact that I'm wasting my whole evening here? " She appears frustrated by the time 
it takes to prepare for the mikvah. On a deeper level it could be argued that she seems 
to be fighting against the gender bias, the idea that she has this responsibility and 
obligation to purify herself while her husband "doesn't have to do anything". By 

explaining how she has to miss university classes and grapple with the water heating 

system at home, she depicts her frustration in concrete terms. 

She repeatedly uses the words "it's a bit annoying", and this phrase seems quite mild 
compared with the lengthy detail she goes into regarding the facts of the matter. It 
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could be interpreted that she is in fact more than a bit annoyed but feels a need to 

restrain how she expresses this. The same might be said for her repeated emphasis on 

"taking a whole evening out" and "wasting a whole evening". She repeats the word 

"wasted" twice in the quote as well, which might suggest that she feels more strongly 

about this than the quote initially reveals. Indeed, it could be interpreted that at some 
level she sees the ritual purification as a "waste of time". 

Summaa 

The psychological messages conveyed in the women's accounts add depth to our 

understanding of the women's experiences. Despite their fears and frustrations, their 

appreciation of the containment offered by the laws helps us understand their 

unrelenting commitment. It appears that the women may overcompensate for their 
fear of punishment or their lack of previous adherence by hyper-adherence to the 
laws. Interestingly, three out of the six participants mentioned that they taught the 
laws to other women, perhaps reflecting their felt duty to 'pay it forward' by sharing 

with others what has helped them. There is a strong sense of an unspoken promise and 

a view that adherence to the laws offers a supportive marital framework and 
protection from familial adversity whilst maintaining interest and excitement within 
the marriage. Seemingly they feel contained from their fears through their adherence. 
The women appear to exist on a spectrum concerning gender-related oppression, 

ranging from those who are reconciled at one end to those who are resentful at the 
other end. 

SummAa of the analysis 

For most of the participants, the period of separation resulted in distancing in their 

marital relationships as their intimacy needs were left unmet and subsequently they 

adopted distinct personas. This experience seemed to be contingent on the couples, 
ability to utilise verbal communication to retain a sense of intimacy and closeness 

within their marital relationships. The distancing was juxtaposed by accounts of 
renewal in which the participants expressed their sense that separation allowed for a 
renewal of passion and excitement within their marital relationships. They also 
expressed the protection they derived from the physical and psychological healing 
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space which separation offered. As regards the mikvah, contrasting voices of joy and 

pain were expressed. Whilst most participants appreciated the personal mikvah space 

and found it offered them an opportunity for purification and rebirth, this was offset 

by the challenges some experienced as they felt their privacy was invaded and they 

felt exposed. This in turn seemed to impact the women's experiences of returning 

home to their husbands. For some, the shift from separation to intimacy was exciting, 

whilst for others this adjustment was somewhat challenging. The women's adherence 

seemed underpinned by fear of punishment and adversity. However they found solace 

and containment from their fears through their strict adherence to the laws. The 

women grappled with the notion of oppression, existing on a spectrum from resentful 

to reconciled. Within each theme the women's accounts diverge and contrast, 
highlighting the costs and benefits for them personally and for their marital 

relationships. A common thread in all their accounts, however, is their unrelenting 

commitment to the laws. 
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DISCUSSION 

The purpose of this study was to investigate, from a phenomenological perspective, 

participants' experiences of adhering to the laws of family purity and possible impacts 

on the marital relationship. Through utilising the double hermeneutic processes within 
IPA (Smith, 1996), this study has revealed the complexity and depth of such 

experiences for this sample, suggesting a sophisticated weave of contrasting voices as 
the women reflect on the costs and benefits of their adherence. 

717hree main themes emerged from the analysis. In this section, each will be evaluated 
in the light of previous research, highlighting the novel elements and insights thrown 

up by the current study, as well as the overlap with previous studies. It will also 
attempt to identify the potential influence of the participants' experiences on their 

marital relationships and the clinical implications of the research findings, both for 

counselling psychologists and for the multicultural counselling psychology literature. 

Following this, the study's limitations will be presented, and the section will end with 
an exploration of methodological and personal reflexivity. 

Sg2aration and the marital relationshi 

DistanciM 

The women in the current study presented the period of separation as paramount in 
their experience of adhering to the laws of family purity. They highlighted the 

challenges they encountered, as for most their needs for intimacy and comfort were 
left unmet resulting in distancing in their marital relationship. This aspect of their 

experience can also be seen in the small amount of literature that examines 
observance of the laws of niddah. 

For example, in their analysis of 380 women's questionnaires, Labinsky et al. (2009) 
touched upon the theme of distancing emphasised in the present study. In response to 
questions about mikvah attitudes, the women in Labinsky et al. 's study expressed 
sentiments about their husbands withdrawing from them during the niddah time, 
leaving them feeling rejected. Interestingly the theme of such rejection did not emerge 

70 



during the course of the present study. However if one examines the accounts, the 

women could be viewed as the ones rejecting their spouses, through the distancing 

behaviours they manifest. This can be seen explicitly in Rina and Stacy's accounts as 

they describe adopting cold, abrupt modes of communication with their husbands 

during periods of separation. This suggests that perhaps during the separation period 

individuals in this group adopt distinct negative communication patterns with their 

spouse, which could lead to partner dissatisfaction and further distancing. 

Comparing the present study's findings with those of Labinksy et al. 's (2009) 

investigation is problematic due to the weaknesses within their research highlighted 

earlier (see the Introduction). Whilst they suggest that the women in their study 

experienced emotional difficulties resulting from their observance, there is no detail 

about the percentage of their participants who felt so, nor do they offer any 
interpretation of these problems. Their study explores neither the significance of this 

theme in the women's experience of separation nor the subsequent difficulties it 

appears to pose for their marital relationship. 

However, Labinksy et al. (2009) received 380 responses to their questionnaires, and 
these provide useful insights into this under-researched topic. 

Approximately one quarter of Marmon's (1999) 46 participants also suggested that 

emotional distancing occurred during separation due to an increase in tension, and 

arguments as well as a lack of physical reassurance and support from their spouse, 
These findings support those of the present study. 

Hartman and Marmon (2004) suggest that the women in their study felt suffocated by 

niddah requirements, including separation, which they argue acted in "violent 

opposition to their psychological and emotional health" (p. 396). This finding stands in 

contrast to the accounts of separation presented in the present study. Hartman and 
Marmon's arrival at such harsh conclusions, however, may be a result of the feminist 

perspective they held, which could be argued as biased towards more oppressive 
interpretations. 
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One possible conceptualisation of the present participants' experiences of separation 

could be that their unmet needs for emotional and physical intimacy left them feeling 

vulnerable. Subsequently they engaged in distancing behaviours from their spouse to 

protect themselves from further feelings of vulnerability. It can be argued that this is 

seen explicitly in Stacy and Rina's accounts: they appear to react negatively towards 

their spouse, engaging in abrupt, cold and aggressive behaviours, at times displaying 

angry withdrawal during the periods of separation. 

Interestingly such responses feature in research on attachment. Hollist and Miller 

(2005) suggest that individual functioning and ability to regulate emotions within 

romantic relationships are linked to adult attachment styles. West and Sheldon-Keller 

(1994) elaborate upon Bowlby's attachment terms from the Adult Attachment 

Inventory (p. 103). They describe the attachment category of the disorganised adult 
who could be argued to display similar behaviours to those of Stacy and Rina, 
including angry withdrawal from their attachment figure, negative reactions to the 

perceived unresponsive and unavailable attachment figure and generalised anger 
towards their attachment figure. Perhaps the separation behaviours expressed by some 
of the women in the present study, and their inability to retain a sense of closeness 
when their attachment figure was unavailable (i. e. when physical intimacy with their 

spouse was prohibited), may have been impacted by their attachment experiences. 

Perhaps we can further speculate that during separation Karen's more positive 
experience of closeness to her spouse might be reflective of a more secure attachment 
style. Interestingly, although separation in the beginning stages of Laura's marriage 
was described as causing distancing, later in life she appeared to value the separation 
period, no longer finding it distancing as before. When making links between 

attachment styles and marital functioning, then, it appears that individuals can come 
to earn a secure attachment, as new experiences can revise working models (Paley, 
Cox, Burchinal, Payne, 1999). A secure partner can help a less secure one regulate 
their emotions and therefore adjust their attachment style, not by cancelling previous 
effects but by facilitating revisions (Payley, et al. ). Hence Laura, who was married for 
18 years, could be argued to have perhaps revised her attachment style (Hollist & 
Nfiller, 2005). 
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Although these speculations offer novel insights, the relationship between attachment 

styles and marital functioning is complex and beyond the scope of this study. 

However this observation has highlighted a worthwhile area for further research: the 

possible link between the women's early models of attachment and their subsequent 

experience of intimacy and separation when adhering to the laws of family purity. 

This would be of significant interest to counselling psychologists working with 

couples adhering to similar practices. Understanding the role attachment plays in their 

separation experiences and reunion responses could be important in the treatment 

formulation and interventions adopted. Moreover it would help us understand whether 

it is the separation itself that is specifically challenging for the relationship, or the 

subsequent change in behaviour that participants adopt during separation. If 

behavioural changes cause difficulties then perhaps these can be directly targeted in 

therapy. This is elaborated upon in the section on clinical implications below. 

The current study can therefore be seen to expand upon the previous studies reviewed 

above by highlighting the importance of separation for the marital relationship, in 

particular the theme of distancing. It offers fresh insights into the psychological 

consequences of separation, highlighting an area where couples may engage in 

dysfunctional communication patterns which seems to cause distancing and 

withdrawal from the marital relationship for this sample of women. 

Renewal 

The women in the present study expressed ambiguous and ambivalent voices about 

separation. Their negative experiences of distancing contrast with their positive 

experiences of renewal. All felt that the physical distance fostered a renewal of 

passion and excitement within their physical relationships; it fired their longing to be 

together. Significantly, over 50 percent of Marmon's (1999) 46 participants indicated 

a sense of rejuvenation in their sexual lives resulting from separation, thus supporting 
this finding. Similarly, three-quarters of Labinsky et al. 's (2009) sample believed that 
following the laws of family purity improved their sexual lives. However, it can be 

argued that the nuance and detail that have emerged in the accounts of the six 

participants in the current study highlight the advantage of using a qualitative 
methodology (Willig, 2001) over the quantitative methods used by Labinsky et al. 
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Labinsky et al. (2009) propose a link between the separation period and enhanced 

sexual frequency, further strengthening the validity of the renewal theme that 

emerged from the current study. Thirty-five per cent of Labinsky et al. 's participants 

reported having sexual intercourse three to six times per week, in contrast with 
Lauman et al. 's (1999) figure of 17 per cent in the general population. Labinsky et al. 

suggest that this increased frequency is linked to the fact that observing couples 

concentrate sexual intimacy into the two weeks available to them every month. The 

participants in the present study clearly voiced accounts of their renewed sexual 

excitement and interest in their spouse following the separation period. This might 

explain why Labinsky et al. note increased levels of sexual frequency contrasted with 

the general population (which does not observe separation periods). However, it must 
be noted that a large number of Labinsky et al. 's participants reported having 

intercourse once a month or less. This indicates that other factors may influence 

sexual frequency and that separation may enhance frequency only for some couples. 
Unfortunately, the failure of Ubinsky et al. to specify the percentage of participants 

who reported lower sexual frequency leaves us with incomplete evidence for this 

claim. Nonetheless, this highlights an interesting area for future research: the extent to 

which separation leads to enhanced sexual frequency and whether this can be linked 

to marital satisfaction. 

Protection 

The women in the present study spoke of the emotional benefits they derived from the 
protective space accorded to them by separation. Marmon (1999) also found that the 
women in her sample frequently mentioned the emotional and physical benefits of 
separation, thus further enhancing the robustness of this finding. Similarly, Hartman 

and Marmon (2004) document their informants' appreciation of the nonsexual sphere 
within their marital relationship, which is seen as offering them personal time-out and 
the sexual power to say no. However, these researchers focus on the empowerment- 
oppression dichotomy, seeing the expressed benefits as a possible form of resistance 
to the patriarchal silencing of women. This contrasts with the current study's focus on 
the women's experiences and their marital implications. 
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The theme of protection is also consistent with the findings of Labinsky et al. (2009). 

Two-thirds of their 380 respondents mentioned feeling relief about being in niddah. 

One-third of them reported feeling such relief every month while roughly a quarter of 

all respondents postponed going to the mikvah for emotional reasons. However, 

Labinsky et al. do not elaborate on why the women felt relieved or what this meant to 

them. In contrast, the present study explicitly draws out the value of the psychological 

and physical protection provided by separation. Niddah is shown to offer the women a 

protective space, relieving them of their felt sexual obligation and providing an 

opportunity for both psychological and physical healing. 

The present study therefore emphasises the importance of separation in participants' 

experience of observance. In contrast with previous research, it also highlights the 

psychological impact of separation for the individual and their marital relationship. 
The clinical implications are explored below. 

Clinical iMplications 

The theme of separation highlights distancing as an important component of the 

women's experience. Although renewal and protection emerge as equally important 

themes, it is the distancing experienced by this group of women which appears to 

have the most negative impact on them and their marital relationship. Some 

participants adopted distinct personas, becoming more abrupt, cold and negative 
during the separation period. This highlights the importance for couples adhering to 

the laws of separation during menstruation to have an opportunity to reflect on the 

behaviours they adopt, in order to address possible dysfunctional coping behaviours 

and find alternative ways to remain connected to their spouse during physical 

separation. 

Counselling psychologists might consider helping couples develop an awareness of 
the importance of working on their emotional connection during separation periods, 

rather than accepting it as a time of complete distancing. Couples could be 

encouraged to utilise communication training skills (Baucom & Epstein, 1990; 
Guemey, 1977) in order to better convey their feelings verbally and maintain a sense 
of closeness to their spouse during separation. 
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Baucom and Epstein (1990) suggest that unmet intimacy needs can have a negative 

impact on the couple: they may subsequently engage in negative reciprocity. 

Therefore working with a couple's attributions (Kirby, Baucom. & Peterman, 2005) 

may help them determine what aspects of their partner's behaviours are necessary for 

observance and which behaviours, can be altered. Such a strategy aims to modify 

negative attributions, reduce negative behavioural responses and highlight areas of 

behaviour which may be amenable to modification. This is significant not only for 

counselling psychologists working with orthodox Jewish women but also for those 

working with women of other religious faiths that adhere to the practice of separation 
during menstruation. 

The attachment perspective offers another treatment lens: counselling psychologists 

might assist couples with insecure attachment styles adhering to separation practices, 
by integrating attachment focused interventions into the treatment plan. Emotionally 

responsive therapists who offer clients a safe, reliable and stable relationship with 

clear boundaries will assist clients with affect regulation (Bowlby, 1988; Holmes, 

2001; Mallinckrodt, Gantt & Coble, 1995), providing the safe environment necessary 
for therapy to progress. In this way individuals might be able to learn to manage 

separation within the therapeutic relationship, developing their skills, in order to 

respond more functionally to the separation within their marital relationships. 

Mkvah ex2Ln: ences and the marital relationship 

The present investigation also sheds new light on how women's experiences at the 
mikvah may influence their return home and readjustment to sexual intimacy. Many 

of the women in the current study expressed the view that the mikvah offered them an 
opportunity for purification and rebirth. This theme is conspicuously echoed in the 
findings of Labinsky et al. (2009), where two-thirds of their respondents found the 
ritual immersion religiously enhancing and referred to a rebirth experience that is very 
similar to that cited by the present sample. Hartman and Marmon (2004) also briefly 

allude to the rebirth experience in one of their participant's accounts. This suggests 
that this particular flnding about the mikvah experience is robust. 
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As in the present study, Labinsky et al. (2009) discerned contrasting voices, with a 

quarter of their respondents finding the mikvah experiences unpleasant. Amongst their 

negative responses can be found sentiments identical to those expressed by some in 

the current study, with participants speaking of being ashamed and exposed as their 

privacy was invaded. Similarly some of the women in Marmon's (2008) study 

mention the discomfort caused by the presence of the mikvah attendant. 

Contrasting voice 

The current study, in common with the previous research (Labinsky et al., 2009; 

Hartman & Marmon, 2004; Marmon, 1999,2008), highlights the mixed messages 

emanating from women adhering to this type of religious observance. The women in 

the present study find separation both challenging and beneficial. They find the 

mikvah both a safe personal space for reflection and a time of shame and exposure. 
Many of the women in Hartman and Marmon's study spoke about the negative 

elements of niddah, yet concluded by emphasising the value they found in adhering to 

the laws and in being part of a religious community. Across these studies there 

emerges a sense that women's adherence to the laws is unshakably firm, irrespective 

of any negative aspects. 

These mixed messages and conflicting voices can perhaps be better understood with 

reference to the work of Guterman (2006,2008), who found that modem orthodox 
Jews experience an identity conflict, indicated by their transgressions of some of the 
laws during the two weeks of niddah. Schachter (2002) proposed that modem 

orthodox Jewish young adults are susceptible to this identity conflict, especially in 

relation to their sexuality. These youths view life from two perspectives: a religious- 
traditional one and a modem-Westem one. This dual perspective surfaces in their 

accounts of premarital sexual behaviour, which they view as both "extremely wrong" 
and "not such a big deal" (p. 422). Schachter's respondents seemed well aware of this 
double perspective, which appears to reflect the simultaneous attraction of tradition 
and modemity within contemporary Jewish orthodoxy (Schachter, 2002). 

Such conflicting voices also appear within the present study, suggesting that perhaps 
the women's experiences are underpinned by identity conflicts which find expression 
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in the dual messages conveyed in their accounts. This may well be an unconscious 

process, as none of the women spoke of feeling this conflict or sense of confusion. 

Nonetheless, all conveyed their experience of living with contrasts. 

Ribner (2003) propounds that such identity conflict leaves modem orthodox married 

couples feeling conflicted about sexual behaviour. While growing up they have been 

taught that sex before marriage is forbidden, but within marriage it is permissible and 
in fact praiseworthy. Then, during niddah, sex again becomes seen as wrong; 

subsequently, post niddah, it becomes encouraged. This perhaps results in conflicts 
that may lead to religious transgression. Moreover, modem orthodox couples attempt 
to combine Western values and ideas of love, marriage and sexuality with the 
limitations imposed by niddah, resulting in similar tensions. Ribner further suggests 
that reinstating sexual intercourse on the night of the mikvah may prove 
inharmonious, as it requires the operation of an internal on/off switch beyond the 

ability of some couples. This difficulty of shifting from separation back to intimacy 

was also described as challenging by women in the present study, some of whom did 

not resume intercourse upon their mikvah return. 

Difficulties adjusting back to intimacy are also highlighted in some of Labinsky et 
al. 's (2009) accounts. While Labinksy et al. allude to the difficulties women 
experience at the mikvah and in the return to intimacy, the authors do not explicitly 
conclude that the mikvah has a direct bearing on adjustment back to intimacy. This is 

something that the present study identifies as occupying a central place in the process 
of adjustment, with important clinical implications discussed at the end of this 
section. 

Trauma rewtion 

Smith et al. (2009) argue that "it is in the nature of IPA that the interview and analysis 
will have taken you into new and unanticipated territory" (p. 113). The women in the 

current study, as well as those in previous research, indicate that mikvah experiences 

can be both extremely beneficial and deeply traumatic. 
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In Green's (1990) description of the various dimensions to traumatic stress, she notes 

that these include receiving a threat to one's bodily integrity. At the mikvah it seems 

that some women experience such a threat to their bodily integrity by being naked and 

thus open to scrutiny. Upon their return home, the women who felt threatened, 

exposed and shamed seemed to withdraw from their spouse, avoiding intimacy and 

feeling both low and angry. 

Frederikson, Chamberlain, and Long (1996) suggest deficits in expression or self- 

disclosure can result in detachment, distancing, isolation and conflict. These 

sentiments were evident in some of the women's accounts of returning from the 

mikvah, where they seem to withdraw from their spouse, opening the way to 

distancing and isolation. Moreover some of the women discussed feeling angry and 
irritable upon their return from the mikvah. Irritability has been identified as 

significant in reducing the motivation of a partner to offer support (Lane & Hobfoll, 

2002; Mills & Turnbull, 2004). This lack of spousal support might in turn reinforce 
the women's experience of vulnerability and distance, making the adjustment back to 
intimacy even harder. 

These findings offer another lens through which to view the experiences of the 

women in this study. It may be that the more exposed, vulnerable and traumatised 

they feel at the mikvah, the more they engage in distancing behaviours, on their return, 
thereby rendering more difficult their adjustment back to intimacy. However, it is 

possible that a woman's general marital satisfaction, rather than her experience of 
trauma at the mikvah, is the major influence on her experience of adjusting back to 
intimacy with her spouse. Hence no direct conclusions can be drawn from the 

contrasts depicted here. 

Clinical iMplications 

The adjustment back to intimacy for the participants in this study has been highlighted 
as an area of difficulty impacted by the women's experience of distancing following 

separation and experience of trauma at the mikvah. 

The distancing that occurs during separation appears to impact the ease with which 
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couples readjust back to intimacy. In order to minimise this difficulty counselling 

psychologists could work with couples to help them retain their sense of marital 

closeness during the separation period. Encouraging couples to share thoughts, 

feelings and attitudes throughout the separation time (Finkenauer & Hazam, 2000) 

would aim to reduce marital distancing and provide space for self-disclosure about 

challenging aspects of observance, such as the mikvah experience. 

As suggested in the present accounts, the women's experience of feeling exposed and 

vulnerable at the mikvah impacted their return home and adjustment to intimacy with 
their spouse. To ease this transition, perhaps counselling psychologists could help 

couples devise an individualised reunion plan, so that the return to intimacy is not 
immediate, but rather a slow process meeting the specific needs of the couple. A 

stepped plan for returning to intimacy might offer the women some time to feel safe 
and contained in their relationships prior to intimacy, in turn reducing their need to 

engage in distancing behaviours. 

Psy-chological messages 

The use of EPA in the current study has revealed novel psychological themes not 
evident in other research as well as further insights into previous conclusions. It is 

argued here that these help to develop our understanding of the participants' 
experiences of observing the laws of family purity. 

Fear and containment 

The women's adherence appeared to be motivated in part by fear of adversity, guilt 
and memory of prior punishments. A degree of superstitious belief also seemed to 
motivate the women to maintain their commitment to the laws, perhaps as a means to 
appease their fears and allow them to feel that they were protecting their families. In 

religious mental health research, fear has been conceptualised as an extension of the 
religious framework, as it is seen as a significant motivator Of compliance 
(Narramore, 1979; Brent, 1994), emanating from an emphasis on punishment (Elias, 
1974; Shaver, Lenauer, & Sadd, 1980). This suggests that fear plays a significant role 
in religious commitment. 
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The women expressed feeling safe and contained by the boundaries and framework 

that the laws imposed on their sexual lives. This could be interpreted as the flipside to 

fear. Fear seemed to drive their adherence, which in turn offered them a feeling of 

safety and containment, in turn appeasing their fears. The safety instilled by the law- 

imposed boundaries brings to mind the principles of attachment. The women 

repeatedly referred to the benefits of the imposed boundaries. This seems reminiscent 

of Authoritative Parenting, also known as Boundaried Parenting (Baumrind, 1978), 

which sets clear, consistent boundaries for children. Here, parents are attentive to their 

children's needs, will typically forgive the child if standards are not met and will 

guide the child to learn better practice (Santrock, 2007). This parenting style is seen to 

help children develop self-esteem (Baumrind, 1978). To an extent, the women's 

experience of feeling safe and contained by the laws mirrors the authoritative 

parenting model. God offers a clear framework for the women's sexual lives, possibly 

similar to the structure boundaried parenting offers children. This framework thus 
helps women develop feelings of confidence and safety in their marital sexual 

relationships. 

The question of the extent to which religion benefits mental health is controversial 
and well beyond the scope of this investigation. However, it is important to note that 

religion has been indicated as a potential protective factor against mental illness 
(Ellison, Burr, & McCall, 1997). Koenig, McCullough, and Larson (2001) found that 
in a meta-analysis of 101 studies exploring the link between religiosity and mental 
health, two-thirds of participants reporting high levels of religiosity reported lower 
levels of anxiety and depression. Research has also established a positive correlation 
between religious beliefs and practices and greater life satisfaction (Koenig et al., 
2001). In addition, religion has been found to offer comfort rather than strain in 

people's lives (Exline, Yali, & Sanderson, 2000). Such findings perhaps account for 

why the women in the current study persist in their adherence, despite the challenges 
involved. It may be that in some way their adherence offers protection against 
challenges to their mental health. 
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Oppression 

While the women in the current study revealed an awareness of the issue of 

oppression, in the main they were quite confused and ambivalent about whether they 
found the laws oppressive. The women's narratives revealed a spectrum of responses, 
from the reconciled to the resentful and this spectrum of views is also evident in the 

research of Hartman and Marmon (2004). The women in their study grapple with the 

notion of oppression, often raising the issue in an unprompted fashion. They 

communicate their desire not to view themselves or be viewed by others as oppressed, 
while at the same time revealing a certain amount of confusion and ambivalence. 

In the present study some women seemed to experience cognitive dissonance: a 
feeling of discomfort resulting from holding two conflicting ideas in mind 
simultaneously, motivating the individual to alter their attitudes, beliefs or actions in 

order to reduce dissonance (Festinger, 1957). Perhaps in an attempt to minimise this 
conflict, some resisted engaging with the concept of oppression. For example, Becky 

chose to adopt a spiritual perspective, perhaps reflecting her need to reconcile this 
issue in her mind. Laura emphasized her belief that purification applies equally to 
both sexes, perhaps using this to reduce her sense of oppression. But others clearly 
voice resentment, reflecting their sense of an oppressive gender bias. 

Feminist research has generally highlighted, and adopted a critical stance towards, the 
strictures surrounding the menstrual taboo (Baskin, 1985, Wenger, 1998/1999, 
Plaskow, 1990). However, the current study offers a rather different perspective. By 
shedding light on the lived experience of women who live under these systems, it 
reveals that while such women do indeed grapple with the notion of being oppressed, 
they hold diverse viewpoints on this question. In fact, some women appear to derive 
psychological benefits from their adherence, as their fears are kept at bay and they 
find safety and containment through their observance. 

Second 12erson narration 

Regarding the use of language in the present study, it is interesting to note the 
frequency with which participants utilised the voice of the second person. Brown and 
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Gilligan (1992) and Gilligan et al. (1988) note that dissociation of this type, absenting 

the self completely as a first-person voice from one's own account, signifies inner 

discord and unresolved conflicts concerning the experience. Demjen (2011) proposes 

that it is suggestive of emotional depth, emotional distancing, an inner split and self- 

alienation. Margolin (1990) posits that speaking in the second person allows the 

speaker to speak to him/herself, creating an opportunity for internal dialogue. It can 

also reflect a process of emotional distancing from the event (Fludernik, 1994). 

These considerations add depth to possible interpretations of the participants' use of 

the second person during the current research. The women may have used the voice of 
the other to distance themselves emotionally from what they were sharing. Moreover, 

the women displayed inner splits, reflected in the mixed messages of the positives and 

negatives of their adherence. Using the second person may also have been an attempt 
to distance themselves from their accounts in effort to protect their privacy. In 

addition, engaging the voice of the other may have helped them manage their 

experience of cognitive dissonance. 

Counselling psychology: implications 

The current research is argued as having important implications for the multicultural 
counselling psychology literature and for counselling psychologists working with 
individuals and couples across cultures. To date, this is the first piece of research 
conducted from a counselling psychology perspective on UK orthodox Jewish women 
and their experiences of adhering to the laws of family purity. Moreover, it explicitly 
explores the possible psychological impacts of such observance on the marital 
relationship and offers clinical implications that could be incorporated into the 
treatment of such clients. 

The insights proposed shed light on orthodox Jewish culture and associated marital 
practices. Not only does this research add to the knowledge of an arguably under- 
researched minority group, it also challenges some of the present stereotypes 
surrounding this group and their customs by providing a deeper understanding of 
Jewish culture and the practices orthodox Jews adhere to. This research assists 
counselling psychologists in their journey toward developing multicultural 
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competencies, specifically in "understanding the worldview of the culturally different 

client" (Sue et al., 1982, p. 481), thereby ensuring that treatment does not contradict 
the client's value system or limit the therapeutic benefits and outcomes (Bergin, 1980; 

Cunningham, 1983; Gass, 1984; Kuyken, Brewin, Power, & Furnham, 1992). 

Through understanding these women's experiences in context, the level of therapeutic 

empathy, understanding and acceptance (Rogers, 1957) offered to clients is enhanced 
and "appropriate intervention strategies and techniques" are more likely to be offered 
(Sue et al., 1992, p. 48 1 Gaw, 1993; Jenkins, 1994). 

Whilst this study recognises that society is increasingly culturally diverse (Sue, 1991; 

Sue & Sue, 1990) and that techniques and approaches need to be specifically adapted 
for distinct racial and ethnic minority populations (Ibrahim & Arredondo, 1986; 

Smith, 1982; Sue, 1990; Sue & Sue, 1990; Sue et al., 1982), it also clarifies that 

marital practices of separation during menstruation are evident across several 
different religions. Therefore the present findings can be argued to have transcultural 
implications. Hence, they should prove helpful to any counselling professional 

working with couples adhering to such practices. 

This study highlights its participants' unrelenting commitment, to the laws. In so 
doing, it reinforces the point that interventions should not encourage religious clients 
to move away from their observance: rather the treatment plan needs to accommodate 
a client's cultural values and beliefs. The need for this level of cultural sensitivity is 

evident in Ribner's (2003) work treating orthodox Jews in sex therapy, in which he 
highlights the difficulties encountered when treatment conflicts with the value system 
of the Jewish client. Ribner discusses a significant challenge which presents itself in 
Jewish law, namely the prohibition against male extra-vaginal ejaculation. This law 

poses difficulties for sexual treatments protocols that encourage extra-vaginal 
ejaculation. As Ribner emphasizes, clinicians working with this client group will be 
hard pressed to encourage treatment practices that act in opposition to these laws and 
therefore the therapist must acquire an understanding of these values and use a 
creative array of interventions or adaptations to existing interventions to ensure 
treatment does not conflict with the client's value system. 
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In a similar vein when sexual matters or where emotional difficulties become extreme 

as a result of observing the laws of family purity, or treatment conflicts with 

adherence, the counselling psychologist working with the observant would be 

encouraged to consult with the client's Rabbi about the treatment plan. The Rabbi 

could then make a legal decision specific for that person concerning their observance 

and treatment (Donin, 1972). In such circumstances, the counselling psychologist 

must be prepared to give the Rabbi the problem formulation, onset, duration, the 

efficacy of the intervention and treatment plan required, in order to assist the Rabbi in 

his understanding of the problem. Whilst consulting with the rabbi, it is crucial that 

the therapist is open to adapting the treatment plan to ensure client cooperation 

(Ribner, 2003). The rabbinic consultation would be imperative in order for a suitable 

therapeutic plan to be devised, one that is culturally sensitive and ensures treatment is 

optimal. This implication is transcultural; encouraging counselling psychologists 

working across various religious and cultural groups to consult the religious leader 

(with the client's consent) when treatment methods may come into conflict with a 

client's value system. 

Another significant implication when working with an individual or couple 

experiencing difficulties associated with their observance of the laws pertains to the 
individual's understanding of the law. Many couples are misguided in their 

understanding of Jewish law's perspective on sexuality (Ribner, 2003). This may 

result in their adherence being unnecessarily extreme and dysfunctional, subsequently 

contributing to serious individual and marital difficulties. For example, if a woman 

misunderstands the guidelines for mikvah preparation, perhaps as a result of obsessive 

compulsive tendencies, her cleansing behaviours might become punishing, resulting 
in her spending several hours preparing and scrubbing her body until her skin 
becomes raw and wounded. Should the religious prohibitions and rituals in sexual 
relationships also be a novel area for the therapist, they would not necessarily be able 
to determine the appropriateness of this behaviour. It is therefore up to the culturally 
sensitive counselling psychologist to become familiar with these restrictions, perhaps 
again assisted by rabbinic consultation, so that they can more easily distinguish 
between legitimate cultural norms and behaviours symptomatic of pathological states 
(Cunin, Cunin, & Cunin, 1992; Ribner, 2003). The counselling psychologist would 
need to develop a trusting therapeutic alliance with the client prior to helping them 
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see that their behaviour was not in accordance with Jewish law. Again this might 

require the counselling psychologist to work alongside the Rabbi in order to help 

assure the client that the law has been misunderstood and their behaviour is a 

consequence of perhaps obsessive compulsions. This would ensure that the client 
does not see the therapist as lacking in respect or understanding of their religious 
devotion. 

Considering the above implications, the culturally sensitive counselling psychologist 
must therefore not assume their theoretical approach suffices; cultural issues need to 
be kept at the forefront of practitioners' minds and consideration needs to be given to 

the meaning culture holds in our clients' fives, and in our own lives (Eleftheriadou, 
2003). 'Me process of cross-cultural therapy does not expect the therapist to know 

everything about the client's culture, however it is crucial to be flexible and open to 

challenging one's own views and considering distinct value systems, working with 
both similarities and differences within our practice (Eleftheriadou, 2003). Moreover, 

the counselling psychologist in practice needs to be mindful of the relationship triad 

which includes the person, the family system and the cultural context, in order to 

understand the factors underlying each individual's presentation. 

Ile fact that the findings of this study cannot be generalised, must remain specific to 
this group of participants and are based on my own interpretations are among its 

potential limitations. Arguably further research into women's experiences of 
observing the laws of family purity is therefore needed. For example, exploring 
experiences between different sects of Jewish women and between different religions, 
for example, contrasting the experiences of orthodox Jews with those of orthodox 
Muslims may help develop our understanding of the observance of marital cultural 
practices across religions. Whilst the findings lack empirical generalisability, Smith 

and Eatough (2008) highlight the significance of IPA and the "light it sheds within 
this broader context" (p. 41). Therefore the current findings and the clinical 
implications that flow from them can be argued to have theoretical generalisability 
and transferability (Smith et al., 2009) to counselling psychologists working with 
individuals from distinct cultural groups who adhere to similar practices during 
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menstruation. 

The participants in this study described themselves as observers of the laws of family 

purity. During the interviews, however, it became clear that their adherence varied 

quite considerably, and that the frequency of their menstrual cycles also differed, with 

some experiencing separation monthly and others only once every six months. The 

women's experiences may have been influenced both by the degree to which they 

observed the laws and by the frequency of separation periods. This needs to be 

accounted for in any follow-up research. For example, participants could be asked to 

comment on the degree of their adherence, or a questionnaire could be employed to 

ascertain a measure of adherence to the laws along with frequency of menstruation. 

This process would ensure a more homogenous sample, in line with IPA (Smith et al., 
2009). Additionally, the women who volunteered were self-selected (most responded 

the same day the advert was posted). This speed of response might reflect a bias in the 

sample, which may overrepresent those eager to have their voices heard and confident 

that they have something important to share. 

The accounts presented here might in addition be susceptible to lapses in memory and 
distortion. Some of the women were recalling experiences from 15 years earlier, 

perhaps reflecting their memories of events rather than the reality of that time in their 
lives. Further research could tackle this limitation by interviewing groups of women 

at the same stage of life: for example, exploring the experiences of observance for 

newlyweds, after five years and after 15 years of marriage. Looking at the similarities 
and differences emerging from the accounts would provide valuable insights into how 

women's experience of observance changes over time. 
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Methodolopfical reflexivit 

Finlay (2008b) argues that reflexivity reaches beyond declaring one's intentions and 

subjectivity; one also needs to be aware of the dynamic of the interviewer-participant 

relationship, which is similar to the therapeutic relationship and whose far-reaching 

effects in qualitative research (Finlay, 2002) need to be adequately accounted for. One 

of the significant challenges of this research was to be both involved with the research 

participants and to remain as a phenomenologist "scientifically removed" from the 

participants (Finlay, 2008a, p. 3). As a female orthodox Jew with my own opinions on 
the laws of family purity and my own experiences of adherence, I of course found it 

impossible to bracket myself off completely. However, I aimed to maintain, as much 

as possible, an empathetic openness (Finlay, 2008a). 

Reflections on the interviews 

In terms of what may have been going on in the interviews, the participants knew I 

was Jewish as I recruited them on a Jewish advertising website. Moreover they may 
have assumed I was either observant of the laws or had experience of them due to my 
understanding of the phenomena. This would have impacted the interview process, 

potentially making participants feel more at ease to talk freely, since they assumed I 

would understand their experience. On the other hand, they may have felt more 
constrained about presenting Judaism in a pejorative light, perhaps fearing that they 

would taint my impression of the laws, or send negative messages to those reading the 

research. They may have even feared punishment if they offered negative responses, 
and this may have encouraged them to be overly positive. As Smith and Osborn 

(2008, p. 54) point out, "people struggle to express what they are thinking and feeling, 

there may be reasons why they do not wish to self-disclose, and the researcher has to 
interpret people's mental and emotional state from what they say". Undoubtedly the 

women in this study will have withheld some material and this will have affected the 

accounts that they gave; after all, I was probing their most intimate personal 

relationships. 

At the time of the interviews, I was myself preparing to adopt the laws of family 

purity in conjunction with my upcoming marriage. Despite my best efforts to maintain 
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an equal stance to all points in the interviews, it is possible that my responses (verbal 

and non-verbal) influenced the answers given. For example, my presenting more 

positive facial expressions to the women's positive experiences and more sympathetic 

expressions to their traumatic accounts may have encouraged them to overemphasise 

the negatives, or play up the positives. Additionally my choice of interview prompts 

concerning their marital relationships may have also influenced the responses given. 

Perhaps they would have focused less on the marital rather than the individual impact 

had the former not been an aim of the study. 

Reflections on the analysi 

Some participants affected my process of analysis more than others. Although I 

attempted to give all voices equal weight, I kept feeling pulled by the more painful, 
negative accounts such as Stacy's. She came across as a deeply traurnatised individual 
due to her past history of anorexia. During the interview I noticed having to stop 
myself from entering into "therapist mode" and post-interview I found I had to 

consciously disengage from carrying her pain with me. During the analysis, I found 

myself immersed in her transcript for hours at a time; it was hard to remove myself. 
At her place at the extreme end of the spectrum, she seemed to make certain themes 
heavier. This made me fearful that a bias might arise in the analysis and I would end 

up conveying the experience of adherence in a negative light, when clearly there were 
many positive sentiments that were expressed. On reflection, it is possible that Stacy's 

case would have been better suited to a case study to convey the entirety of her 

experience and all its complexity. 

At times I also found it difficult not to engage with the specificity of the women's 
experiences. Such was the case with Rina, who had had a stillborn baby. I found 

myself getting caught up with her individual account and therefore found it 

challenging to recognise the themes that were developing. Only when I was able to 
take a step back from her specific scenario was I able to see clearly the role 
observance of the laws of family purity played in her life and therefore the themes 
that were developing. 
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Personal reflexivity 

Hertz (1997) suggests that: "to be reflexive is to have an ongoing conversation about 
the experience while simultaneously living in the moment" (p. viii). Whilst engaging 
in personal disclosure one walks a fine line, attempting to account for one's 
subjectivity while not wanting to engage in self-analysis at the expense of the research 

participant's accounts (Finlay, 2002). 

The personal process I have experienced alongside my research has also been 
important in shaping the research process. As I progressed with writing my analysis 
and discussion, I was adjusting to early-married life and to adhering to the laws of 
family purity (see Appendix 9 for further reflexivity concerning this). Undoubtedly 
my personal experience has impacted the research process, as I was immersed in the 
participants' transcripts alongside my own practice, and frequently I found could not 
distinguish my experience from those of the participants. My reflections on my 
experiences in my reflective diary frequently mirrored the accounts of the participants 
in the study. It is hard to discern whether, as a result of being entirely immersed in the 
participants' accounts at the same time as beginning my own process of observance, I 
was already affected by their experiences and their accounts subsequently shaped my 
own experience. Perhaps my experience would have overlapped with theirs, 
regardless of my conducting this research. Nonetheless the value I placed on the 
particular themes of separation, mikvah experiences and the psychological messages 
in the study are no doubt influenced by my own experience and my sense of what was 
important to the women. Another researcher may have viewed things differently. 

I was aware that I might be inclined to make more of the participants' positive 
experiences than their negative ones. I therefore kept checking back to the raw data to 
ensure the noted themes were the most pertinent. I was also keen to identify the 
difficulties that the participants experienced, as this would highlight areas to target in 
treatment. I utilised personal reflexivity alongside supervisor and peer discussions to 
chaUenge each theme and make sure they were reflective of the participants, 
accounts. By such means I endeavored to offset or minimise any personal bias. 
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I was able to understand, and empathise with, the conflicts, pains and struggles 

experienced by the participants in this study because of my own experience of 

observance and of the conflicts I face within my culture and religion. Concerned 

about the level of personal involvement I had in the research, I might have been 

inclined to offer a balanced perspective in which negative and positive factors were 

given equal weight. Perhaps I was hesitant to paint a positive picture, fearing a bias 

towards the benefits of adherence. On the flip side, I was cautious about presenting a 

strongly negative picture and a bleak conclusion, as this might have given rise to 

serious conflicts within me concerning the value and benefit of my own adherence. 

Therefore the resultant balanced perspective may be a consequence of an unconscious 

process whereby I have attempted to give equal weight to the positives and negatives 

of observance. 

Conclusion 

The findings of this study constitute a significant contribution to multicultural 

counselling literature in the UK. Using the specific example of orthodox Jewish 

women, their psychological experiences of adhering to the laws of family purity and 

the subsequent marital impact, this research has shed light on three significant themes 

with profound clinical implications. The theme of separation encompasses the 

women's experience of distancing within their marital relationships. This contrasts 

with the renewed passion and sexual excitement they feel for their spouses and the 

sense of protection that the separation space offers them. Such findings highlight the 
importance for couples adhering to such practices to find ways of retaining intimacy 

and emotional connectedness during separation. 

The women's mikvah experiences incorporate the sense of purification and rebirth felt 

at the mikvah alongside their contrasting experience of exposure. This sense of 

vulnerability has been linked to their adjustment difficulties in restoring sexual 
intimacy with their spouses, highlighting the importance of the mikvah experience in 

the women's return to intimacy. Counselling psychologists can assist individuals in 

managing their feelings of vulnerability, helping them become aware of any 
dysfunctional coping behaviours, and suggesting a stepped plan to restore sexual 
intimacy at a pace which does not augment their experience of vulnerability. 
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The psychological messages conveyed in the women's accounts reveal the fear that 

underlies participants' adherence and the subsequent safety and containment 

experienced from their observance. The experiences offered in this research challenge 

previous feminist conclusions relating to the oppressive nature of observance by 

pointing to a diversity of responses. 

Within each theme, there are significant convergences and divergences, highlighting 

the complexity of the women's experiences. Despite their positive or negative 
experiences, their commitment to the laws is clearly unrelenting. This highlights the 

significance of counselling psychologists upholding multicultural counselling 
competencies, understanding clients' values and adapting treatment interventions to 
suit clients' needs, so that their values are not opposed and that treatment 
interventions are instead complementary to their beliefs. These findings can be 
transferred across the various cultures that adhere to the practices of menstrual 
separation. 

In summary, this research not only contributes to a limited research base but also 
highlights the significant impact that observing marital cultural practices has on the 
marital relationship, hopefully paving the way for further research into this important 

realm of human experience. 
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APPENDICES 

Atmendix I- Recruitment adve 

I am recruiting Orthodox Jewish Women between ages 25-45, married 1.5-25 years, 

who adhere to the Jewish laws of family purity to take part in my doctoral research 

project. My study is looking at women's experiences of adhering to the Jewish laws 

of family purity and how such experiences may impact the marital relationship. 

Your participation will involve doing an interview with me that will last for around 

one hour. I will ask you questions to get you to talk about your experiences of 

adhering to the laws of family purity, and how this has impacted your marital 

relationship, sexual relationship and marital satisfaction. 

I will be recording interviews and I will transcribe them later for my research, which 

n-dght at a later date be published. 

If you wish to parflcipate I will need you to read an information sheet and give 
informed consent for this. I will give you a form to sign for consent to participate and 

another for consent to record the interview. 

Your participation is not expected to involve any risks of mental or physical harm any 
greater than those involved in your daily life, but nonetheless you will be debriefed 

fully at the end of the interview. I will ask you how you found it to participate and 
will provide some information about where you can get support should any difficult 
issues arise as a result of the interview. 

All the material you provide will be confidential and your name will be changed so 
that it will not be recognised by anyone else. 

Once you have consented to participate, you have the right to withdraw your consent 
and participation at any time during or after the interview. I will provide you with my 
contact details and those of my supervisor, so that you may withdraw at any time, 
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should you so desire. There will be no penalty for withdrawing your participation 

from the project and I will destroy any recordings or data related to you. 

I hope that this information is enough to give you some idea of whether you would 
like to participate in this research. Your participation will be invaluable and also 

much appreciated. Should you wish to volunteer or have any further questions that 

you would like answered, please contact me at: 

Amelie Black. Email: elie786@aol. com 
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Appgridix 2- Information sheet for particiRants 

Thank you for considering taking part in this research project. This information sheet 

provides some details about the project in order to help you understand what it is 

about, why it is being conducted and what your participation will involve. This is so 

that you can make an informed decision about whether or not you would like to 

consent to participate. 

The project is titled "An Interpretative Phenomenological Analysis: Orthodox Jewish 

women, adherence to the laws of family purity and the marital relationship. " It is an 

investigation into women's experiences of observing the laws of family purity, and 

how this might impact the marital relationship. I hope that the study will increase our 

understanding of the psychology of how physical and sexual abstinence within the 

marital unit, impacts the marital relationship. Moreover, whether there are useful 
implications for marital therapy in general. 

Your participation will involve doing an interview with me that will last for around 
one hour. I will ask you questions to get you to talk about your experiences of 
adhering to the laws of family purity, and how this has impacted your marital 
relationship, sexual relationship and marital satisfaction. 

I would like to record the interview so that I can transcribe and analyse it later for the 

project. I will need your consent for this and have a form that you will need to sign for 

consent to participate and another for consent to record the interview. 

Your participation is not expected to involve any risks of mental or physical harm any 
greater than those involved in your daily life, but nonetheless you will be debriefed 
fully at the end of the interview. I will ask you how you found it to participate and 
will provide some information about where you can get support should any difficult 
issues arise as a result of the interview. 

All the material you provide will be confidential and your name and personally 
identifying information will be changed so that it will not be recognised by anyone 

else. 
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Once you have consented to participate, you have the right to withdraw your consent 

and participation at any time during or after the interview. I will provide you with my 

contact details and those of my supervisor, so that you may withdraw at any time, 

should you so desire. There will be no penalty for withdrawing your participation 

from the project and I will destroy any recordings or data related to you. 

Your participation will be invaluable and also much appreciated. Should you have any 
further questions that you would like answered, please contact me at: 

Amelie Black. Email: elie786@aol. com. Telephone: 07949369648. 
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Al? pr, ndix 3- Interview guestions 

1. Can you describe to me your experience of, or what it has been like for you to 

keep the laws of family purity? 

EMMUM 
What was it like for you keeping these laws at the beginning of your marriage? 
How has that changed from the initial stages of marriage to now? 
Would you be able to describe a little more about that time? 
How did you feel emotionally at that time? 
Do you feel differently now compared to then? 
If yes, what has changed? 
What was it like for you to go to the Mikvah? 

2. Do you feel that the laws of family purity have had an impact on your marital 

relationship, and if so, how? 

EBOW 
How has it impacted on your sexual relationship, if at all? 
How has it impacted on your emotional relationship, if at all? 
Do you feel it has affected any other aspect of your relationship? 

3. How has keeping the laws of family purity influenced different areas of 
your life, if at all? 

EMM 
How has it impacted your relationships with other people, if at all? 
How has it impacted your relationship with yourself, if at all? 
How do you feel it influences your relationship with your body? Self esteem? 
How has it affected your beliefs about marriage, commitment and intimacy, if at all? 

4. Can you tell me a bit about your experiences of intimacy within your 
relationship, and how you feel keeping the laws of family purity has impacted 

your physical relationship with your spouse, if at all? 
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Prompts 

How often do you have sex with your spouse? 

Can you tell me a bit about your feelings of satisfaction within your marital sexual 
life, and your marital relationship? 
Can you tell me a bit about your priorities in your marriage, what aspects do you fine 

crucial for marriage to work well? 

5. Is their anything that I have not asked you that you expected might come up 
or would like to still share? 
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ADmndix 4- Consent form 

I consent to participate in the project entitled "An Interpretative Phenomenological 

Analysis: Orthodox Jewish women, adherence to the laws of family purity and the 

marital relationship" conducted by Amelie Black a Counselling Psychologist in 
Training at the Department of Psychology, London Metropolitan University, London. 

The project is supervised by Dr Elena Gil-Rodriguez at The School of Psychology, 

Faculty of Life Sciences, London Metropolitan University, Calcutta House, I Old 
Castle Street, London, EI 7NT. Telephone: 020 7320 233 1. 

The research will be conducted according to the Code of Conduct and Ethical 
Principles of the British Psychological Society. 

The purpose of the study is to investigate women's experiences of keeping the laws of 
family purity, and exploring how this impacts their marital relationships. I understand 
that the only requirement will be for me to be interviewed by Amelie Black, which 
will take approximately one hour. 

I understand that the results of this research will be confidential, and I will be given a 
pseudonym in any written material so that my identity will not be attached to the 
information I contribute. Ile key that lists my identity and pseudonym will be kept 

securely and separately from the research data in a locked file. It will be destroyed 

when the research is completed. In addition, I understand that the purpose of the 
research is to examine groups of people and not one particular individual. 

The research project is expected to provide further information on cultural marital 
practices and the marital relationship. This hopes to increase our understanding of the 
difficulties experienced by different cultures within their marital relationships, in 

order to develop treatment models for marital therapy. 

I understand that the results of this research may be published in psychological 
journals or otherwise reported to scientific bodies, but that I will not be identified in 
any such publication or report. 
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I understand that my participation is voluntary; that there is no penalty for refusal to 

participate or for withdrawing from the study, and that I am free to withdraw my 

consent and discontinue participation at any time. I understand that, if I withdraw my 

consent and participation my data, including any recordings, will be destroyed. 

I understand that this project is not expected to involve any risks of harm greater than 

those involved in everyday life, and that all possible safeguards will be taken to 

minimise, any potential risks. 

If I have any questions about any procedure in this project, or wish to withdraw my 

participation at any time, I understand that I may contact the researcher Amelie Black 

at email: elie786@aol. com or telephone: 07949369648. 

Signed (Participant) .............................................................................. 

Name (Block Capitals) ........................................................................... 

Date ................................................................................................. 
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A12ggndix 5- Confidentiality and consent -aaeement on the use of digital audio 

recordin&s 

This agreement is written to clarify the confidentiality conditions and consent for the 

use of digital audio recordings made by Amelie Black for the purposes of 

psychological research. 

The participant gives ............. (name) permission to tape the research interview on 

condition that: 

" The permission may be withdrawn at any time 

" The digital audio recordings are used solely for analysis by Amelie Black 

" The digital audio recordings will not be heard by any person other 
than ....... (name) or an employee of a transcription service for the purpose of 
transcription only 
The digital audio recordings will be stored under secure conditions and 
destroyed at the appropriate conclusion of their use 

T'his agreement is subject to the Code of Conduct and Ethical Principles of the British 
Psychological Society and the law of the land. 

I have read and understood the above conditions and agree to their 
hnplementadon. 

Signed (Research participant) ................................................ Date ............... 

Narne (Block capitals) ............................................................................. 

Siped (Researcher) ............................................................ Date ............... 

Name (Block capitals) ............................................................................. 
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Appgndix 6- Demographics 

1. What is your age? 

2. How long have you been married? 

3. What religious group do you affiliate yourself with? 

4. Do you have children? How many? 
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Apimndix 7- Debriefing for laarticiRants 

Thank you for taking part in this research project. Your help is much appreciated. 

The purpose of the research is to investigate Women's experiences of observing the 

laws of family purity and how this impacts their marital relationship. Your 

contribution has been invaluable and is much appreciated. 

It is hoped that the study will increase our understanding of the psychology of how 

physical and sexual abstinence within the marital unit, impacts the marital 

relationship. 

If you have any questions regarding the research, or wish to withdraw your consent or 
participation at any time, you may contact me directly at: elie786@aol. com or by 

phone: 07949369648. 

The contact details of my supervisor Dr Elena Gil-Rodriguez, are as follows: School 

of Psychology, Faculty of Life Sciences, London Metropolitan University, Calcutta 
House, I Old Castle Street, London, El 7NT. Telephone: 020 7320 2331. You may 
contact my supervisor should you have any queries or issues regarding the research or 
the conduct of the interview, for example, that you do not wish to share with me. 

At the end of the interview, I asked how you had found it to take part in the research 
and how you were feeling after the interview. If as a result of participating, you have 

experienced or are experiencing any difficult feelings such as sadness, 
embarrassment, emotional stress or feelings about yourself that you are uncomfortable 
with, I have provided below some details of organisations that you can contact in 
order to get some support. I hope that these might be useful if issues have come up for 

you during or after the interview that you would like to talk to someone about. 

Samaritans* Provides 24-hour confidential emotional support for those experiencing 
feelings of distress or despair. 

Tel: 0845 790 90 90. Website: wwwmmaritans. org. uk 
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Relate: Relate offers advice, relationship counselling, sex therapy, workshops, 

mediation, consultations and support face-to-face. 

Tel: 0300 100 1234. Website: www. relate. org. uk 

You could also go to your GP or could contact the BACP for information regarding 
finding a counsellor. 

The British Association for Counselling and Psychotheram: 

BACP House, 15 St John's Business Park, LE17 4HB. Tel: 0870 443 5252. Website: 

www. bacp. co. uk 
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Appendix 8- Ethics approval form 

0 

00 

London Metropolitan University PsychdP6§ýON 
Department, Ethics Panel metropo[itan 

university e 

I am pleased to say that the following project; `; ýC-. L]Aly of Life Sciences 
Catcutta House 

Old --astle S,. ree' 
ý' T\7 

Title "An IPA: Orthodox Jewish wornen, adherencePt01thb`19tW#` 
of family purity and the marital relationship". 

Facsimile 020 7320 1236 

v,,; A-v., 0nd3-)r1et aC. A 

Researcher: Amelie Black 
student ID 08016745, 

Supervisor. Mark Donati 

Has received provisional ethical approval to proceed, 
providing that it follows the requested action below, and also 
follows the ethical guidelines used by the Psychology 
Department and British Psychological Society. The researcher 
is also responsible for conducting the research in an ethically 
acceptable way, and should inform the ethics panel if there 
are any substantive changes to the project that could affect 
its ethical dimensions, and re-submit the proposal if it is 
deemed necessary. 

Signed: 

Dr Chris ocki (chair Psychology ethics panel) 
I 

c. cocking@londonmet. ac. uk 

Date: 22/9/2011 

rt. e'o 
"2 
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Atmendix 9- Personal reflexivity: mv exverience of observing the laws 

My experience of separation is in many way similar to that of my participants: it is a 

mixture of both positive and negative elements. I find the physical distance at times 

frustrating, although I do not feel distant from my husband during these periods. I feel 

that other communication channels need to be utilised when the physical method of 

communication is not available, and my degree of success here influences my 

experience of closeness to my spouse during that time. As I am mindful of the 

difficulties I might experience (I had completed the interviews prior to my 

observance) my mind is perhaps more open and therefore more accepting of any 

challenges. This has made the process significantly easier, as my expectations allowed 
for negative as well as positive sentiments. From my participants' accounts I was also 

aware of the importance of working on communication, especially during periods of 

separation. As a counselling psychologist, developing skills in communication and 

reflexivity is critical for me, my life and relationship satisfaction, and my work with 

clients. Maintaining a sense of intimacy during separation was perhaps more 

manageable with these skills. 

My experience at the mikvah often feels similar to the benefits I gain from personal 

therapy, especially in the way that it carves out a reflective, honest space. I really 

enjoy the preparation where I have an opportunity to cut out uninterrupted personal 

time for myself I feel it offers me a spa like experience where I pamper myself, and it 

gives me a feeling of importance and value within my relationship. This year has been 

filled with many new adjustments and therefore having a space to focus on my body 
has been valuable, both physically and psychologically. 

The mikvah time also brings spirituality into my life, which I appreciate. Through this 
physical preparation I also become more confident; it helps me shift my mind-set and 
identity to that of a sexual woman. In general I am quite comfortable being naked, 
therefore I don't feel the sense of exposedness that the women voiced. Perhaps as my 
body changes and, should I feel less comfortable naked, this experience may change. 
My return from the mikvah also feels positive and exciting. I feel physically cleansed 
and ready to be intimate with my husband. The adjustment back to intimacy for me 
has been a smooth transition; there is a sense of newness and enhanced sensitivity, 
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which makes me more appreciative of our physical relationship. Similar to the women 
in the study, I appreciate the space sexuality is given within my marital relationship 

and feel contained by the framework of the laws. 
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ApMndix II- Initial emergent themes for Karen 

Initial emergent themes 

Marital context 
Marriage onset 
Prior sexual experience 
Initial adjustment 
Premarital learning 
Challenging early experience 
Loosing sexual innocence 

Protection 
Boundaries 
Loss of innocence 
Vulnerable 
Lack of protection 
Early adjustment 
Husband support 
Panic 
Communication boundaries 

Relying on Faith 
Early marriage experience 
Intrusions 
Lack of confidence 
Need for protection 
Wedding night 
Bonding 
Communication 

Husband support 
Sharing experiences 
Social comparison 
Early adjustment 
Pre marital learning 

Admiration of teacher 
Wisdom 
Superior treatment 
Deep understanding of family purity laws 

Building confidence 
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premarital excitement 
Appreciation of laws 

Solid foundation 

Early experiences 
Rectification 
Shame/embarrassment - lack support 
Loss of control 
Lack of perceived support 
Husband support 
Husband safety 
Innocence 

Maturing process 
Benefits of innocence 

Growing together 
Costs of marriage later in life 

Adulthood baggage 

Attachment bond formed 

Husband support 
View of husband 
Open communication 
Empathy 

Communication strength 
Conflict management skills 
View of husband support 
Father figure 

Sense of safety 
Husband support 
Need for protection 
Disappointment 

Early marriage adjustment 
Early marriage experience 
Regulating menstrual cycles 
Irregular cycles 
Desire for pregnancy 
Escaping work 
Problems of infertility 
Fear of infertility 
Hyper-adherence for protection 
Silent promise 
Appreciation of laws, protection 
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Commitment to laws/ making a deal with God 

Fear of infertility 

Husband support 
Menstrual cycle 
Loss of control 
Difficulty of erratic cycle 
Prolonged separation 
Disappointment, frustration 

Early separation challenges 
Husband support 
Hormonal challenge 
Panicking 

Separation: Space for building relationship 
Little physical things 

Struggle for money 
Positive perspective 

Controlled mind-set 
Appreciation 

Struggle of no money 
Prioritising needs 
Awareness of couple needs 
Separation: investing in the relationship 
Enjoying time together 
Physical separation - view of husband 

Early marital experience 
Media fears 

Fear of separation: husband betrayal 

Insecurity 

Husband reassurance 
Cycle regularity 
Joy of pregnancy 
Experience of no family purity cycle 
Loss of cycles 

Early marriage experience = 3yrs off 
Lack of comparison 
Separation- intimacy cycles 
Expectation/pressure to have sex 
Intimacy prohibition 
Post baby separation: protection 
Appreciation of separation 
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Exhaustion & pain labour 

Post Protection 

Healing time out 
Labour pain 
Recovery space 
Fear of intimacy 

Protective space 
Renewal - Return to mikvah 
Scheduling mikvah difficulty 

Privacy of mikvah 
Mikvah timing, inconvenience 

special intimate time 

Fear of period 
Denial 
Flow of blood 

Break through 
Painful experience, prolonged separation 
Mind-set shifts 
Renewal return 
Fear 

Hindsight 
Separation- Enhanced desire for husband 

Husband support 
Husbands support 
Ability to work through issues and take positive 
Renewal excitement 
Strong memories 
Menstrual discomfort/ emotional pain 
Hormonal challenges 
Experience of intimacy 

View of laws - beauty 
Desire to teach the laws 

Pride 
Pay it forward 

Sympathy for others 
Social comparison 
Laws instil newness/excitement 
Benefits of laws 

Experience of no observance cycle 
Benefits of separation 
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Enhanced intimacy joy 

Benefits of family purity laws: foundations for intimacy 

Relationship needs work 

Provides positive framework 

Lack of understanding 
Family purity laws benefits: wise and intuitive 

Family purity benefits: beyond human conception 

Desire for intimacy 

Western values = act on feeling 

Society lack boundaries 

Lack of boundaries = frightening 

Fear of feelings 

Lack of control-overwhelming 
Feeding addictions 
Lack of boundaries in society 
Marriage = feed addiction 

Addiction burnout 

Fear of sexual burnout 

Addiction = danger 

Need for structure/self control 
Fear of unlimited desire 

Need for newness 
Key to life = newness 
Depression = old 
Happiness = newness 
Expectation of burnout 

Newness = breakdown 

Wisdom of laws 

Safety/ containment 
Need for boundaries/restraint 

Value of observance 
Appreciation for laws 

Family purity laws framework for newness 
Containment over fears 

Beyond human ability 
Fearful of burnout 

Family purity laws instils healthy newness - framework 

Values of healthy newness 
Beauty of newness 

Healthy newness 
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Beauty of change 

joy of healthy change 

Social comparison 

Appreciation for life 

Beauty of children development 

Convincing self - strong tones 

Family purity laws newness = benefits 

Benefits of protective framework 

Pain of separation 

Appreciation of boundaries 

Separation benefits = no rejection 

Renewal of interest 

Boundary for intimacy 

Renewal desire 

Renewal of newness 
Appreciation on laws 

Social comparison 

Fear of betrayal: containment through laws 

Convincing self 
Need for containment 
Peace in the home 

Family purity laws framework for peace/purity 
Story of women's experiences 
Jewish approach to affairs 
Gaining control 
Positive thinking 
Goal of marital happiness 
Cootive control 
Choice of happiness 
Desire for happiness 
Cognitive control: Value of positive thinking 
Acceptance of challenges 
Boundaries - safety 
Pursuit of happiness 
Pain and happiness intermingled 
Greatest pain and joy = children 
Investment in kids = enhanced emotion 
Belief in god 
Framework: safety 
Bible fit with human psyche 
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Intimacy - separation cycle 
View of separation 
Early separation benefits 

Relationship foundation 

Value of separation 
Separation benefits 
Building relationship 
Psychological space 
Developing understanding 
Desire for physicality 
Developing communication skills 
Developing communication skills 
Separation benefits - miscommunications 
Feeling hurt angry 
Husband saviour from pain 
Desire for protection 
Hurting 
Relief 
View of husband 
Emotional comfort not through physicality 
Physical barriers 
Seeking validation 
Opportunity for communication 
Desire for comfort 
Shame 
Drawn out descriptions 
Self focus 

Intense emotions 
Learning about each other 
Miscommunications 
Lack of support 
Unmet needs 
Fear of abandonment 
Resentment 
Empathy 
Understanding 

Emotional space 
Misunderstanding 
Husband superiority 
Loss of control 
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Husband support 
Comfort 

Developing communication skills 
Gender differences 

Different needs between genders 
Distinct coping behaviours 

Emotionally smothering 
Need for emotional connection 
His need for emotional space 
Communication strength 
Physicality removes verbal communication 
Separation = developed awareness of needs 
Gender differences 

Husbands need for emotional space 
Rejection 

Learning about the other 
Reappraising behavior 

Communication 
Growth together: containing emotions 
Fear of ending/breakup 
Changing perceptions 
Resentful 
Separation laid foundations 

Priority of relationship 
Limited distractions 

Early adjustment 
Separation: fights 

Tension 
Lack of insight 
Sexual tension 
Early adjustment 
Restraint 

Holding back 
Fear of sin 
Managing early tension 
Learning process 
Household chores 
Frustration, lack of support 
Separation = addressing disputes 
Separation space 
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Physical times = focused 

Physical priority 
Separation benefits 

Separation = growth oriented 
Separation investment 

Separation benefits 

Intimacy periods positive 
Physical closeness 
Intimacy benefits 

Separation strain 
Strict adherence 
Separation = communication 
Psychological bonding 
Developing emotional awareness 
Foundations being built 
Early adjustment 
Post birth hormones 
Labour resentment 
Lack of understanding 
Need for empathy 
Desire for comfort from similar others 
Lack of connection 
Communication needs 
Support/comfort 

Validation 

Seeking approval 
Early adjustment = learning curve 
Enhances closeness and intimacy 
Privacy of topic 
Special secret 
Shame in front of others 
Mikvah preparation 
Privacy of topic 
Avoidance of topic 
Lacking assertiveness 
Intrusion of others 
Mikvah stories 
Planning mikvah attendance 
Need for privacy 
Negotiating needs: gender roles 

193 



Return from mikvah - greeted 
Positive renewal 
Renewed desire for spouse 
Early adjustment 
Renewed desire 

Developed marital confidence 
Privacy of intimacy 

Renewed sexual chemistry 
Secret club 
Enhanced desire 

Arousal 

Renewed passion 
Privacy of intimacy 

Desire for intimacy 
Intensity of emotion 
Fear of rejecting others 
Renewal of intimacy 

Social comparison 
Sympathy for others 
'Wooden spoon' effect 
Marital energy 
Framework protection: safety 
Marital energy 
Potential marital energy 
Complete together 
Social comparison 
Power of destruction 
Power of partner 
Power of parent - attachment pattern 
Strength of relationship 
Power of couples 
Social comparison 
Need to save others 
Lack of control 
Family purity laws: only one component 
Marital needs 
Kind, understanding, prioritise 
Not a magical power 
Family purity: marital tool 
Family purity: not a cure 
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Family purity laws: support framework 

Limited tool 

Tool for power or destruction 

Force +/- 

Sexual control 

Mikvah refusal 

Sexual power 

Sexual rejection 

Marital needs 

Relationship development 

Communication development 

Relationship priorities 

Relationship challenges, life cycle 
Social comparison 
Marital Priorities 

Social comparisons 

Lack of time for spouse 
Male priorities 
Marital investment 

Prioritising the other 
Comparison to family purity laws 

Mikvah comfort/cycle 
Space for priority 
Social comparison 

Sexual frequency 

Social comparison 
Lack of sexual framework 

Life cycle impact 

Childcare 

Priorities change 
Sexual honesty 

Expectation of marital breakdown 

Control over sexual cycle 
Framework/routine 

Physical preparation 
Gender difference 

Reconciling v oppression 
Mikvah preparation 
View of women's benefits: oppression 
Mikvah prep 
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Preparation benefits 

Obligation of sex 

Sexual avoidance 

Sexual preparation 

Physical preparation 

Enhances desire 

Convincing self of women's needs : oppression 
Male preparation/ role. Equalising across gender 

Reconciling gender distinction in her mind 

Husband greeting 

Gender: Giving him a role - equalizing 

Husband understanding 
Return from mikvah 

Emotional/physical transition 

Husband understanding 
Sexual expectation 
Life cycle challenges 
Sexual drive differences 

Sexual drive comparison 
Sexual drive changes 
Life cycle - responsibilities 
Hormonal changes 
Body changes: breastfeeding 

Relationship with body 

Awareness of lower libido 

Mikvah support 
Separadon benefits: enhanced desire 
Separation benefits: Health/menstrual bleeding 
Seven clean days 
Benefit of countdown 
Shifting mind-sets 
Desire build up 
Achieved excitement 
Transforming time 
Hormonal synchrony 
Separadon benefits 
Mind-set shift 
Transformations 
Mikvah = transformation 
Return from mikvah 
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Purify self before exposed 

Physical preparation=mental preparation 

No framework 

Need some boundary/separation 

Guilt of rejection 

Exhaustion 

Managing both needs 

Sexual pressure/expectation 
Negotiate boundaries 

Communication 

Childbirth changes 

Lack of family purity laws 

Loss of spark 
Changing relationship with body 

Gaining weight 
Loss of confidence 

Unhappy with body image 

Lower sexual interest 

Space for communication 
Prioritising others needs 
Desire for cycle 
Awareness of no boundaries 

Acceptance of freedom 

Self boundaries 

Planning intimate evenings 
Shifting mind-set 
Safety, meeting needs 
Benefits of structure/routine 
Social comparison 
Need for structure 
Desire to meet needs 
View of relationship 

Mikyah preparation: checking 
Comfort versus adjustment 
Shift, science to sex 
Social comparisons 
Challenging aspects 

Privacy of mikvah 
Mikvah timing challenges 
Husband support 
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importance of mikvah 

Sense of support 

importance of time/space 

Mikvah enjoyment 

Mikvah preparation 

Independence from kids 

Cutting out personal private time for self 
Personal time 

Mikvah time 

Mikvah preparation 

Husband support 

Personal space 
Struggle to shift mind-set 

Choice of happiness 

Gaining control 
Negative emotions 
Positive spin 
View of mikvah 
Pampering time 
Space for mind- set shift 
Social comparison 
Gaining cognitive control 
Choice of viewpoint 
Saving them from pain 
Sharing with others mind-set shift 
Personal power 

Method of cognitive control 
Gaining control 
Trapped 

Loss of control 
Shock method 

Downward comparison 
Unable to gain control 
Loss of ability 
Desperation 

Return to reality 
Renewed control 
Mind-set shift 
Renewed strength 
Choice Of Cognitive control 
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Positive mind-set 
Positive parental marriage model 

Family support 
Family challenges 

Inspired by sister 
Positive attitude 
Mind-set shift 
Learnt to appreciate life 

Reminder of positive 
Mature skills of communication 
Family challenges 

Positive parents 
Special needs = greater appreciation 

Lucky 

Availability of parents 
Role of helping sister 
Responsibility 

Sisters developments 

Admiration from others 
Positive attitude 
Everything is possible 
Similar values to husband 

Challenges of childhood 

Positive spin 
Warmth 

Positive approach to life 

Positive upbringings 
Choice of mind-set 
AtMwted to positivity 
View of husband 

Personal traits 

Realistic image 

Work hard to be positive 

Husbands support 
Fighting dynamic 

Communication 

Expression of needs 
Relationship strength 
View of husband 

Fighting/communication 
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Maturing process 
Young marriage 
Comparison with researcher 
Early marriage 
Innocence 
Early marital adjustment 
Marital growth 
Comparison to husband 

Early marital adjustment 
Enhances self awareness 
Aware of cycles 
Aware of experience 
Observing the laws 

Emotional experience 
Difficulty of separation 
Enhanced physical self awareness 
Awareness of hormone-emotion link 

Mind-body relationship 
Awareness of own needs 
Desire 
Gaining control 
Manufacturing desire 

Acceptance of feelings 

Sexual desire 

Control over desire 

Grew into desire 
Shame for others 
Judgement 
Desire to teach others 
Inspire others 
Finding time for teaching 
Need to pay it forward 

Priority of family purity laws 
Explaining to children 
Privacy of topic 
Discomfort with topic 
Privacy of topic 
Awareness of teaching others 
Privacy of family purity laws 
Desire to share 
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Judgement of others 
Others privacy/sexual cycles 

Curiosity - privacy/secrecy of topic 

Social judgements 

Shame 

Self discipline 

Privacy of topic 

Privacy intrusion 

Anxiety 

Fear of breaking boundaries 

Intruding 

Respecting privacy 
Control over privacy 

Controlling others privacy 
Teaching odiers-control 
Privacy of topic: communication with others 

Sharing communication 
Menstruation frustration 

Difficulties with mikvah 
Communication 

Practical childcare for mikvah 

Supporting others 
Privacy of mikvah/ discomfort sharing 
Becoming more personal 
Privacy of topic 

Strict privacy 
Privacy of topic 
Husband support 
Becoming more closed 
Lack of sharing 
Communication (allowances) 

Never detailed sexually 
Privacy of topic 
Shifting life cycle 
Opposing expectations 
Importance of privacy 

Preservation of spousal unit 
Strict boundaries 

Gender bias/differences 

Separation-intimacy cycle 
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Timing for him/her 

Moving out comfort zone 
Need for communication 
Closeness/understanding 
Physical closeness = emotional closeness 
Emotional distance during intimacy 

Emotional closeness during separation 
Different zones 
Physical times are for him 

Moving towards spouse needs 
Intimacy cycles = harder to connect emotionally 
Barriers / distancing 

Unmet emotional needs during intimacy 

Routine of timing 
Festival Comparisons: mind-set shift 
Relationship unspoken contract 
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Apppndix 12 - Table of clustered themes for Karen 

Separation Experiences 

Sub Theme Page/Line Themes 

Number 

Initial 134.145-149 Challenging early experience: Disappointing, 

experience of Frustrating 

prolonged 
Separation 135.172-182 Investing in non physical activities 

150,151.555-562 Sexual tension 
Opportunity 146.435-442 Developing communication skills 
to build the 135.155-156 

relationship 147.462-465 

146.442-444 Learning about each other 
149.521-532 

151.572-579 

153.631-632 

135.172-175 Ptioritising the relationship 
150.547-551 

160.802-803 

146.434-443 Growth 

150.539-541 

152.584-585 

153.602-607 

Fear of 136.182-186 Husband might look elsewhere 
betrayal 
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Personal 137.209-215 Psychological and physical recharging: Healing 

Protection: 137.214 time out 

Post baby 

recovery 181.1364-1369 Emotional needs are met 

142.349-364 Relief: no rejection 
159.769-774 

164,165.916-924 

Benefits: 143.362-365 Sexual renewal 

Renewal of 

desire 156.702-712 Enhanced desire 

137.218 Longing for spouse: Absence makes the heart 
163.878-880 grow fonder 

163,164.883-893 

160.804-806 Renewal 

139.269-270 Newness 

141.326-348 

142,143.356-364 

Benefits: 160-804-806 App - reciation of Sexual structure 
Appreciation 

of 164,165.915-927 Removal of sexual pressure 
boundaries 

Relationship 181.1358-1360 Sexual cycles 

cycles 

181.1363-1372 Male v female time 

138,139.252-255 Hormonal Synchrony 

176.1232-1236 
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View of the laws of Family Purity 

Sub Theme Page/Line Number Themes 

Premarital 130,131.68-79 Safe and containing 

Learning 

Psychologi 133.126-136 Fear of infertility 

cal 
Messages: 133.140-141 Strict adherence 
Adherence 

as 134.153-154 Relief of adherence 

protective 
from 

punishment 

Time off 138.272-279 Pregnancy = no observance 

the laws 

135.197-199 Foundations built for intimacy 

139.281-284 

Value of 138.265-267 Paying it forward 

observance 176.1265-1267 

177.1283 

139.286-288 Wisdom of laws 

139.292-302 

139,140.304-310 

144.413-420 

141.328-332 Framework for healthy newness 
141.309-324 

141.327-329 

159.773-778 
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144.380-382 Framework benefits: safety and containment 

144,145.405-406 

134.126-135 Fear of infertility 

159.769-774 Marital tool: power/destruction 
158.759-764 

157.725-728 

158.756-760 

158.761-765 

157.720-721 

139.268-270 Social comparison 
157,729-731 

160.806-815 

177.1254-1261 Pity/Fear for others lack of adherence 
Gender 162,162.857-871 Reconciling gender difference 

Differences 161.828-829 

162.846-849 

162.852-857 Equalising responsibility 

Mikvah Experiences 

Privacy of 154-647-651 Shame of others knowing 

mikvah 155.664-669 

155,156.685-698 

180.1329-1332 

153,154.635-637 Intimacy privacy 
156.702-711 

178.1285-1292 
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180.1341-1343 

180.1345-1347 

178.1288-1292 

178,179.1297-1304 

179.1304-1308 

167.1000-1001 

179,180.1317-1334 

Intruding in others privacy 

Childcare difficulties 

Mikvah 164.895-901 Nfind-set shift 
Preparation 161,162.825-847 

Space: 163,164.886-893 

Physical 164.904-915 

and 169.1040-1050 

psychologic 169.1052-1056 

al benefits 170.1064-1067 

171.1093-1096 

182.1383-1399 

164.898-901 Mikvah Transformation 

164.907-915 

163.878-880 Building desire 

168.1014-1024 Personal Time 

169.1033-1035 

162.852-857 Return from Mikvah: Partner support: 
Adjustment 
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Appendix 13 - Clustering the main themes for the cross case analy5Ls 

Key. - 

StLla 

Rina 

Becky 

Laura 

Karen 

Superordinate Theme Sub Theme Themes across interviews 

Clustered and example from 

transcript (page number, 
line reference) 

The Period of Separation Distancing: The Dead Sea Unmet needs for physical 

affection (2.30-35) 

Changing personas: 
Defences and barriers go 

up (7.166-169) 

Early a4justinent to 

separation: strain (2.42-47) 

Experience of being niore 
lonely (11.296-298) 

Distancing in other areas 

of the relationship 

(10.265-267) 

Emotional distance along 

with physical distance 
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(11.329-334) 

Lack of tin-nno choice 
(10.317-325) 

Fear of betrayal (136.182- 

186) 

Early experiences of 

separation: adjustment 

(134.145-149) 

Renewal: Simmering Enhanced appreciation for 

Passions spouse (2.33-34) 

Remembering I miss him 

(17.463-469) 

Iterricill : 111(; 

Renewed sexual energy 

(11.317-318) 

Absence makes the heart 
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grow fonder (163.879-880) 

Healthy newness 

(142,143.356-364) 

Reminder of importance of 

each other: sexual renewal 

(6.169-175) 

Cyclical renewal (9.280- 

283) 

Protection: A Healing I Psychological and physical 
Time Out I recharging (137.209-215) 

Benefits of personal spacc 

(3.70-77) 

Removal of sexual 

obligation (22.712-715) 

Time out: relief (6.183- 

185) 

The Mikvah Experience Personal Space: Mind-set shift (164.904- 

Purification and Rebirth 915) 

Marital tool: 

power/destruction 
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(157.725-728) 

Personal space and time 

out (9.230-23 1) 

Personal reflection & the 

personal relationship with 
God (3.62-75) 

Desire to return to mikvah 
(6.165-173) 

Personal Space: pampering 
(6,7.185-195) 

Invasion of Privacy: Vulnerability: exposed self 
Shame of Exposure (9.266-270) 

Traumatic (9.276-277) 

Exposed: Body image 

difficulties (9.269-270) 

Physiologically irritating 

(5.156-157) 

Exposed self (14,15.447- 
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459) 

Privacy of mikvah 

topic(21.657-670) 

Private relationship with 
God (3.62-63) 

Membership to a secret 

club (21.624-627) 

Community support 

(23.672-676) 

Shame of others knowing 

(180.1329-1332) 

Intruding in others privacy 

(178,179.1297-1304) 

Retum from Mikvah: I llo,, itivc process (8.220- 

Adjustment 1221) 

Removal of sexual arousal 

(9.266-277) 

Adjustment (34.1086- 

1088) 
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Resistance to sexual 

obligation (11.333-338) 

Switching modes: 

Difficulties adjusting to 

intimacy after separation 

(10.242-247) 

Mikvah transformation 

(164.898-901) 

Psychological Messages Fearful Emotions: Guilt Religious fear and guilt 

and Superstition (26.812-816) 

Changes in observance: 

laxity versus hyper- 

adherence (4.96-108) 

Fear of punishment 
(4.114-115) 

Fears of pregnancy 

(11.408-411) 

Fear of infertility 

(134.126-135) 

Pity/fear for others lack of 

adherence (177.1254- 

1261) 
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ise: I Framework benefits: 

Containment safety and containment 

(144.380-382 

144,145.405-406) 

Paying it forward 

(139.265-267) 

Teaching the laws 

(26,27.705-718) 

Monthly reminder: safety 

and containment (17.552- 

561) 

Ensures 

appreciation/sensiti v it y 

(25.734-736) 

False promises: Protection 

(2.38-42) 

Commitment to God 

(20.626-628) 

Gender Bias: Oppression View of the changing 

nature of purity: confused 

(25-724-732) 

Reconciling gender issues 

(161.828-829) 
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Gender bias/ Resentment 

towards husband (7.8.219- 

231) 

Women's spiritual cycles 

Versus offensive labelling 
(7,8.216-222) 
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SECTION B- Reflective essa-v (PYP152C) 

Developing my Personal identitv as a counselling psychologis 

At this juncture in my training I have begun to form my personalised identity as a 

counselling psychologist. My values as a counselling psychologist lie within the 

humanistic tradition which respects the uniqueness of each individual, placing 

importance on the subjective meaning of the individual's experience, which is valid 

and meaningful in its own terms, rather than making assumptions based on objective 

observable truths. Moreover, at the heart of my practice lies the maintenance of Roger 

(1957)'s core conditions of empathy, acceptance and authenticity, placing a central 

focus on the therapeutic relationship. 

In this essay I will present my theoretical orientation as a Cognitive Behavioural 

Therapist (CBT). I will elaborate on this model and give examples of how it has fit in 

with my client work. I will then highlight the limitations I have come across using 
CBT, and highlight how through learning of alternative approaches and development 

as a practitioner I have been able to integrate aspects of the psychodynamic approach 
into my client work. I will present a "clear and internally consistent theoretical 

framework, which provides a rationale for the way in which concepts and techniques 

are combined" (Horton 1999). Throughout I will be reflective of the process I have 

gone through elaborating on how I have evolved as a practitioner and my future 

directions. 

The therapeutic approach I have adopted aligns well with my epistemological 
standpoint as social constructivist valuing each individual's process of making 
meaning of knowledge within a social context (Vygotsky, 1978). It also compliments 
my view of self as a scientist, as scientific method underlies the CBT assessments, 
formulations, goal setting, treatment planning and interventions. Additionally, I view 
myself as a reflective-practitioner, as I utilise every opportunity to critically reflect on 
my client work and value supervision as an essential component of my practice. My 
aim with CBT is to develop client's knowledge, insight and understanding of 
themselves providing them with increased capacity for choice and adaptive 
functioning (Strawbridge & Woolfe, 2003). 
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CBT is an integration of cognitive therapy (Beck, 1976) and behaviour therapy 

(Bandura, 1977). CBT views dysfunction as a consequence of an individual's 

interpretation of events, and views resultant behaviours as critical factors in the 

maintenance of emotional problems. Human experience is considered by CBT to be a 

result of four interacting elements: physiology, cognition, emotion and behaviour 

(Scott, 1989; Dryden, 1990). 

CBT's diathesis stress model of psychopathology highlights: Predisposing factors 

which increase an individual's vulnerability to experience difficulty; taking account 
of bio psychosocial factors, genetic factors, early life trauma, family relational 
patterns and beliefs. It also recognises Precipitating factors connected to the onset of 
the difficulty, looking at triggers, stimuli and settings appraised as threatening and the 
Perpetuating factors which act as maintenance factors for the difficulty, such as 
feedback loops (Taylor, Thordarson, Sochting, 2002). Change within CBT is reflected 
by symptom reduction and behavior change (Scott, 1989; Dryden, 1990). 

In my experience and understanding of the CBT concepts I have briefly outlined, they 
take account of the significant factors that contribute to psychopathology, allowing 
for a deep understanding of each individual presentation. Not only has CBT fit well 
with my clients to date, it lends well to my understanding of my own difficulties as I 
can see the clear links and repetitive cycles between my own beliefs, cognitions, 
emotions and behaviours. Moreover CBT utilises a simple and clear model, which is 
easy both for me as a therapist to convey and for the client to understand and follow 

In line with my values, CBT prioritises the therapeutic relationship as a central 
component to the therapy, using the therapeutic relationship as a medium through 

which the therapist and client can work collaboratively (Beck & Freeman, 1990). The 
therapist works to understand and respect the client's subjective experience whilst 
empowering the client to actively collaborate in the process of defining and 
addressing their difficulties. 

The collaborative process of working with clients to help them leam to identify their 
automatic thoughts and their core beliefs helps create a strong therapeutic raptor 
(Beck, 1995). 1 have observed that when my clients become self sufficient in the 
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process of identifying their cognitions and understand the role of their core beliefs on 

their automatic thoughts, this gives them a sense of achievement and mastery. Once 

this stage is achieved I have found my clients become more trusting over the 

therapeutic relationship, providing them with a safe containing base to explore the 

impact that their negative automatic thoughts (NAT's) have over their feelings and 

resultant behavior's. In this way my clients have become more willing to explore the 

role their dysfunctional coping behaviours play in their presentation and experiment 

with new behaviours and skills to integrate into their lifestyles. 

Through working collaboratively and reciprocally, my clients feel they are the experts 

of their lives and I am the expert of the approach. I value this atmosphere which 

empowers my clients within the therapeutic relationship and makes them take 

responsibility for their improvements, not merely attributing progress to the therapist 

rather seeing it as their own increased skilfulness. 

It has become clear to me that when my clients feel educated about CBT, they feel 

more competent to identify their own thought and behavioural patterns leading them 

to practice cognitive restructuring and behavioural change (Bond and Dryden, 2002). 

The practical focus of CBT: providing clients with skills they can use in daily life is 

important for me as I like to respond to my own challenges with a 'plan of action' and 

whilst I feel talking through difficulties is beneficial, I also am motivated by skills I 

can utilise to help me get through the difficulty I am facing. I therefore feel true to my 

clients when I am preaching an approach that I value as a person. I also enjoy the 

transparency of CBT providing my clients with clear rationales of treatment plans, 

allowing us to have a focus and goals for the therapy which builds clients self efficacy 

and agency. 

An example of a recent client I have worked with using CBT is Jane (pseudonym) 

who presented with anxiety problems in the form of panic attacks. In brief Jane got 
married 6 months ago, following which she found her husband on porn websites and 
felt that he had a porn addiction. This resulted in Jane becoming increasingly anxious 
in her relationship, she felt inadequate and that she could no longer trust her husband. 
Jane expressed that she was having panic attacks and emotional outbursts at her 
husband, fuelled with anger, rage and threats. This was followed by feelings of 
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shame, guilt and insecurity. To help Jane understand what was causing her to feel so 

panicky and untrusting I introduced Jane to the dysfunctional thought record (DTR) 

(Beck, 1995). 

Situation: Jane and her husband had guests for dinner, and she heard her husband 

mention that a friend of his at work had got a promotion on a deal they were involved 

in. 

Automatic Thoughts: "oh my G-d' I don't know about this, what other things is he 

hiding from me", "he must be fantasising about other women at work", "what other 

things happen at work that I do not know about", "he cant tell me anything", "he 

doesn't trust me", I am not important to him". I am not in control, I can't cope". 

Feelings: shocked, sad, lonely, angry, panic. 

Behaviour: After dinner Jane screamed at her husband firing many questions about 
his worth, trust, work, and followed by threats of divorce. 

It was only through completing this DTR that Jane was able to see the impact of her 

automatic thoughts on her feelings and behaviour. Jane started to understand the 
impact of her behaviour on both the relationship and her own self worth. Through our 
formulation it became clear to Jane that her childhood experiences of having 

emotionally unavailable parents "who were always fine" left her with core beliefs of 
being a "failure and worthless" she also viewed the world as an "unsafe, 

uncontainable place". She did not experience role models who confronted pain and 
difficulty and who taught her how to face problems and work through them. She 

therefore developed a very insecure sense of herself and her ability to cope with 
difficulty. She noticed that whenever threatened in life she would feel very 
overwhelmed unable to cope and she would ruminate about all her failings resulting 
in anxiety, panic and emotional outbursts. These outbursts would be in the form of 
anger, rage, panic, hysterical tears in her "unsafe uncontained world". 

Jane was able to make sense of the repetitive patterns occurring in her relationship 

and her panic attacks. Through this awareness she learrit how to chaflenge her 
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automatic thoughts and modify her core beliefs, thus allowing her to manage her 

anxiety better and not get into the hysterical rages she usually would get into when 

confronted with her negative automatic thoughts and feelings of being threatened. 

Moreover we worked through this particular issue and it became clear to Jane that her 

husband did not have a porn addiction, but rather frequented porn websites, we 

worked together to confront her feelings about this and explore functional ways to 

deal with this difficulty. This was a valuable experience for Jane not only to use the 

CBT aspects of challenging her cognitions and behavioural change e. g. breathing 

techniques, attention training etc. but also facing a difficulty that gave rise to anxiety, 

and finding a way to confront and tolerate these emotions. 

Whilst CBT has many benefits, I have also learnt through experience with client work 

and developing my understanding of other approaches that CBT does not work for all 

clients, at times persisting with it can reinforce a client's sense of being a failure. For 

example, my client Rachel (pseudonym) presented with an emetophobia (fear of 

vomiting). Rachel had been stalked as a child and was brought up by a very "critical 

unloving father". This led her to seek out unattainable men throughout her life and 

repeat the stalker like behaviours experienced to her in the past. These relationship 

difficulties gave rise to her feelings of nausea, severe bowel problems (psychosomatic 

pain) and panic attacks. 

We worked together using Boschen, (2007)'s emetophobia model, which has three 

components that Rachel felt adequately identified her difficulties: the predisposing 
factors, the acute factors and the maintaining factors. However Rachel was resistant in 

therapy, she wanted to do exposure therapy, though was not committed to any task, 
never did homework, and was to afraid to change. Though we addressed this and 
developed a strong therapeutic relationship, her goals were not met and the therapy 
felt stuck. In hindsight as Rachel's difficulties were deeply rooted in her childhood 
experiences and the emetophobia seemed to be a manifestation of her childhood 
trauma long-term psychodynamic therapy may have been more suitable to address her 
longstanding relationship difficulties, dealing with her resistance and her defences 
that were maintaining her nausea and panic. 

The practical focus of CBT allowed for all her unconscious resistance and defences to 
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be maintained. Alternatively, Schema therapy could have also been considered to help 

her work through her relationship difficulties (Young, Klosko, & Weishaar 2003). 

Rachel's schemas were self-defeating patterns that she kept repeating throughout her 

life, as her core emotional needs were not met in childhood she developed schemas 

that led to unhealthy life patterns. Through schema therapy perhaps Rachel could 

have been helped to overcome her maladaptive coping styles, get back in touch with 

her early core feelings in order to heal early schemas, and learn to get out of self 
defeating schema modes in order to get her daily emotional needs met. 

Whilst CBT has gained successful outcomes for a wide range of presentations over 
both short and long term improvements (Butler, Chapman, Forman, & Beck, 2006), 

there is no approach that fits every client. Moreover, it is questionable in Butler et 

al. 's (2006) research whether improvements were related to CBT or naturally 

occurring. CBT has also been criticised for its tendency "to overemphasise the 

routine, visible aspects of work and to neglect 'under-the-surface' skills like problem 

solving and information handling" (Field, 2000, p. 168). 

A diagnostic approach also warrants criticism for its lack of reliability, as most 
disorders overlap, it can encourage therapists to ignore individual differences, and it is 

influenced by what society views as unacceptable behaviour, labelling individuals. 

Therefore as a Counselling Psychologist i maintain an awareness of the impact of a 
diagnosis, constantly revaluating diagnosis and formulations. 

Counselling Psychology and PsychodyLiatnic TheraRY 

As a result of at times feeling stuck with CBT as depicted in the very brief example 
above, and developing my understanding of other therapeutic approaches, I started 
integrating aspects of the psychodynamic approach into my therapeutic practice. 
Though these two approaches do not necessarily fit well, I have taken psychodynamic 

concepts and developed an understanding of them to allow for them to influence my 
way of thinking with some clients. In this way my theoretical orientation is 
distinguished more by the meaning the intervention has rather than the specific use of 
the intervention strategy (Posnanski and McLennon, 1995). 
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My approach to incorporating other techniques has been based on the "common 

factors" approach to integration (Garfield, 1992). This involves learning about other 

models and noticing that many concepts and techniques overlap with those of CBT 

and bringing those common factors together within my use of CBT. 

Psychodynamic therapy sees a large component of mental life as unconscious, where 

unacceptable aspects of the self and experience are banished to the unconscious 

(Jacobs, 1999). These unconscious processes feel threatening and defense 

mechanisms are used in attempt to avoid this threat. Psychodynamic therapy views 

this resistance as key in the therapeutic process; it can serve as a protective function 

(Huprich, 2009) and can be indicative of "how vulnerable a person feels" (Hycner, 

1993, p. 138). Resistance may act as a way to not uncover feelings or thoughts, or 

might reflect ones anxiety to change. 

Rachel's resistance may have been due to her fear of change or hatred of the negative 

parts of herself and she may have benefited from the opportunity to bring forth her 

unconscious experiences. Therefore now I am more mindful of resistance in therapy 

and more able to gently identify the resistance and invite my client to confirm or 

reject my interpretations or explore what feelings or thoughts they are resisting. 

Whilst some may argue CBT does not necessarily create space to bring about these 

unconscious processes, I am now more mindful of the unconscious in my practice and 

am more flexible allowing some clients to have more space in the therapy, by 

stepping back and sitting with the silence more. 

The central focus of psychodynamic work is how the past presents itself in the here 

and now. The therapy is the living example of the client's internal and external world 

through which the therapist can re-experience with their client aspects of the 

presenting past to be more adaptive for the present and future (Jacobs, 2006). 

As a more experienced therapist now I would be able to be use the here and now more 
by addressing aspects of transference-countertransference interaction at play. I now 

critically reflect more on how my client relates to me, what they expect from me, 
having an awareness of non-verbal communication, seating, eye contact, posture, to 
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help me understand more about their past experiences. Moreover reflecting on how I 

feel with my clients is crucial. E. g. with my client Rachel (with the emetophobia) I 

had felt a strong sense of being a failed therapist, and therefore perhaps did not persist 

and motivate her enough with the skills we were practicing, rather I looked to other 

alternative techniques in my desperate attempts to help her. Perhaps sticking with the 

exposure tasks but also exploring the difficulties we were experiencing within our 

therapeutic relationship may have been more reparative. 

In the situation of my client Jane, in one particular session Jane was bubbling with 

anxiety and panic about her ability to manage her emotions and feelings of jealousy 

and mistrust with her husband. After this session I left feeling very anxious about my 

own relationship. The feelings of panic and anxiety bubbling inside myself were very 
intense and it was very clear that this was part of my own countertransference 

reaction. Ilis was imperative for me to reflect upon and work through within 

supervision and my own therapy, so that I was able to see the aspects of myself that 
identify with my client, but also to ensure I did not project any of these anxieties back 

onto Jane. 

In the therapy with Jane I used the CBT to help her address her dysfunctional 

cognitions and behaviours, and the psychodynamic use of the therapeutic relationship 
to create the reparative re-parenting experience, using the transference- 

countertransference interactions to create a stronger therapeutic relationship and work 
through the relationship difficulties of the past. Through this Jane was able to manage 
her emotions better from a cognitive perspective, but also address the deep root of the 

problem from her childhood experiences, which left her fragile and insecure. In this 

way hopefully in the future Jane will continue to be able to adopt a position in her 

relationship with her husband where she will be able to distinguish between her own 
dysfunctional cognitions and interpretations which did not reflect reality and also 

what parts of the past she is bringing to the relationship and projecting onto her 
husband. 

Other aspects of the Psychodynamic approach that I am mindful of within my practice 

are the use of 'abstinence'. This has been very useful for me within my own therapy 
(which is psychodynamic) and has given me the space to explore myself without my 
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therapist intruding on my space and sharing much of herself. It has also been at times 

very uncomfortable and anxiety provoking, which I am aware, is also important to 

process and work through. Interestingly Bateman & Fonagy (2004) suggest that now 

practitioners are moving away from neutrality and transference interpretations and are 

becoming more collaborative, standing closer to CBT, with the aim of helping clients 

expand ability to create a meaningful narrative from disorganised experience. 

In addition to my own personal psychodynamic therapy informing my practice, I have 

benefited greatly from having a CBT supervisor in my first two years of training, I 

feel I have had a good opportunity to develop my competencies and confidence in 

practicing CBT. As a developing practitioner, for my final year of training I have 

sought out a CBT supervisor and a Psychodynamic supervisor for my two third-year 

placements. This will allow me to continue to develop my understanding and skills of 
different practices and continue to enhance my integrative position. 

In conclusion, the practical, simplistic and effective focus of CBT sits well with me as 

a Counselling Psychologist. Through my university learning, client experience and 

supervision input, I have developed a more integrative stance whereby I am mindful 

of aspects of the psychodynamic approach when using CBT in order to enhance the 

therapeutic process. There is no one size fits all approach, Psychodynamic therapy 

would be inappropriate for various presentations, such as alcohol or drug abuse and 
CBT has been found unsuccessful for presentations like Borderline Personality 
Disorder (Bateman & Fonagy, 2004). Therefore as a developing practitioner I need to 

continue learning and have an open mind to new methodologies in order to enhance 
my ability and flexibility to judge and apply the most suitable approach for each 
individual client. 
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SECTION C- Theoretical essa-v (PYPO48C) 

With reference-to two theoretical models. comiDare and contrast process and 

content interventions in working with a Proup. Use clinical examules to illustrate 

the theory. 

A group is made up of individuals who are connected either physically, being in the 

same place at the same time, or in their minds, sharing a common aim, purpose or 

function (Barnes, Ernst and Keith, 1999). 

This essay will compare and contrast the Psychodynamic and the Cognitive 

Behavioural models of group therapy. I will present the theory underpinning each 

model and analyse their individual therapeutic approaches, followed by an exploration 

of how each model applies to group processes and to depression and social phobia. In 

this way I aim to shed light on the similarities and differences between the approaches 

with a specific focus on the process and content of the interventions. 

Psychodynamic GrouR TheraRy (PDGT) 

Freud, (1917) proposed that unconscious psychological forces influence thoughts, 

feelings and behaviours. Freud sought to bring unconscious activity of the psyche to 

consciousness. These internal aspects of the psyche evolve during early child 
development, and therefore comprise aspects of the child's relationship with parents 
(Jacobs, 2004). The child's early environment is a crucial force in the development of 

personality strengths and vulnerabilities (Jacobs, 2004). Therefore the 

psychodynamic understanding of adult stress and vulnerability link with problems in 

their early relationship models. 

Foulkes, (1948) extended the psychodynamic concepts and therapeutic techniques of 
individual psychoanalysis to the group, providing group analysis with theoretical 
justification and treatment methodology. He suggested that the unconscious, defence 

mechanisms, repression, transference and counter-transference, projection and 

projective identification apply within the context of the analytic group. 
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Foulkes, (1948) proposed that individuals in the group react and interact as a whole 

network, each member influencing the other. He conceptualised this network as a 

matrix, the group becomes a transpersonal network, whereby it reacts and responds as 

a whole, the verbal and non-verbal communication is the basis of intraphysic and 
interpersonal relationships. 

The group circle, which includes participants and the therapist, encompasses both 

physical and psychological space, bound by members sharing the same space (Pines, 

1981). This process of sharing space creates the group atmosphere that Winnicott, 

(1965) explains facilitates transference experiences and the resultant perceptions and 

responses from the group members. Within the group, the members 'transfer' 

unacceptable repressed elements of the past onto other group members. In turn these 

experiences are modified, revised and used as new experiences of the self in relation 

to others. Foulkes, (1948) suggests that neurosis is a by-product of being 'at odds with 

our group' we were bom into, the family. The process of group therapy proceeds by 

translation of neurotic phenomena into shared communication through verbal 

exchanges. 

The group analyst is named the 'conductor' who remains in the background rarely 
exercising his therapeutic authority, providing space for the group to take its own 
course (Foulkes, 1948). On occasion when the group becomes stuck the conductor 
may 'nudge' the group along, although the group usually is able to negotiate through 
the blockage (Foulkes, 1948). The conductor retains a passive detached stance and 
remains neutral in his own views, though makes interpretations of the members' 
experiences. The conductor begins by making observations, without being concerned 
by theory (Balint, Courtenay, Elder, Hull, Julian, 1993). The observations made rely 

on two observational traditions mother-baby and participant observation (Barnes, 

Ernes & Hyde, 1999). The conductor analyses the interactions between group 

members, helping members become aware of their unconscious needs, motivations 

and concerns. Through analysis of members experience of authority (group members 

relationship with the therapist) and members experiences of affection (group members 

relationships with others group members) the therapist can use these rich sources of 
information to help members understand their relationships and themselves. 

229 



Co2nitive Behavioural Group Theory (CBGT 

Similar to individual CBT, CBGT focuses on the interaction of thoughts, feelings and 
behaviours (Beck, 1976). CBGT is fundamentally a phenomenological approach 
(Mahoney, 1991), following the momentary experience of each individual. How do 

the phenomena of an experience register with each individual? The focus is on the 

present moment, the past and future is valuable, though it is explored through the 

present. For example, a therapist would ask a client 'when you just had that memory 

of the past, what thoughts does that trigger for you nowT CBGT relies on the belief 

that individuals are able to become aware, reflect and alter their cognitive and 
behavioural processes, it intends to directly target symptoms, reduce stress, and 

restructure cognitive behavioural responses in order to alleviate symptoms (White & 
Freeman, 2000). 

CBGT educates clients about their cognitive processes-, core beliefs, conditional 

assumptions and automatic thoughts (Beck, 1995). Developmental processes and 

other life events shape core beliefs; these are the way the individuals view themselves 

concerning their lovability and competence. The subsequent conditional beliefs are 'if 

then' statements, which infer cause and effect. These become the rules for living and 

are learned and accumulated throughout life. The automatic thoughts are the 
immediate cognitive responses to various triggers. 

The group process aims to help the individual test out their dysfunctional beliefs and 
directs them towards cognitive restructuring (Meichenbaum, 1974), providing the 
individual with a variety of alternatives or modified beliefs. CBGT also helps to 
reduce the influence of dysfunctional cognitions on behaviours and facilitates 
behavioural modification or change. A variety of CBT tools are used to achieve these 
goals: automatic thought records; arousal hierarchies; activity monitoring; problem 
solving; relaxation methods; behavioural experiments; risk assessments; and relapse 
prevention methods (Williams & Garland, 2002). 

The group setting provides a safe space for members to explore, challenge and test the 
validity of their cognitions. It also facilitates a supportive environment for 
behavioural responses to be identified and modified (Clark, 1989). The process of 
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sharing thoughts within the group can result in a very lively group exchange (White & 

Freeman, 2000). One of the strengths of CBGT is that is creates a collaborative 

relationship between the therapist and group members (Beck, 1995; White, 2000). 

The emphasis placed on agenda setting (Wright, Thase, Beck, & Ludgate, 1993), 

feedback (Beck, 1995) and goal setting (Beck et al, 1990) are crucial aspects of the 

collaborative relationships within the group (White & Freeman, 2000). 

The therapist uses an inductive method known as 'socratic questioning' to help 

members determine their own assumptions and beliefs. Following the downward 

arrow technique members learn to identify their core beliefs and explore their 

underlying assumptions (Beck, 1995). The aim is for members to learn to become 

their own therapists, whereby they continue the process of self-questioning, 
identifying and challenging and modifying thoughts, feelings and behaviours once 
therapy is complete (Young, 1990). The therapist provides psycho-education 

presenting rationales, skills and techniques. They also guide members through in 

session practice and setting homework tasks, rehearsal of new skills provides 

members with a sense of mastery (White & Freeman, 2000). 

CoLynitive Behavioural Therapy Groups vs PSychodynamic Therapy Groups 

Group process consists of all the elements basic to the unfolding of a group from the 

onset to its termination: group dynamics; levels of cohesion; trust generated; 
resistance manifestation; conflict emergence; healing forces; inter-member reactions; 
stages of the group and the unspoken messages of how members relate to each other 
(Corey, Corey & Corey, 2010). Yalom, (1995) identified key therapeutic principles 
derived from self reports from individuals in group therapy: the instillation of hope; 

universality; imparting information; altruism; corrective recapitulation of the primary 
family group; development of socialisation techniques; imitative behaviour; 

interpersonal learning; group cohesiveness; catharsis and existential factors. These 
'processes' exist and determine success independent of the therapeutic content 
adopted (Grohol, 2009). 
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Planning 

Corey, (2008) suggests, "if you want a group to be successful, you need to devote 

considerable time to planning". Pre-group planning considers: size; group structure; 

session length; location; frequency; time span; membership criteria and screening 

protocol. Both approaches value the importance of the group planning however they 

differ in their group choices due to their distinct theoretical perspectives. 

Timing 

An example of how the groups vary in planning can be seen in their differing 

approaches to time span. PDGT generally opposes the idea of time limited therapy, 

arguing that the time limit cannot be predetermined due to the nature of analysis. 

Addressing the unconscious cannot be restricted by time and rather utilises a long 

term model spanning from six months up to two years (Behr & Hearst, 2005). The 

PDG runs as a slow-open group, where members join and leave in their own time, or 

as a closed group where all members start and end at the same time (Behr & Hearst, 

2005). Whilst the open group is useful within specific settings, such as a drop in 

service and it models life groups most closely (Behr & Hearst, 2005) it does not 

provide the opportunity to achieve a sense of safety, trust, and containment and ensure 

group cohesion between members occurs. 

The longer time frame utilised by PDG's pose challenges for services that have 

financial restrictions, or long waiting lists, favouring CBGT. CBGT lends itself well 

to a short-term model of between six to twelve sessions (Hazlett-Stevens, Craske, 

2002). This provides time for the often highly structured approach to be taught and 

cognitive and behavioural patterns to be identified challenged and modified. 
Moreover only half the work occurs within the session; the rest occurs in between- 

session homework (Cook, 2006). 

Content v Process 

Symptom relief is the goal of both groups however the theoretical basis and 
methodological interventions are strikingly distinct. CBGT has a specific content 
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focus on problem resolution (White & Freeman, 2000) utilising tangible skills to 

achieve this goal. For example, the therapist in a depression group would focus on 

common negative themes from members thought records, identifying common 

triggers for their depressive reactions and set goals to initiate activity between 

members, this in turn enhances group cohesiveness (White & Freeman, 2000). 

The PDG achieves problem resolution through interpersonal group processes. The 

therapist by and large does not 'lead' the group in the same way as the CBG therapist, 

this creates a degree of anxiety within the group until they establish unspoken rules. 
The neutral stance of the therapist allows unconscious dynamics to play out between 

members and resolution or change is acquired through new understandings within 
transference and countertransference material (Montgomery, 2002). The 

psychodynamic process oriented therapist would focus on the interpersonal conflict 
between group members in order to enhance cohesiveness (Behr & Hearst, 2005). 

A strong therapeutic alliance is the most significant predictor of symptom relief in 

psychotherapy (Clemence, Hilsenroth, Ackerman, Strassle, Handler, 2005). Perhaps 

the CBG therapist can create a strong alliance with members as there is a clear 
structure and active involvement between the group members and the therapist, 
however in a psychodynamic group, the conductor remains outside the group, 
refraining from engaging with individual members (Bion, 1961). Therefore it is 

questionable whether the PDG can achieve this strong alliance necessary for 

successful outcomes. 

Absences 

In a PDG an absence would entail a dynamic interpretation (Behr & Hearst, 2005). 

The conductor would encourage the group to talk about the absent person and their 
feelings of concern, anger or indifference and this material would be used for analytic 
interpretations. For example, a vacant chair may create unease for a member of the 

group. This member speaking up, questioning where the member is and enquiring 

about the absence would be encouraged to reflect on this anxiety. The member might 
then be able to reflect why this absence evokes childhood memories of being left out, 
feelings induced by the empty chair. In this way his/her unconscious emotional needs 
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would be expressed through the circle of the chairs. In a CBG if a member misses a 

session without prior notice, the therapist would generally open it up to the group for 

a brief discussion, answering questions or hearing members concerns (White, 2000). 

EndiU, s- 

The PDG and CBG end distinctly. Psychodynamic analysis continues right until the 

end of the final session. The conductor is continually on the 'lookout' for avoidance 

of sadness, anger, and pain concerning the ending process, Each individual member 

has his or her own model of ending, loss and separation. The conductor moves to the 

group as a whole for interpretations to initiate reflections about their experiences in 

the group. Members predisposed to defences against abandonment will be picked up 

on and analysed by the conductor in hope to help the individual gain mastery over and 
deal with the ending process (Behr & Hearst, 2005). 

The ending of a CBG focuses on members reviewing, strengthening and joining their 
learning and skills gained from the group. Members assess how they have met their 

goals and expectations set at the beginning of the group. The hope is that the process 

of cohesiveness experienced in the group can be transferred and developed into other 

areas of fife. For some individuals the lift of depression might reveal co morbid 

problems such as anxiety related problems (Clark, 1989). The therapist therefore 
facilitates alternative therapeutic opportunities to help the process of recovery. 
Successful experiences of joining a CBG for depression may leave the client with a 

greater sense of hope than when they entered; they would generally need to continue 
to practice the CBT skills to ensure the benefits are maintained and relapse prevention 

occurs (White, 2000). 

lkRmraign 

Behr and Hearst, (2005) present an example of PDGT for depression. The conductor 
first attempts to refrarne the depression in an interpersonal context, for example, by 
looking at the effect it has on others, allowing it to become a dynamic process, in this 
way repressed emotions are slowly drawn out by the group by helping the member 
recognise their feelings and redirecting them, this necessitates holding and 
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containment from the group. By members sharing their own experience of rage and 

guilt, they help to develop a sense of managing opposing emotions towards a parent 

e. g. that of anger and feeling compassionate, 'they did their best, they suffered too'. 
The role of the conductor is to drive the group in the direction of a reconstruction of 
the past, enabling the member to retrieve both good and bad memories. The 

unconscious material gets stimulated and amplified through associations. In their 

example of this process they describe a women complaining of experiencing 
persistent pain which might evoke anger and frustration in another group member. 
This in turn might enable the other member to come into contact with his own 
childhood rage and his adulthood destructive rage. The women may then be able to 

access her own anger and rage translating her somatic pain, into meaning. This 
dynamic within the group may provide a more effective way of bringing unconscious 
conflicts to the surface than any interpretation may have evoked. 

The greatest criticism of PDGT is that it is unscientific in its analysis of human 
behaviour. It is difficult to scientifically test concepts such as transference or the 
unconscious mind, and therefore no conclusions can be drawn clarifying the role of 
psychological processes and their impact on symptom reduction. 

White, (2000) suggests an alternative stance towards depression, CBGT understands 
depressive symptoms as a consequence of negative beliefs and self-critical thoughts 
perhaps in relation to early experiences or specific events. This model focuses on 
cognitive restructuring and behavioural activation to achieve symptom reduction. The 
therapist works towards helping members identify and process thoughts and feelings 

experienced during depressive episodes. One task of the therapist may be to help 

group members distinguish between functional and dysfunctional feelings, e. g. if 

anger were a common feeling the therapist would encourage the group to differentiate 
between functional (standing ones ground for ones values) and dysfunctional forms of 
anger (violence). As this emerges, the group might begin to experience guilt or 
anxiety. This would then be explored and challenged by using cognitive restructuring 

and relaxation training. 

CBGT has generally become the more attractive, efficient therapeutic model, it is 

relatively straightforward to learn, deliver and produces positive findings across many 
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disorders in contrast to PDGT, which has fewer outcome studies and is perhaps 

becoming outdated. Whilst CBGT works well in clinical laboratory trials its findings 

are less secure in the real life clinical settings, and has been criticised as a successful 

marketing strategy rather than an intrinsically superior therapeutic model to PDGT 

(Leichsenring, Salzer, Jaeger, Kdchele, Kreische, Leweke, Rfiger, Winkelbach, 

Leibing, 2010). 

In a comparison of CBGT and PDGT amongst elderly patients with depression 

positive outcomes were found across both approaches depression (Steuer, Mintz, 

Hammen, Hill. Jarvik, McCarley, Motoike, Rosen, 1984). This indicates that perhaps 

group processes are more significant in symptom reduction over and above the group 
approach selected. However in this comparison no placebo control was used due to 

ethical restrictions working with elderly, therefore limiting the reliability and 
generalisability of the findings. 

Social Phobia 

Another example of these distinct approaches can be seen looking at a model of 
therapy for social phobia. 

Juster and Heimberg, (1994) successfully integrated cognitive and exposure therapy 
interventions for a social phobia group. Sessions one and two focussed on the CBGT 

model of social phobia and its rationale, introducing the concept of automatic 
thoughts, thought diaries and common thinking errors. Sessions three to eleven 
focussed on cognitive restructuring, where clients confronted feared situations by 

utilising in session exposure, progressing through their feared hierarchy. This 

provided a means to access negative automatic thoughts regarding the feared 
situation, thinking errors were labelled, disputed and alternative responses generated 
with the support of the group. 11roughout the exposure anxiety levels were monitored 
and rated for subsequent cognitive restructuring. I'llis process lasted for roughly ten 
minutes, until there was a reduction in reported anxiety levels. Homework exposure 
tasks and cognitive restructuring tasks were identified individually to meet each 
client's needs. Session twelve provided the opportunity to conduct exposure and 
cognitive restructuring followed by a review of members' progress over treatment and 
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identification of challenging situations that may require continued work. 

The CBGT model contrasts the PDOT model, Zippin, Flavio, Eduardo, Eizirki, 

(2004) studied the efficacy of a short-term group utilising psychodynamic principles 

for individuals with generalised social phobia. Sessions one-three focussed on the 

formulation through looking into each member's history. Sessions four to ten 

addressed the relationship between their symptoms and conflicts within their 

relationships, analysing specific situations and finding common conflict themes 

between group members. This was achieved through the therapist encouraging 

discussion and exploration of member's conflict experiences. The final sessions 

eleven to twelve identified the separation anxiety members experienced from their 

own childhood/past experiences. The therapist was active in obtaining data from 

members individually and as a group, shedding fight on formulations through 

questioning members and transference interpretations, bringing to consciousness the 

conflicts behind phobic situations. Throughout the therapist attempted to link 

common aspects between members in an attempt to enhance cohesiveness. 

The outcome measures displayed in both groups indicate reduced social phobia and 

social avoidance. When the PDG was compared to a control group, the PDG was 
superior in treating social phobia. However the PDG seemed to face their conflicts 
more directly than the control group who did not have an opportunity to share their 
feelings and symptoms openly, therefore this may have led to the supposed success of 
PDGT. The CBGT displayed favourable outcomes when compared with placebo- 
therapy groups (Heimberg et al., 1990). However, no comparisons can be drawn 

between the PDGT and CBGT until comparison studies, controlling for the same 

variable are conducted. 

Conclusion 

In conclusion, the PDOT and the CBGT approaches appear to offer contrasting modes 

of treatment owing to the distinct theoretical and philosophical frameworks. The 
PDG therapist utilises process-oriented interventions exploring the unconscious, 
insight, transference, and resistance, contrasting the CBG therapist whom adopts a 
more content oriented approach, focussing on identifying and modifying cognitive 
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and behavioural. patterns. Despite these divergences the groups seem to take on a life 

of their own, and both models have shown to produce positive outcomes (Grohol, 

2009). "Psychotherapy research and practice must move beyond "brand names" of 

different therapies to an emphasis on common factors, active ingredients, specific 

skills, and psychotherapy integration" (Holmes, 2002). 
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SECTION D- Process reDort (PYPO47C 

Introduction 

I have selected my client Jason who presented with depression, anger management 

difficulties and a history of childhood abuse. I feel that this therapeutic encounter 

reflects my competencies as a Counselling Psychologist and the presence of 
Counselling Psychology's philosophical and theoretical foundations underpinning my 

work with both Jason and the multidisciplinary team. I aim demonstrate my ability to 

conduct assessments and provide individualised interventions based on an 

understanding of the relevant theoretical approaches whilst being mindful of issues of 

policy, legislation, culture and life span. I will also critically reflect on the therapeutic 

areas that I could improve on highlighting the interpersonal and contextual issues 

associated with this client. 

I work in a primary care GP service, involving numerous responsibilities: leasing with 
G. P. 's; managing a large client load, adniin, and working within a maximum time 
frame of six sessions, creating a fast paced enjoyable atmosphere, which inevitably 

influences my therapeutic practice (elaborated on in the transcript section). 

The theoretical model adopted was Cognitive Behavioural Therapy (CBT), an 
integration of cognitive therapy (Beck, 1976) and behaviour therapy (Bandura, 1977). 
CBT has become the most commonly used intervention for anger management and 
has presented as an effective therapy for reduction in anger management (Beck and 
Fernandez, 1998). 

The referral came from the clients G. P. briefly stating the client was experiencing 
depressive symptoms and needed help targeting his negative thought patterns and 

resultant behaviours. 

Assessment 

Jason a thirty-year-old white male presented on time and engaged. He appeared well 
dressed, articulate and spoke with a harsh tone. Jason explained that he abused drugs 
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for fifteen years and had been clean for nine years. His wife of eight years had also 

been clean for thirteen years. They had recently completed forty sessions of couple 

therapy due to their relationship problems as they had "difficult childhoods and 

therefore brought a lot of baggage to the relationship". They had two children, a girl 

aged three and a boy aged six. 

Jason described his father as a "secretive, critical, violent man" and his mother as "an 

addictive women, be it alcohol, gambling or sleeping pills, she was emotionally 

unavailable and unloving ... I craved her love". Jason explained that his parents were 

unsuited, his mother had extramarital affairs and his father was violent and abusive 

towards his mother. Jason's parents sent him to boarding school between age eight to 

seventeen, rarely returning home and when he did he was met by his fathers violence 

and his mothers neglect. When he left school he "went off the rails and got heavily 

involved with drugs". His parents divorced when he was sixteen and he reported 
feeling deep anger towards them for being "poor parenting role models". 

Jason had "volatile and destructive" relationships with both parents at the time of 

therapy. He explained that his parents were interfering and manipulative and their 

involvement in his life was bitter sweet "I want to be close to them, but they always 
let me down". 

Jason was made redundant in 2008, which he reported was the onset of his 

depression, he took "a menial job in WHSMITH" which led him to have suicidal 
thoughts as he felt he had "lost his self worth". In 2009 he came to see his G. P. for a 
counselling referral. Jason refused any medication due to his past addiction. At the 

time of therapy Jason was no longer having suicidal thoughts, he attributed this lift in 

mood to his new job as a children's football coach. 

Jason's goals for therapy were to address his anger problems, understand their 
historical development, stop criticising and shouting at his kids and control his 

negative thoughts and behaviours. He explained that his aggressive communication 
was creating problems in his family life, harming his children and wife's confidence, 
he feared repeating his parent's mistakes. 
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Jason presented as psychologically minded and insightful. He expressed that he had 

been emotionally void for so long due to his drug abuse and now was making up for 

it. I was struck by his strength and ability to reflect upon his experiences considering 

his past avoidance. After the session I felt impressed with Jason and proud of his 

achievements, perhaps I was taking on a parenting role compensating for something 

that his parents did not provide him with (Young, 1999). 

Formulation 

I utilised Beck (1995)'s Cognitive Conceptualisation Diagram as I felt his difficulties 
fit well into this formulation. Jason's early experiences (predisposing factors) of 
rejecting, unavailable, emotionally and physically abusive parents left him with core 
beliefs of being "unlovable, worthless and a failure". 

Jason developed conditional assumptions based on these beliefs 'if I am not rich I am 
worthless', 'if my children do not achieve at school i am a failure', 'if people know I 
live in a council estate they will reject me', 'if I do not shout I will not be in control', 
'if I am not in control I am worthless', 'if any family member of mine exposes 
weakness this will reflect my weakness'. 

As a result of these assumptions Jason formed compensatory strategies (perpetuating 
factors) to assist him in managing to avoid his core beliefs. Jason criticises and 
belittles his children, he shouts, using a loud, harsh and aggressive voice. He does not 
let school parents drop his children at home so they do not know he lives in a council 
estate. He sends his children to extra classes and puts pressure on them to succeed at 
homework tasks. In the short-term Jason's harsh parenting strategies help him avoid 
feeling like a failure, he feels active in his children's education and feels in control of 
relieving his anger. However in the long term he never disconfirms his beliefs about 
being a failure without money, or being valued based on who he is rather than his 
belongings. He does not team that he is able to manage his anxiety or stress without 
getting angry, rather his anger outbursts simply reaffirm his feelings of low self 
worth, being a failure and loss of control. Jason"s recent Job loss and relationship 
problems have acted as precipitating factors, bringing to surface his core beliefs about 
being a failure and subsequent feelings of anger and depression. 
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An example of this dynamic in action: Jason walks into the messy playroom where 

his wife and kids are talking. His automatic thought is "this place is a mess, no one is 

behaving, I must gain control". This activates his core beliefs about being "a failure" 

as he cannot control the mess. Following this he shouts and criticises his wife and 

children, they start clearing up, stop playing and begin to cry. Jason is left feeling 

guilty and a failure as he has upset everyone, thus reinforcing his core beliefs. 

Interventio 

Jason presented with numerous difficulties in his assessment relating to: his childhood 

experiences; low self esteem; parenting difficulties; financial/work related stressors; 

relationship problems and depressive episodes. I was aware of my desire to address 

each difficulty methodically but considered the time limitations and the need to focus 

on what my client's goal was (anger management) and the risk this posed to his 

children. I adopted a treatment model based on anger management, remaining mindful 

of the system as a whole considering the family system and how the difficulties arise 

within his relationships, interactions and language used within his family. This 

awareness encouraged me to be creative and flexible applying skills that could be 

utilised when interacting with his children, his wife and his parents. 

As Jason took personal responsibility for his anger and desired change the 
interventions planned were action/change-oriented (Deffenbacher, 1999). My 

intervention plan was based upon Deffenbacher, (1999) CBT interventions to address 
different elements of problematic anger. 

Session one, the assessment session, reviewed Jason's presenting problems and goals. 
I introduced the CBT model and we explored the role of anger appraisals in activating 
cognitive, emotional, physiological, and behavioral responses. I introduced a 
Dysfunctional Thought Record (DTR) (Padesky, 1995), at the end of session for 
homework to review the following week. 

Session two began with a review of the DTR, and then an in session mindfulness 
breathing relaxation training. This is empirically validated for reducing anger, 
anxiety, stress, and psycho-physiological reactions, reducing initial resistance to 
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cognitive interventions (Deffenbacher & Lynch, 1998). Following this I introduced 

Jason to unhelpful thinking habits and we explored which ones he utilised. 
Homework: DTR, read anger management self help guide. 

Session three focussed on communication skills training and role-playing alternate 

strategies. Jason identified the goal of helping his son with homework without 

shouting or criticising him. 

This skill has also been linked to changing the client's appraisals of their ability to 

cope and reduce dysfunctional ways of responding to inevitable interpersonal conflict 
(Deffenbacher & Lynch, 1998). 

At this point in session three we were exploring an incident where Jason got angry 

whilst helping his son with homework. 

Transcript 

Minutes 34: 40 - 45 

TI: Okay so in that moment what do you usually say to him? 
Cl: come on Samuel, alright? you can, you can do this, this is easy 
T2: ok 
C2: Dunno weather that's bad or not, pah, oka 

Here I am drawing out Jason's usual behavioural response to his negative thought 

about his son's homework. I was aware of Jason's sense offailing as a parent (pah). 
At this point I felt inclined to reassure him, but held back so as not to confirm or 
disconfirm right or wrong. I wanted him to see that unaided he could recognise 

positive and negative parenting strategies. 

T3: okay so yyouve have had the thought, he cannot spell, this is easy 
C3: okay 
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I focussed back on the thought so we wouldn't get sidetracked as we only had six- 

sessions, perhaps it would have been more beneficial to offer process direction 

(Rennie, 2000), asking how he felt in the present moment. 

T4: How could you convey that in a gentler, kinder way, that would achieve the same 

outcome of him trying again? 
C4: well I could ask him weather he thinks that's spelt correctly, maybe 

T5: okay 

I wanted to empower Jason and give him the opportunity to come up with an 

alternative strategy. At that moment I recall feeling protective over his child and 
fearful of his critical communication, i therefore took a more direct approach in 

exploring behaviour change. I was aware that my agenda was both for my client and 
for his child, bearing in mind my legal obligations to ensure child protection (The 

Children Act, 1989). This may have aligned me with all the critical people in his life, 

which was important to reflect upon. Perhaps asking "would there be an alternative 

way you could communicate that? " could have achieved the same response without 
implying that he was not gentle and kind. 

C5- or is is that negative? 
T6: welll it depends how it would come across, how about you would explain to him 
before 

C6: what like set in ground rules 
T7: ground rules for the both of you 
C7: yeh, that's that's you know so simple, 1, when I work I do that, because I work 
with kids and I do that yet with my own kids I don't. 
T8: well that's with everyone we all apply things 
C8: I have a group of twenty kids, and the parents are all hovering around me, and I 
say right before we start these are the rules 
T9: Okay 

C9: and with him I don't do that, kids love that 

Here I was trying to facilitate Jason through the process of setting ground rules, so 
that they could both have a clear agenda and structure for the task (mirroring a skill 
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used in our sessions). This intervention seemed to sit well with Jason as he jumped to 

apply it. However he also became self-critical which I attempted to relieve and 

normalise 'well that's with everyone'. This perhaps came from my own need to 'save' 

him from pain. I could have stopped him at this point and reflected on his critical 

voice. 

TIO: and perhaps rules you can also take, so lets say, lets say the first thing we are 

going to look at is spelling, so he knows that the first thing you are going to look at is 

spelling 
C10: ok 
TI 1: and then perhaps asking him, how could you, one option you said, is that spelt 
right? Okay so lets say, what would the word be? 

In my attempt to offer an example I seemed to have taken too much responsibility 

telling him what to do, I could have asked him what would be useful. This reflects my 
feeling of being pushed for time and desire to fill every moment productively. I 

became aware of this and therefore invited him back to select a word. 

C1 1: okay want, its want, he spells it wont, well he did yesterday, so wwhat I said 
yesterday, I said okay lets gets a scrap of paper out, keep it next to you and if, if we r 
unsure about a spelling, lets give it a go 
T12: mmm that ssounds like an excellent task, excellent 
C12: mm yeh 
T13: I have a feeling that what you implement is superb; it's the way you explain it or 

convey it that is crushing 

I first praised Jason for his effort and his use of a successful intervention. This 

modelling was something I tried to do throughout the therapy, so that Jason could 
learn to praise himself, his children and his wife, a model he deeply lacked in his own 

experiencing of parenting. I reflected my sense of his ability 'superb' prior to 

reinforcing that the communication was 'crushing'. Whilst this is a harsh word, it is a 
word Jason has used before and it seemed important not to shy away from the impact 
his on his child. 
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C13: its communication isn't it 

T 14: and that's what we are going to practice 

C 14: right 
T15: okay so the usual voice? Sounds like what? 

C 15: loud 

T16: Try and 
C16: aggressive 
T17: try and do it for me? 
C17: okay let me think of an example, so it doesn't have to be yesterday does it? 

T 18: no any, I just want to hear, hear it 

My objective was also to help Jason take ownership over his communication strategy 

(Gonzalez-prendes, 2007). 1 therefore attempted to draw out his usual tone to contrast 
it with a more adaptive altemative. 

C 18: you know actually I, II have actually toned it down a lot the last few weeks 
T19: mmm 
C19: because so many people have flagged it up so ive had no choice 
T20: okay 
C20: to face it, okay so let me think of an example .... (15 second pause) yeh maybe its 

actually nothing, you know maybe how I am actually doing it is is okay 
T21: okay but lets try and hear 

There is a strong sense of Jason's resistance to facing his communication style, I felt 

that it was important to encourage Jason to own it within the therapeutic setting. 
Listening back this evoked a strong sense of guilt that I perhaps pushed Jason to 

confront something shameful. He may have felt that I too was judging him, and 
forcing him to change like 'so many people who have flagged it up'. I could have 

explored how he was feeling and reflected that I sensed this intervention was 
uncomfortable for him. 

C21: you know, um ... okay so his writ, not his actual physical writing because that's 
really good, but his writing, but the sentence structure because I know that they are 
working at that, is babyish 
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T22: okay 

C22: so I think I said to him yesterday, 'Samuel this is um baby language', like that 

um 

T23: okay, so baby language, so your face kind of crinkles 

C23: yeh wiwiwiwith the emphasis intentionally on 

T24: baby 

C24: yeh baby, because I know kids don't like being called baby 

T25: mm, so actually taking a real dig at him 

C25: ye 

Ifeel my language 'a real dig at him' was too direct and harsh. Perhaps my desire to 

protect his son was a transference reaction, mirroring Jason's own desire to save his 

son from his criticism. My protective instinct was elicited, coming from my own 

childhood experiences of parental criticism (countertransference). 

T26: okay, so you've seen that the spelling is wrong and its baby language, how can 
you stop yourself in that moment and convey something better, what could you say 
differently? 

C26- Samuel, why don't we think about the sentences, why don't we think a bit more 
about the sentences, tell me the sentences before you write it, possibly 
T27: okay 

I utilise Socratic methods (PadeskY, 1993) to help him come up with alternatives, 
questioning him in a way that he could model and apply to his son, reflected in his 

response. 

C27: but you know, I also, I al, I am forever saying you know I cant do all your 
homework for you 
T28: it does sound like in a way you feel very responsible to make sure he achieves 
C28: ye I know and 1, that's right and III know for a fact that my dad didn't, I reckon 
that my dad did a lot of homework for me 
T29: mmm and there are many children who's parents don't sit down and spoon feed 
homework to them, and they survive, they develop the ability 

251 



At this point I recall feeling unsure whether Jason was able to break the pattern of 

criticism and belittling that had been deeply engrained into him by his father. I felt 

sympathetic towards Jason, feeling great pressure for his child to achieve, perhaps to 

cover up his own beliefs about being a failure, but also inclined to help distance him 

from the need to push his child, in order to protect his son. I therefore attempted to 

normalise the experience of parents who leave their children to develop skills, 

something I had experiencedfirom my own parents. 

C29: so maybe that, maybe that could be the way the way forward, but then do I 

physically sit with him, but, but not have any input 

T30: I think something about questioning 
C30: I mean that's difficult 

T31: very difficult, but giving him the opportunity, and changing the tone. Do you 
hear the difference in my tone? Samuel hohowws this sentence, is there anything else 

you could do with this sentence, or Samuel is there anything else you could do with 

this sentence? 

I tried to mirror the different tones, and help him see how different the loud versus 

soft tone sound. I feel that this was a creative intervention, which felt natural within 

the session though I feel uncomfortable listening back to, as it seems too direct, 

perhaps I could have introduced what I was going to do first. As we had a strong 
therapeutic raptor, this felt natural and Jason's next response seemed to confirm this 

strategy was useful. 

C3 1: yeh, yeh, yeh, because often when I do flag it up he realises 
T32: so you have got a very intelligent child who actually can respond 

I reinforced his success when he provides space for his child to correct his mistake, 
challenging Jason's beliefs previously expressed 'if I wont help him, he willfail'. 

C32: he actually thinks and goes yeh yeh actually 
T33: okay so practice to me the gentler voice that you could use 
C33: Samuel that sentence that you have just written, do you think that you could 
write that using different kind of language 
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T34: okay 
C34: longer words and different kind of language, and nine times out of ten he will 

turn round and say ye 

At this point I wanted to make sure Jason was following the intervention, and was 

able to apply it. He seemed to do a really good job at this. However my intervention 

seems quite demanding, instead of telling him to 'practice for me', I could have been 

less authoritative and more collaborative, 'would it be useful to practice different 

voices? ' (Gilbert and Leahy, 2007). 

T35: okay, so something else I think would be really beneficial is at the beginning of 

that sentence to sandwich it, there's something called sandwiching something you say, 

at the beginning of the sentence saying something positive and at the end saying 

something positive and then getting your point in the middle 
C35: oh right in other words something like, what you have just written is, is fine, um 
the ideas in it are great, just try try and make it longer, using maybe s1slightly 
different words, I mean something is that the kind of thing that you are driving at? 
T36: and something at the end? the sandwich, imagine the bun 

C36: and then, just try your best, something like that? is that is that the sort of thing? 
T36: beautiful 

Jason had successfully incorporated the use of a softer tone and managed to find a 
way he could question his son rather than criticise. Following this I introduced Jason 

to the 'sandwiching technique. Ifelt that this would be a useful strategy for Jason to 
incorporate into his life in general, starting with his children, helping him compliment 
his kids more and providing him a structure he could use to critique them without 

crushing their confidence. 

C36: pah, yeh 
T37: hard work 
C37: its so easy right 
T38: its not easy 
C38: easy to say it, difficult to actually execute, right, you know 
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T39: but once you start, once you start prac, for so long you've practiced the louder 

voice, but actually it could be quite empowering when you do talk with that gentler 

voice, just think in your head, even what would my voice sound like, what tone? what 

level? Because you definitely are hearing what im saying and im not harsh with you, I 

don't shout at you and I don't, and there is a great interaction that we have here, from 

my end, the way you speak to me, the way I speak to you therefore your able to do it, 

because you still talk about anxiety provoking things in here, so to try and mirror and 

remember that gentle soothing voice, and to try start using it a bit more, and the other 

important thing is the sandwiching, so this week to try and experiment with the 

sandwiching, when you want to say something to your child about homework tasks or 

about something your not satisfied with, 

At this point I was concerned that Jason was being self-critical and his posture 

slumped as if he was deflated, he had spoken in the past about his fear of being an 

awful father and ruining his children. I wanted to empower him at this point to 
increase his sense of competence, necessary for clients with a failure schema (Young, 

1999). 1 had a strong sense of hope for Jason and his ability to change. I reflected on 

my own experience of him within the therapy, as I felt that he had displayed self- 

control, tolerance of anxiety and management of intense emotions. However I think I 

went on, there is a sense that im rushing and trying to tell him too much at once. This 

is perhaps a result of my own need to help him and the constraints I felt due to the 

short time frame. Perhaps I could have slowed down and asked Jason to reflect more 
on how hefelt in the moment and the usefulness of these interventions? 

C39: sandwiching, right, so start of with a with a positive affirmation, first slice right? 
T40: first slice 
C40: the filling is the, the idea of how to improve and the final layer is try you know 

try your best at it (sigh) 
T41: mhu, try your best, your doing great, something that can give him, and there is 

something also about, sometimes you might have something negative to say, and that 
does not mean you are a bad parent, but sandwiching it, will mean that you can, you 
don't crush him at the same time, in a way 
C41: yeh I have to be careful of that, crushing him, but then there's its that balance 
isn't it, between pushing your kid, I mean I had this idea a few weeks ago, this 
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Chinese women who is a Yale lecturer who's written a book about parenting, its all 

over the press at the moment, it's a hot topic and uh I read excerpts from it in the 

times and a few other papers and um got home at night and I'm like right were doing 

Chinese parenting (laughing), which is just ridiculous, it's a different culture, its its in 

their genetics, that's how they do it, and she described what she did and how it might 

of affected them in later life the kids and all this stuff, so 

T42: is it a gentle way of parenting or? 
C42: no of course not, its salvage, um but they do believe it gets results 

I wondered at this point whether Jason was projecting his own feelings (Tavris, 2000) 

of his parenting onto the Chinese culture 'its in their genetics... '. This seemed to 

remind me of how he spoke of himself and his own fears in previous sessions. 

T43: okay, so there is something, I think also about your own belief (client laughs), 

that you have to, firm is good and too too gentle, kind is going to create failure, when 
actually for you, you had very firm and it created a lot of difficulties for you 
C43- ye ye, but that was, that's just my experience of it, doesn't mean it will go the 

same way with him, right? But you know, maybe, that's a gamble isn't it? 

I picked upon a belief that Jason had identified in a previous session and that fit in at 
this point. I seem to be talking too much, instead of refiecting back and using Socratic 

methods to help him arrive at these conclusions. Asking 'how was your own 
experience of your parents? ' may have been more useful. Jason challenges my 
suggestion, which is a good reflection of his confidence and trust within the 
therapeutic relationship, as a place where he can be open and honest and question his 

own beliefs. 

T44: and perhaps because of because of where you come from, it will always be 

something, the tendency to go to the harsher end, so to try and push yourself to the 

gentler end 
C44: yeh yeh, its against my principles 
T45: but it will always, it will always kind of, the fear that perhaps you might go too 
far and never push them or give your kids structure, boundaries, you know, help them 

255 



progress, push them, I think naturally you will because of what you've you've kind of 

been through 

At this point I was trying to increase Jason's awareness of his own propensity and 

vulnerability to go towards the critical harsh parenting model, as a result of his own 

experiences and his own personality. I think my use of 'harsher end and gentler end' 

was my attempt not to label Jason or be too blunt. Therefore my use of loose language 

created the image of a spectrum that he could move on. 

Final Sessions 

Session four reviewed previous skills and focussed on thought challenging, thought 

stopping and gentle voice training. 

Session five explored the dysfunctional cognitive and cultural components 

of Jason's experience of anger, aiming to identify and alter his anger inducing 

cognitions and schemas, utilising self-instructional training and problem solving skills 

to assist him in changing his angry critical self-dialogues, learning to guide himself 

through events in a calmer, more task focussed manner. 

Session six reviewed CBT skills and relapse prevention followed by an exploration of 
Jason's feelings around ending and providing feedback to empower him in his 

achievements. 

Evaluation 

Jason reported having a deeper understanding of his past and link to his present 
difficulties. He also developed skills for change in his cognitive, emotional, 
physiological and behavioural anger responses, displayed in a reduction in "explosive 

episodes" from daily to once a fortnight, these episodes were now more controlled 
and often when he was not practicing the skills he had leamt. We had a strong 
collaborative relationship, which helped to facilitate his progress and act as a good 
parenting experience to the inner child in Jason (Freud, 1915). Throughout the 
therapy I was mindful of Jason's history of abuse and personality characteristics 
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(Deffenbacher, 1995), for example, to manage his low stress tolerance we 
incorporated brief relaxation techniques before implementing his cognitive- 
behavioural strategies, we also utilised cognitive strategies about his past experiences 

of abuse to help him gain insight into his propensity to parent in a critical way, rather 
than attributing to his own failings. In this way I was able to fit my client to the model 

and not visa versa. I was also careful to flexibly review challenging skills, rather than 

moving on with my session agenda. 

The therapeutic relationship with Jason was paramount (Gonzalez-Prendes, 2007), 
striving throughout to value Jason's subjective experiences, without assuming 
objective 'truths', maintaining empathy, acceptance and congruence (Roger, 1957). 

I thoroughly enjoyed working with Jason, the collaborative fast paced atmosphere 
was exciting and lent well to Jason a bright, quick thinker. However, I may have at 
times been too direct and fast paced which I should have identified and reflected more 
on earlier in this short therapeutic encounter. The supervision input I received 
focussed primarily on child protection issues, however giving some time to the 

process and contextual issues should have been incorporated into the supervision I 

received. The six-session time restriction was also limiting, as Jason needed more 
time to explore the childhood abuse he endured and it's link with his anger, perhaps 
this would increase his long term effectiveness in managing his anger. 
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